

# Oxy Operations Summary

Well:	CERVI #34-1			Spud Date:	
Project:	COLORADO - WELD			Site:	T03N-R63W-S34
Event:	ABANDONMENT			Rig Name:	ENSIGN 122
Start Date:	7/17/25			End Date:	8/1/25
Datum:	KB @ 4750			Well UWI:	0512313237
Report Date	Time From	Time To	Duration (hr)	Operation	
5/21/25	7:00	17:00	10	LOCATION PREP	
6/5/25	7:00	17:00	10	LOCATION PREP	
6/27/25	7:00	18:00	11	LOCATION PREP	
6/30/25	7:00	17:30	10.50	LOCATION PREP	
7/16/25	9:00	18:00	9	LOCATION PREP	
7/17/25	7:00	17:30	10.50	MOB RIG AND EQUIPMENT FROM PROSPECT ROYALTY 1 TO CERVI 34-1. SPOT IN EQUIP. MOVE EQUIP AROUND WITH DOZERS.	
7/17/25	17:30	18:00	0.50	SAFETY MEETING WITH NIGHT CREW.	
7/17/25	18:00	21:00	3	RIG UP, FACE RIG NORTH, FILL TANKS WITH 700 BBL, INPS DERRICK, RAICE DERRICK. NOTE: COMPLICATED LOCATION, TRUCK IN SAND ATTEMPTING TO RIG UP	
7/17/25	21:00	23:30	2.50	NIPPLE UP BOP, TORQUE UP FLANGE BOLTS, RU GAS BUSTER AND FLAIR LINES.	
7/17/25	23:30	0:00	0.50	PRESSURE TEST BOP	
7/18/25	0:00	3:30	3.50	FINISH PSI TESTING BOP, LEAK DOWN TEST ( PASS ) TEST ANACODA LINE ALSO CHOKE HOUSE ANNULAR 250 LOW 1200 HIGH PIPES / BLINDS WITH LARKINN SET IN WELLHEAD.	
7/18/25	3:30	6:50	3.33	PU 7 7/8 BIT, BIT SUB DP, RIH TAG TOC AT 14'. DRILL OUT SOFT CEMENT TO 25'. CONTINUE WASHING NO TAG ON SHOE PLUG AT 425'. DILL DN WITH 0 WOB TO 435. CIR CLEAN.  NOTE: -3 KB CHANGE ONE PUMP	
7/18/25	6:50	7:30	0.67	TOH LD 10 JOINTS. BREAK OFF 7-7/8" BIT AND X-OVER.	
7/18/25	7:30	8:30	1	MU BHA. TIH WITH 6 JOINTS.	

Well:	CERVI #34-1			Spud Date:																																																																																																	
Project:	COLORADO - WELD			Site:	T03N-R63W-S34																																																																																																
Event:	ABANDONMENT			Rig Name:	ENSIGN 122																																																																																																
Start Date:	7/17/25			End Date:	8/1/25																																																																																																
Datum:	KB @ 4750			Well UWI:	0512313237																																																																																																
Report Date	Time From	Time To	Duration (hr)	Operation																																																																																																	
7/18/25	8:30	17:30	9	<p>CONTINUE WASHING DOWN 435'-1900'. RUN SURVEY EVERY 45'. TURN HOLE OVER AT 1000'.</p> <p>F/ DRILL FROM 435'-1900'.</p> <p>W/T 9. 2 VIS 33 AT 1541' ROP 464FT/HR . PUMP RATE 500 GPM TORQUE 0.80FT/LB WOB 0.00 PSI 1127PSI CUTTINGS. SMALL SHALE AND FORMATION. (TAKING SURVEY'S EVERY 45') CHNG TO 100' AT 1500'. PUMP BOTTOMS UP AT 1000'. (HARD SPOTS) 474'-480'. (HARD SPOT) 1283'-1295'.</p> <table border="1"> <thead> <tr> <th>DEPTH</th> <th>INC</th> <th>AZM</th> <th>TVD</th> </tr> </thead> <tbody> <tr><td>413.00</td><td>0.13</td><td>340.79</td><td>413.00</td></tr> <tr><td>458.00</td><td>0.44</td><td>260.10</td><td>458.00</td></tr> <tr><td>503.00</td><td>0.35</td><td>277.86</td><td>503.00</td></tr> <tr><td>547.00</td><td>0.13</td><td>237.60</td><td>547.00</td></tr> <tr><td>592.00</td><td>0.40</td><td>284.89</td><td>592.00</td></tr> <tr><td>637.00</td><td>0.13</td><td>305.89</td><td>637.00</td></tr> <tr><td>682.00</td><td>0.26</td><td>322.77</td><td>682.00</td></tr> <tr><td>727.00</td><td>0.44</td><td>304.49</td><td>727.00</td></tr> <tr><td>771.00</td><td>0.31</td><td>279.35</td><td>770.99</td></tr> <tr><td>816.00</td><td>0.26</td><td>335.95</td><td>815.99</td></tr> <tr><td>861.00</td><td>0.26</td><td>274.43</td><td>860.99</td></tr> <tr><td>905.00</td><td>0.44</td><td>293.68</td><td>904.99</td></tr> <tr><td>950.00</td><td>0.26</td><td>1.27</td><td>949.99</td></tr> <tr><td>995.00</td><td>0.35</td><td>355.11</td><td>994.99</td></tr> <tr><td>1039.00</td><td>0.48</td><td>338.24</td><td>1038.99</td></tr> <tr><td>1084.00</td><td>0.31</td><td>295.96</td><td>1083.99</td></tr> <tr><td>1128.00</td><td>0.31</td><td>357.05</td><td>1127.99</td></tr> <tr><td>1173.00</td><td>0.40</td><td>337.62</td><td>1172.99</td></tr> <tr><td>1217.00</td><td>0.35</td><td>318.46</td><td>1216.99</td></tr> <tr><td>1262.00</td><td>0.44</td><td>312.40</td><td>1261.99</td></tr> <tr><td>1306.00</td><td>0.70</td><td>294.64</td><td>1305.98</td></tr> <tr><td>1351.00</td><td>0.53</td><td>298.16</td><td>1350.98</td></tr> <tr><td>1395.00</td><td>0.79</td><td>310.38</td><td>1394.98</td></tr> </tbody> </table>		DEPTH	INC	AZM	TVD	413.00	0.13	340.79	413.00	458.00	0.44	260.10	458.00	503.00	0.35	277.86	503.00	547.00	0.13	237.60	547.00	592.00	0.40	284.89	592.00	637.00	0.13	305.89	637.00	682.00	0.26	322.77	682.00	727.00	0.44	304.49	727.00	771.00	0.31	279.35	770.99	816.00	0.26	335.95	815.99	861.00	0.26	274.43	860.99	905.00	0.44	293.68	904.99	950.00	0.26	1.27	949.99	995.00	0.35	355.11	994.99	1039.00	0.48	338.24	1038.99	1084.00	0.31	295.96	1083.99	1128.00	0.31	357.05	1127.99	1173.00	0.40	337.62	1172.99	1217.00	0.35	318.46	1216.99	1262.00	0.44	312.40	1261.99	1306.00	0.70	294.64	1305.98	1351.00	0.53	298.16	1350.98	1395.00	0.79	310.38	1394.98
DEPTH	INC	AZM	TVD																																																																																																		
413.00	0.13	340.79	413.00																																																																																																		
458.00	0.44	260.10	458.00																																																																																																		
503.00	0.35	277.86	503.00																																																																																																		
547.00	0.13	237.60	547.00																																																																																																		
592.00	0.40	284.89	592.00																																																																																																		
637.00	0.13	305.89	637.00																																																																																																		
682.00	0.26	322.77	682.00																																																																																																		
727.00	0.44	304.49	727.00																																																																																																		
771.00	0.31	279.35	770.99																																																																																																		
816.00	0.26	335.95	815.99																																																																																																		
861.00	0.26	274.43	860.99																																																																																																		
905.00	0.44	293.68	904.99																																																																																																		
950.00	0.26	1.27	949.99																																																																																																		
995.00	0.35	355.11	994.99																																																																																																		
1039.00	0.48	338.24	1038.99																																																																																																		
1084.00	0.31	295.96	1083.99																																																																																																		
1128.00	0.31	357.05	1127.99																																																																																																		
1173.00	0.40	337.62	1172.99																																																																																																		
1217.00	0.35	318.46	1216.99																																																																																																		
1262.00	0.44	312.40	1261.99																																																																																																		
1306.00	0.70	294.64	1305.98																																																																																																		
1351.00	0.53	298.16	1350.98																																																																																																		
1395.00	0.79	310.38	1394.98																																																																																																		
7/18/25	17:30	17:45	0.25	RIG CREW CHANGE, HELD S/M JSA																																																																																																	

Well:	CERVI #34-1			Spud Date:																																																																													
Project:	COLORADO - WELD			Site:	T03N-R63W-S34																																																																												
Event:	ABANDONMENT			Rig Name:	ENSIGN 122																																																																												
Start Date:	7/17/25			End Date:	8/1/25																																																																												
Datum:	KB @ 4750			Well UWI:	0512313237																																																																												
Report Date	Time From	Time To	Duration (hr)	Operation																																																																													
7/18/25	17:45	0:00	6.25	<p>CONTINUE WASHING DOWN 1900'-3273. RUN SURVEY EVERY 45'. TURN HOLE OVER AT 1000'.</p> <p>F/ DRILL FROM 1900'-3273'.</p> <p>W/T 9.3 VIS 34 AT 3273' ROP 464FT/HR . PUMP RATE 500 GPM TORQUE 0.80FT/LB WOB 0.00 PSI 1127PSI CUTTINGS. SMALL SHALE AND FORMATION. (TAKING SURVEY'S EVERY 100' ) PUMP BOTTOMS UP AT 1000'. (HARD SPOTS) 2598' - 2620'</p> <table border="1"> <thead> <tr> <th>DEPTH</th> <th>INC</th> <th>AZM</th> <th>TVD</th> </tr> </thead> <tbody> <tr><td>1485.00</td><td>0.66</td><td>338.59</td><td>1484.97</td></tr> <tr><td>1575.00</td><td>0.57</td><td>351.07</td><td>1574.97</td></tr> <tr><td>1664.00</td><td>0.48</td><td>340.52</td><td>1663.96</td></tr> <tr><td>1753.00</td><td>0.53</td><td>342.37</td><td>1752.96</td></tr> <tr><td>1842.00</td><td>0.79</td><td>2.41</td><td>1841.95</td></tr> <tr><td>1931.00</td><td>0.62</td><td>28.69</td><td>1930.95</td></tr> <tr><td>2020.00</td><td>0.70</td><td>32.99</td><td>2019.94</td></tr> <tr><td>2109.00</td><td>0.79</td><td>42.40</td><td>2108.93</td></tr> <tr><td>2198.00</td><td>0.88</td><td>48.99</td><td>2197.92</td></tr> <tr><td>2287.00</td><td>0.84</td><td>69.73</td><td>2286.91</td></tr> <tr><td>2377.00</td><td>1.14</td><td>77.73</td><td>2376.90</td></tr> <tr><td>2466.00</td><td>0.97</td><td>94.43</td><td>2465.89</td></tr> <tr><td>2555.00</td><td>1.49</td><td>112.01</td><td>2554.87</td></tr> <tr><td>2644.00</td><td>1.45</td><td>113.68</td><td>2643.84</td></tr> <tr><td>2733.00</td><td>1.27</td><td>117.90</td><td>2732.81</td></tr> <tr><td>2822.00</td><td>1.32</td><td>104.45</td><td>2821.79</td></tr> <tr><td>2911.00</td><td>0.88</td><td>110.87</td><td>2910.77</td></tr> <tr><td>3000.00</td><td>1.10</td><td>120.27</td><td>2999.76</td></tr> </tbody> </table>		DEPTH	INC	AZM	TVD	1485.00	0.66	338.59	1484.97	1575.00	0.57	351.07	1574.97	1664.00	0.48	340.52	1663.96	1753.00	0.53	342.37	1752.96	1842.00	0.79	2.41	1841.95	1931.00	0.62	28.69	1930.95	2020.00	0.70	32.99	2019.94	2109.00	0.79	42.40	2108.93	2198.00	0.88	48.99	2197.92	2287.00	0.84	69.73	2286.91	2377.00	1.14	77.73	2376.90	2466.00	0.97	94.43	2465.89	2555.00	1.49	112.01	2554.87	2644.00	1.45	113.68	2643.84	2733.00	1.27	117.90	2732.81	2822.00	1.32	104.45	2821.79	2911.00	0.88	110.87	2910.77	3000.00	1.10	120.27	2999.76
DEPTH	INC	AZM	TVD																																																																														
1485.00	0.66	338.59	1484.97																																																																														
1575.00	0.57	351.07	1574.97																																																																														
1664.00	0.48	340.52	1663.96																																																																														
1753.00	0.53	342.37	1752.96																																																																														
1842.00	0.79	2.41	1841.95																																																																														
1931.00	0.62	28.69	1930.95																																																																														
2020.00	0.70	32.99	2019.94																																																																														
2109.00	0.79	42.40	2108.93																																																																														
2198.00	0.88	48.99	2197.92																																																																														
2287.00	0.84	69.73	2286.91																																																																														
2377.00	1.14	77.73	2376.90																																																																														
2466.00	0.97	94.43	2465.89																																																																														
2555.00	1.49	112.01	2554.87																																																																														
2644.00	1.45	113.68	2643.84																																																																														
2733.00	1.27	117.90	2732.81																																																																														
2822.00	1.32	104.45	2821.79																																																																														
2911.00	0.88	110.87	2910.77																																																																														
3000.00	1.10	120.27	2999.76																																																																														

Well:	CERVI #34-1			Spud Date:																																																									
Project:	COLORADO - WELD			Site:	T03N-R63W-S34																																																								
Event:	ABANDONMENT			Rig Name:	ENSIGN 122																																																								
Start Date:	7/17/25			End Date:	8/1/25																																																								
Datum:	KB @ 4750			Well UWI:	0512313237																																																								
Report Date	Time From	Time To	Duration (hr)	Operation																																																									
7/19/25	0:00	5:30	5.50	<p>CONTINUE WASHING DOWN 3283. RUN SURVEY EVERY 100'. TURN HOLE OVER AT 2000', 3000', 4,000',</p> <p>F/ DRILL FROM 1900'-4500'.</p> <p>W/T 9.3 VIS 34 AT 3273' ROP 464FT/HR . PUMP RATE 500 GPM TORQUE 0.80FT/LB WOB 0.00 PSI 1127PSI CUTTINGS. SMALL SHALE AND FORMATION. (TAKING SURVEY'S EVERY 100' ) PUMP BOTTOMS UP AT 1000'. (HARD SPOTS) 2598' - 2620'</p> <table border="0"> <thead> <tr> <th>DEPTH</th> <th>INC</th> <th>AZM</th> <th>TVD</th> </tr> </thead> <tbody> <tr><td>3089.00</td><td>1.10</td><td>117.28</td><td>3088.74</td></tr> <tr><td>3178.00</td><td>0.97</td><td>92.32</td><td>3177.73</td></tr> <tr><td>3267.00</td><td>1.05</td><td>124.66</td><td>3266.71</td></tr> <tr><td>3357.00</td><td>1.05</td><td>110.16</td><td>3356.70</td></tr> <tr><td>3446.00</td><td>1.14</td><td>143.21</td><td>3445.68</td></tr> <tr><td>3535.00</td><td>1.19</td><td>153.93</td><td>3534.67</td></tr> <tr><td>3624.00</td><td>0.79</td><td>149.54</td><td>3623.65</td></tr> <tr><td>3713.00</td><td>0.70</td><td>160.87</td><td>3712.65</td></tr> <tr><td>3802.00</td><td>0.53</td><td>164.04</td><td>3801.64</td></tr> <tr><td>3891.00</td><td>0.66</td><td>144.00</td><td>3890.64</td></tr> <tr><td>3980.00</td><td>0.70</td><td>165.97</td><td>3979.63</td></tr> <tr><td>4070.00</td><td>0.66</td><td>165.27</td><td>4069.62</td></tr> <tr><td>4159.00</td><td>0.92</td><td>165.01</td><td>4158.61</td></tr> </tbody> </table>		DEPTH	INC	AZM	TVD	3089.00	1.10	117.28	3088.74	3178.00	0.97	92.32	3177.73	3267.00	1.05	124.66	3266.71	3357.00	1.05	110.16	3356.70	3446.00	1.14	143.21	3445.68	3535.00	1.19	153.93	3534.67	3624.00	0.79	149.54	3623.65	3713.00	0.70	160.87	3712.65	3802.00	0.53	164.04	3801.64	3891.00	0.66	144.00	3890.64	3980.00	0.70	165.97	3979.63	4070.00	0.66	165.27	4069.62	4159.00	0.92	165.01	4158.61
DEPTH	INC	AZM	TVD																																																										
3089.00	1.10	117.28	3088.74																																																										
3178.00	0.97	92.32	3177.73																																																										
3267.00	1.05	124.66	3266.71																																																										
3357.00	1.05	110.16	3356.70																																																										
3446.00	1.14	143.21	3445.68																																																										
3535.00	1.19	153.93	3534.67																																																										
3624.00	0.79	149.54	3623.65																																																										
3713.00	0.70	160.87	3712.65																																																										
3802.00	0.53	164.04	3801.64																																																										
3891.00	0.66	144.00	3890.64																																																										
3980.00	0.70	165.97	3979.63																																																										
4070.00	0.66	165.27	4069.62																																																										
4159.00	0.92	165.01	4158.61																																																										
7/19/25	5:30	5:45	0.25	RIG CREW CHANGE / HELD S/M JSA																																																									

Start Date:	7/17/25			End Date:	8/1/25																																																																																																																																				
Datum:	KB @ 4750			Well UWI:	0512313237																																																																																																																																				
Report Date	Time From	Time To	Duration (hr)	Operation																																																																																																																																					
7/19/25	5:45	15:00	9.25	<p>CONTINUE WASHING DOWN 3283. RUN SURVEY EVERY 100'. TURN HOLE OVER AT 5000, 6,000', 6900'.</p> <p>F/ DRILL FROM 4500'-6523'.</p> <p>W/T 9.3 VIS 41 AT 6523' ROP 464-350FT/HR . PUMP RATE 513 GPM TORQUE 0.960FT/LB WOB 0.00 PSI 1732PSI CUTTINGS. SHALE AND FORMATION. (TAKING SURVEY'S EVERY 100' ) PUMP BOTTOMS UP AT EVERY 1000'. (HIT GAS AT 4510')</p> <table border="1"> <thead> <tr> <th>DEPTH</th> <th>INC</th> <th>AZM</th> <th>TVD</th> </tr> </thead> <tbody> <tr><td>4248.00</td><td>0.84</td><td>174.59</td><td>4247.60</td></tr> <tr><td>4337.00</td><td>1.05</td><td>203.77</td><td>4336.59</td></tr> <tr><td>4426.00</td><td>1.19</td><td>192.08</td><td>4425.58</td></tr> <tr><td>4515.00</td><td>0.92</td><td>188.47</td><td>4514.56</td></tr> <tr><td>4604.00</td><td>0.92</td><td>193.04</td><td>4603.55</td></tr> <tr><td>4693.00</td><td>0.88</td><td>199.99</td><td>4692.54</td></tr> <tr><td>4782.00</td><td>0.70</td><td>204.03</td><td>4781.53</td></tr> <tr><td>4872.00</td><td>0.66</td><td>174.15</td><td>4871.52</td></tr> <tr><td>4960.00</td><td>0.66</td><td>164.39</td><td>4959.52</td></tr> <tr><td>5049.00</td><td>0.48</td><td>166.85</td><td>5048.51</td></tr> <tr><td>5138.00</td><td>0.66</td><td>199.90</td><td>5137.51</td></tr> <tr><td>5227.00</td><td>0.62</td><td>216.42</td><td>5226.50</td></tr> <tr><td>5317.00</td><td>0.22</td><td>165.45</td><td>5316.50</td></tr> <tr><td>5406.00</td><td>0.18</td><td>230.48</td><td>5405.50</td></tr> <tr><td>5495.00</td><td>0.31</td><td>219.67</td><td>5494.50</td></tr> <tr><td>5584.00</td><td>0.70</td><td>302.64</td><td>5583.50</td></tr> <tr><td>5674.00</td><td>0.53</td><td>299.83</td><td>5673.49</td></tr> <tr><td>5762.00</td><td>0.79</td><td>323.38</td><td>5761.49</td></tr> <tr><td>5852.00</td><td>1.01</td><td>355.64</td><td>5851.48</td></tr> <tr><td>5941.00</td><td>1.14</td><td>3.46</td><td>5940.46</td></tr> <tr><td>6030.00</td><td>0.97</td><td>33.35</td><td>6029.45</td></tr> <tr><td>6119.00</td><td>1.14</td><td>17.70</td><td>6118.43</td></tr> <tr><td>6208.00</td><td>1.05</td><td>15.59</td><td>6207.41</td></tr> <tr><td>6297.00</td><td>0.92</td><td>21.22</td><td>6296.40</td></tr> <tr><td>6386.00</td><td>1.41</td><td>26.14</td><td>6385.38</td></tr> <tr><td>6462.00</td><td>1.41</td><td>18.93</td><td>6461.36</td></tr> <tr><td>6523.00</td><td>1.41</td><td>18.93</td><td>6522.34</td></tr> <tr><td>4960.00</td><td>0.66</td><td>164.39</td><td>4959.52</td></tr> <tr><td>5049.00</td><td>0.48</td><td>166.85</td><td>5048.51</td></tr> <tr><td>5138.00</td><td>0.66</td><td>199.90</td><td>5137.51</td></tr> <tr><td>5227.00</td><td>0.62</td><td>216.42</td><td>5226.50</td></tr> <tr><td>5317.00</td><td>0.22</td><td>165.45</td><td>5316.50</td></tr> </tbody> </table>		DEPTH	INC	AZM	TVD	4248.00	0.84	174.59	4247.60	4337.00	1.05	203.77	4336.59	4426.00	1.19	192.08	4425.58	4515.00	0.92	188.47	4514.56	4604.00	0.92	193.04	4603.55	4693.00	0.88	199.99	4692.54	4782.00	0.70	204.03	4781.53	4872.00	0.66	174.15	4871.52	4960.00	0.66	164.39	4959.52	5049.00	0.48	166.85	5048.51	5138.00	0.66	199.90	5137.51	5227.00	0.62	216.42	5226.50	5317.00	0.22	165.45	5316.50	5406.00	0.18	230.48	5405.50	5495.00	0.31	219.67	5494.50	5584.00	0.70	302.64	5583.50	5674.00	0.53	299.83	5673.49	5762.00	0.79	323.38	5761.49	5852.00	1.01	355.64	5851.48	5941.00	1.14	3.46	5940.46	6030.00	0.97	33.35	6029.45	6119.00	1.14	17.70	6118.43	6208.00	1.05	15.59	6207.41	6297.00	0.92	21.22	6296.40	6386.00	1.41	26.14	6385.38	6462.00	1.41	18.93	6461.36	6523.00	1.41	18.93	6522.34	4960.00	0.66	164.39	4959.52	5049.00	0.48	166.85	5048.51	5138.00	0.66	199.90	5137.51	5227.00	0.62	216.42	5226.50	5317.00	0.22	165.45	5316.50
DEPTH	INC	AZM	TVD																																																																																																																																						
4248.00	0.84	174.59	4247.60																																																																																																																																						
4337.00	1.05	203.77	4336.59																																																																																																																																						
4426.00	1.19	192.08	4425.58																																																																																																																																						
4515.00	0.92	188.47	4514.56																																																																																																																																						
4604.00	0.92	193.04	4603.55																																																																																																																																						
4693.00	0.88	199.99	4692.54																																																																																																																																						
4782.00	0.70	204.03	4781.53																																																																																																																																						
4872.00	0.66	174.15	4871.52																																																																																																																																						
4960.00	0.66	164.39	4959.52																																																																																																																																						
5049.00	0.48	166.85	5048.51																																																																																																																																						
5138.00	0.66	199.90	5137.51																																																																																																																																						
5227.00	0.62	216.42	5226.50																																																																																																																																						
5317.00	0.22	165.45	5316.50																																																																																																																																						
5406.00	0.18	230.48	5405.50																																																																																																																																						
5495.00	0.31	219.67	5494.50																																																																																																																																						
5584.00	0.70	302.64	5583.50																																																																																																																																						
5674.00	0.53	299.83	5673.49																																																																																																																																						
5762.00	0.79	323.38	5761.49																																																																																																																																						
5852.00	1.01	355.64	5851.48																																																																																																																																						
5941.00	1.14	3.46	5940.46																																																																																																																																						
6030.00	0.97	33.35	6029.45																																																																																																																																						
6119.00	1.14	17.70	6118.43																																																																																																																																						
6208.00	1.05	15.59	6207.41																																																																																																																																						
6297.00	0.92	21.22	6296.40																																																																																																																																						
6386.00	1.41	26.14	6385.38																																																																																																																																						
6462.00	1.41	18.93	6461.36																																																																																																																																						
6523.00	1.41	18.93	6522.34																																																																																																																																						
4960.00	0.66	164.39	4959.52																																																																																																																																						
5049.00	0.48	166.85	5048.51																																																																																																																																						
5138.00	0.66	199.90	5137.51																																																																																																																																						
5227.00	0.62	216.42	5226.50																																																																																																																																						
5317.00	0.22	165.45	5316.50																																																																																																																																						

Well:	CERVI #34-1			Spud Date:	
Project:	COLORADO - WELD			Site:	T03N-R63W-S34
Event:	ABANDONMENT			Rig Name:	ENSIGN 122
Start Date:	7/17/25			End Date:	8/1/25
Datum:	KB @ 4750			Well UWI:	0512313237
Report Date	Time From	Time To	Duration (hr)	Operation	
7/19/25	15:00	16:00	1	TURN HOLE OVER 1.5X 570BBLs. SHACKER CLEAN.	
7/19/25	16:00	17:00	1	WIPER TRIP. TOH LD 22 JOINTS TO 5511'	
7/19/25	17:00	17:45	0.75	RIH TO 6523'	
7/19/25	17:45	18:00	0.25	RIG CREW CHANGE / HELD S/M JSA	
7/19/25	18:00	18:30	0.50	CIRC BOTTOMS UP / UNTIL SHAKER CLEAN TWO PUMPS 550 GPM / 900 PSI VIS 43 / 9.3 MW	
7/19/25	18:30	23:00	4.50	POOH LD BHA, INPS BIT STILL LOOK GOOD LEFT BIT ON MOTOR/ DISP COMING OUT 94 BBL	
7/19/25	23:00	23:15	0.25	HELD BOP DRILL	
7/19/25	23:15	23:30	0.25	SERVICE TOP DRIVE & HPU, INPS OIL LEVELS, GREASE RIG	
7/19/25	23:30	0:00	0.50	RIH OPEN ENDED	
7/20/25	0:00	4:00	4	FINISH TIH TO 6506, 146 JTS	
7/20/25	4:00	6:00	2	F/ CIRC FROM 6506' TO SURFACE, HEAVY MUD AND CUTTINGS. ONE PUMP 347 GPM, AT 600 PSI	
7/20/25	6:00	6:34	0.57	MIRU CEMENTERS. HOLD JSA MEETING. CMT COMPANY: (SLB).	
7/20/25	6:34	7:26	0.87	PUMP 200 SX, 15.8 PPG 1.53 CF/SX CLASS G CEMENT, (NIO BLEND) BALANCE PLUG: (YES), TOC 5660 FT, BOC 6506 FT SQUEEZE: (NO), EQUIPMENT: (NONE) DEPTH: 0 FT, BOTTOM (OH): 6506 FT, TOP (NA): 0 FT, TOC IN CSG: 0FT	
7/20/25	7:26	8:33	1.12	PUMP 38BBLs DISPLACEMENT. PUMP WHILE PULLING 14 JOINTS WITH 42BBLs TO EST TOC 5904'. CONTINUE POOH LD 7 JTS WITH A TOTAL OF 21 JOINTS DOWN AT 5571'.	
7/20/25	8:33	9:15	0.70	CIRC BOTTOMS UP WITH 360BBLs ( NO CEMENT BACK )	
7/20/25	9:15	11:00	1.75	WAIT ON CEMENT	
7/20/25	11:00	11:15	0.25	TIH TAG TOP OF CEMENT 5660'.	
7/20/25	11:15	12:15	1	TOH LD 28 JOINTS. 74 JOINTS IN HOLE AT 4413'.	
7/20/25	12:15	12:32	0.28	CIR 1X 254BBLs.	
7/20/25	12:32	12:45	0.22	MIRU CEMENTERS. HOLD JSA MEETING.CMT COMPANY: (SLB).	
7/20/25	12:45	13:15	0.50	PUMP 281 SX, 1.18 PPG 15.8 CF/SX CLASS G CEMENT, (AGM BLEND) BALANCE PLUG: (YES), TOC 3223 FT, BOC 4413 FT SQUEEZE: (NO), EQUIPMENT: (NONE) DEPTH: 0 FT, BOTTOM (PERF): 0 FT, TOP (PERF): 0 FT, TOC IN CSG: 0FT	

Well:	CERVI #34-1			Spud Date:	
Project:	COLORADO - WELD			Site:	T03N-R63W-S34
Event:	ABANDONMENT			Rig Name:	ENSIGN 122
Start Date:	7/17/25			End Date:	8/1/25
Datum:	KB @ 4750			Well UWI:	0512313237
Report Date	Time From	Time To	Duration (hr)	Operation	
7/20/25	13:15	14:15	1	DISP 57BBLS. DISP 6BBLS 1.8BBLS PER JT FOR FIRST 11 JOINTS. LD TOTAL OF 25 JOINTS. 74 JOINTS IN HOLE AT 3299'.	
7/20/25	14:15	15:15	1	TURN HOLE OVER 2X 383BBLS.	
7/20/25	15:15	18:30	3.25	WAIT ON CEMENT.	
7/20/25	18:30	18:45	0.25	RIH TAG TOC W/ 82 JTS AT 3632'	
7/20/25	18:45	19:30	0.75	POOH LD 24 JTS TO 2606'	
7/20/25	19:30	19:45	0.25	MIRU CEMENTERS. HOLD JSA MEETING. CMT COMPANY: (SLB).	
7/20/25	19:45	20:00	0.25	PUMP 211 SX, 15.8 PPG 1.17 CF/SX CLASS G CEMENT, (AGM BLEND) BALANCE PLUG: (YES), TOC 2085 FT, BOC 2606 FT SQUEEZE: (NO), EQUIPMENT: (NONE) DEPTH: 0 FT, BOTTOM (OH): 2606 FT, TOP (NA): 0 FT, TOC IN CSG: 0FT	
7/20/25	20:00	20:45	0.75	POOH LD 20 JTS TO 1695'	
7/20/25	20:45	21:00	0.25	CIRC 2 X BOTTOMS UP ( NO CEMENT BACK )	
7/20/25	21:00	23:00	2	WAIT ON CEMENT	
7/20/25	23:00	23:30	0.50	RIH TAG TOC W/ 2187' 49 JTS	
7/20/25	23:30	0:00	0.50	POOH LD 13 JTS TO 1606'	
7/21/25	0:00	0:30	0.50	MIRU CEMENTERS. HOLD JSA MEETING. CMT COMPANY: (SLB).	
7/21/25	0:30	1:00	0.50	PUMP 293 SX, 15.8 PPG 1.17 CF/SX CLASS G CEMENT, (AGM BLEND) BALANCE PLUG: (YES), TOC 1100 FT, BOC 1606 FT SQUEEZE: (NO), EQUIPMENT: (NONE) DEPTH: 0 FT, BOTTOM (OH): 1606 FT, TOP (NA): 0 FT, TOC IN CSG: 0FT	
7/21/25	1:00	1:30	0.50	POOH LD 22 JTS TO 624'	
7/21/25	1:30	2:00	0.50	CIRC BOTTOMS UP ( NO CEMENT BACK )	
7/21/25	2:00	2:30	0.50	FINISH POOH	
7/21/25	2:30	3:30	1	PU 8 5/8 SCRAPER, RIH TO 430 BACK OUT	
7/21/25	3:30	5:30	2	WOC	
7/21/25	5:30	5:45	0.25	CREW CHANGE / JSA	
7/21/25	5:45	6:30	0.75	TIH TAG TOC AT 745'	
7/21/25	6:30	7:00	0.50	TOH LD TO 712' JOINT 18.	

Well:	CERVI #34-1			Spud Date:	
Project:	COLORADO - WELD			Site:	T03N-R63W-S34
Event:	ABANDONMENT			Rig Name:	ENSIGN 122
Start Date:	7/17/25			End Date:	8/1/25
Datum:	KB @ 4750			Well UWI:	0512313237
Report Date	Time From	Time To	Duration (hr)	Operation	
7/21/25	7:37	7:40	0.05	MIRU CEMENTERS. HOLD JSA MEETING. CMT COMPANY: (SLB). { CMT JOB TYPE: (OH BAL PLUG), IF OTHER EXPLAIN IN COMMENTS. PRESSURE TEST CEMENT LINES TO: 2500 PSI, BLEED OFF PRESSURE. WATER SOURCE: (ULRICH FARMS) WATER TEMP: 71 deg F, PH:7, CL: <500 PPM RETURNS SETUP: (TWO VALVES TWO TANK LINES) CMT DOWN (TBG), RETURNS (NONE) ADDITIVES 1 TYPE: (LATEX), ADDITIVES 1 AMOUNT: 4(%) ADDITIVES 2 TYPE: (FLUID LOSS), ADDITIVES 2 AMOUNT: 25(%) ADDITIVES 3 TYPE: (GYPSUM), ADDITIVES 3 AMOUNT: 4(%) ADDITIVES 4 TYPE: (OTHER), ADDITIVES 4 AMOUNT: 0(%)  COMMENTS: (STAGE 5. SHOE & TOP OUT PLUG)	
7/21/25	7:40	9:10	1.50	PUMP 405 SX, 1.18 PPG 15.8 CF/SX CLASS G CEMENT, (AGM BLEND) BALANCE PLUG: (YES), TOC 0 FT, BOC 712 FT SQUEEZE: (NO), EQUIPMENT: (NONE) DEPTH: 0 FT, BOTTOM (PERF): 0 FT, TOP (PERF): 0 FT, TOC IN CSG: 0FT { SPACER VOL: 5 BBLs, SPACER DESCRIPTION: (FRESH WATER) AVG PUMP RATE: 2.3 BPM, AVG PUMP PRESSURE: 210 PSI, TOTAL VOL PUMPED: 94 BBLs MAX ALLOWABLE SURFACE EQUIPMENT PSI RATING: 2500 PSI STAGE NO: 5 OH EXCESS CEMENT CALCULATED: 0% RATE OF RETURNS: (NONE) SOLIDS IN RETURNS: (NONE), HC IN RETURNS: (NONE) HESITATIONS DONE: (NO) PRESSURE APPLIED OVERNIGHT: (NO), PRESSURE: 0 PSI  COMMENTS: (STAGE 5. SHOE & TOP OUT PLUG)	
7/21/25	8:00	8:20	0.33	TOH LD 16 JOINTS. WITH 2-JOINTS IN HOLE AT 90'. TOP OFF WELL WITH 4.8BBLs CEMENT. PULL AND LD 2-JOINTS. TOP OFF CASING WITH CEMENT TO SURFACE.	
7/21/25	9:10	0:00	14.83	CLEAN UP AND RIG DOWN ENSIGN 122. GET READY FOR RIG MOVE IN AM.	
7/21/25				EATCH PLUG PUMPED WAS AT LEAST 100' LONG	
7/21/25				SC SHOE PLUG PUMPED AT 07:37 07/21/2025. CEMENT CIRC TO SURFACE SO NO TAG REQUIRED. 07/22/2025	
7/21/25				PRIOR TO PLACING 1560' CEMENT WAIT FOUR HOURS, SHOULD 0 LELS 0 PSI PRIOR TO PLASING CEMENT PLUG. 07/21/2025	
7/22/25	0:00	6:00	6	RIG OUT EQUIPMENT. RIG RELEASED 0600HRS.	



Well:	CERVI #34-1			Spud Date:	
Project:	COLORADO - WELD			Site:	T03N-R63W-S34
Event:	ABANDONMENT			Rig Name:	ENSIGN 122
Start Date:	7/17/25			End Date:	8/1/25
Datum:	KB @ 4750			Well UWI:	0512313237
Report Date	Time From	Time To	Duration (hr)	Operation	
8/1/25	8:00	9:00	1	(VISUAL) CHECK FOR 15 MINUTES. ISOLATION CONFIRMED (YES)OTHER METHOD:	
8/1/25	8:00	9:00	1	DUG UP SURFACE CASING	
8/1/25	9:00	10:00	1	CUT CASING 6' BELOW GL, 8 5/8 CEMENT AT 10 FEET, FILLED CASING STUB WITH 2 BAGS OF 5000 PSI CEMENT. CEMENT TO SURFACE.	
8/1/25	10:00	11:00	1	CAPPED CASING WITH A METAL PLATE CONTAINING WELL INFO	
8/1/25	11:00	12:00	1	BACKFILLED	