

Oxy Operations Summary

Well:	CPC 4-42-4			Spud Date:	
Project:	COLORADO-WELD-NAD83-UTM13			Site:	CPC #4-42-4
Event:	ABANDONMENT			Rig Name:	ENSIGN 122
Start Date:	8/1/24			End Date:	8/14/24
Datum:	GL @ 5037			Well UWI:	0512308861
Report Date	Time From	Time To	Duration (hr)	Operation	
7/30/24	7:00	17:00	10	LONE TREE SERVICES TO PICKUP ALL WELL HEAD PARTS FROM PSS, EXCAVATE WELL, ASSIST WELDER SETTING RISER, SET CELLAR BACKFILL, COMPACT, SET GRATES, & INSTALL PERIMETER STRING FENCE. FLUID ENERGY USED 2-HAZMAT BOBTAILS TO ROLL FLUID DOWNHOLE. BENTLEY WELDING TO CUT DAMAGED SECTION, BUILD RISER AND WELD TO BRING TO SURFACE. JOMAX CONSTRUCTION TO GRADE ROADWAY, AND LEVEL LOCATION. FUZION TO DELIVER BATHROOMS.	
8/1/24	6:00	10:00	4	MOVE RIG TO LOC, SPOT IN ALL EQUIPMENT WITH TRUCKS, FACING RIG SOUTH, RELEASE TRUCKS	
8/1/24	10:00	14:00	4	RIG UP BY HAND, HOOK UP ALL HYDRUALIC, WATER, DIESEL, ELECTRICAL LINES, FILL TANKS WITH WATER	
8/1/24	14:00	15:30	1.50	INSTALL W-92 FLANGE, 14" SPACER SPOOL, & 11" 3K BOP & N/U RU FLAIR LINES & CHOKE LINES	
8/1/24	15:30	19:00	3.50	PRESSURE TEST BOP, RAMS, HCR, INSIDE/OUTSIDE CHOKE VALVES, KILL LINE, TIW, ANNULAR TO 250 LOW, 1500 HIGH LEAK DOWN TEST ACUMULATOR (PASS)	
8/1/24	19:00	20:00	1	INPS RU, WENT OVER RU CHECK LIST. LINE OUT CHOKE & BOP FOR SOFT SHUT IN TO TANKS, INPS FLARE LINE & AND ALL SAFETY EQ STRAPS.	
8/1/24	20:00	22:00	2	P/U MAGNET, TIH, TAG FISH @ 40' TRIED SEVERAL TIMES IN & OUT WITH NO LUCK, TRIED WASHING TOP DOWN TO FISH SEVERAL TIMES WITH NO SUCESS, L/D MAGNET	
8/1/24	22:00	0:00	2	P/U 7 7/8" MILL, TIH TO FISH @ 40' PUSHED IT TO 73' & STARTED MILLING	
8/1/24				P&A OPERATIONS SIGN POSTED AT ENTRANCE TO LOC.	
8/1/24				FORM 42 SENT IN & APPROVED ON 7/29/2024 TO MIRU ON 08/01/2024, MIRU 08/01/2024	
8/2/24	0:00	0:30	0.50	FINISH MILLING TO 84' TOH, L/D MILL	
8/2/24	0:30	5:30	5	P/U 7 7/8" ROCK BIT, TIH TO 84' DRILL CEMENT TO 610' CIRC. BTMS UP NO CEMENT AT SHOE	
8/2/24	5:30	6:00	0.50	TOH, L/D BIT SUB	
8/2/24	6:00	7:45	1.75	P/U BHA MKE UP BIT TO BIT & FLOAT TWO 6 1/8 MONELS 4.5 DP RIH TO 610'	
8/2/24	7:45	13:45	6	WASH DOWN TO FROM 610' TO 2761' LOST CIRC TURN PUMP DOWN ROT OUT PULLED 85K WITH PUMP AT 150 GPM, LD TWO JTS WASH BACK DOWN TO 2761'	

Well:	CPC 4-42-4			Spud Date:	
Project:	COLORADO-WELD-NAD83-UTM13			Site:	CPC #4-42-4
Event:	ABANDONMENT			Rig Name:	ENSIGN 122
Start Date:	8/1/24			End Date:	8/14/24
Datum:	GL @ 5037			Well UWI:	0512308861
Report Date	Time From	Time To	Duration (hr)	Operation	
8/2/24	13:45	16:30	2.75	KEEP WASING DOWN OPEN HOLE FROM 2761' TO 2968' SET ROP LIMIT TO 200' FT, HR LOST CIRC AGAIN AT 2968' PULLED OUT OF THE HOLE TO 2741' PULLED 85K PUMP AT 150 GPM	
8/2/24	16:30	18:30	2	L/D 1 MORE JT. TO 2700' REGAINED CIRCULATION, CIRC. HOLE CLEAN, HAD LOTS OF SAND COMING OVER SHAKERS	
8/2/24	18:30	21:00	2.50	PERFORM 1000' WIPER TRIP TO 1900' HAD A FEW TIGHT SPOTS ON THE WAY BACK IN WE HAD TO CIRC. DOWN, WASH LAST 6 JTS. BACK TO 2968'	
8/2/24	21:00	0:00	3	CONTINUE WASHING DOWN F/ 2968' WITH 250-300 ROP MAX, 350 GPM, 60 RPM TO 3636' AMDE CONNECTION & STARTED LOOSING AGAIN - (PACKED OFF)	
8/3/24	0:00	1:00	1	L/D 2 JTS. CIRC. & WORK PIPE FREE FROM PACK OFF, NO CIRCULATION, GOT WORKED FREE, CIRC. BTMS UP TO CLEAN HOLE	
8/3/24	1:00	3:30	2.50	WASH 2 JTS. BACK TO 3636' & CONTINUE WASHING TO 4143' WITH 250-300 ROP, 350 GPM, 60 ROT. TAGGED UP ON CMT. PLUG	
8/3/24	3:30	4:30	1	KICKED BOTH PUMPS ONLINE, CIRC. WELL CLEAN, HAD LOTS OF CUTTINGS (SHALE) AT SHAKER, PUMPED SWEEP OUT, SHAKERS CLEANED UP	
8/3/24	4:30	7:15	2.75	TOH, L/D BHA, PULLED TIGHT OFF BTM, BREAK BIT : CHANGE OUT ROTAING HEAD RUBBER	
8/3/24	7:15	9:00	1.75	TIH W/ 36 JTS TO 1600'	
8/3/24	9:00	9:30	0.50	CIRC BOTTOMS UP 500 GPM 400 PSI	
8/3/24	9:30	12:00	2.50	TIH, HAD TO WASH THE LAST 500' TO BTM	
8/3/24	12:00	12:30	0.50	MIRU CEMENTERS. HOLD JSA MEETING. CMT COMPANY: (AXIS).	
8/3/24	12:30	13:00	0.50	PUMP 285 SX, 15.8 PPG 1.19 CF/SX CLASS G CEMENT, (SUSX BLEND) BALANCE PLUG: (YES), TOC 3450 FT, BOC 4136 FT SQUEEZE: (NO), EQUIPMENT: (NONE) DEPTH: 0 FT, BOTTOM (CSG CUT): 4136 FT, TOP (NA): 0 FT, TOC IN CSG: 0FT	
8/3/24	13:00	14:00	1	POOH LD 25 JTS, DISP 40 BBL MUD WITH RIG PUMPS PULLED TIGHT COMING OUT, HADE ROTE COMING OUT PULLED 185 BACK DOWN TO 85, WORK PIPE OUT ROTATING OUT.	
8/3/24	14:00	14:30	0.50	CIRC TWO FULL BOTTOMS UP, NO CEMENT ON RETRUNS	
8/3/24	14:30	16:45	2.25	WAIT ON CEMENT CIRC EVERY 20 MIN, WORK PIPE WHEN CIRC	

Well:	CPC 4-42-4			Spud Date:	
Project:	COLORADO-WELD-NAD83-UTM13			Site:	CPC #4-42-4
Event:	ABANDONMENT			Rig Name:	ENSIGN 122
Start Date:	8/1/24			End Date:	8/14/24
Datum:	GL @ 5037			Well UWI:	0512308861
Report Date	Time From	Time To	Duration (hr)	Operation	
8/3/24	16:45	17:00	0.25	RIH TAG TOC AT 2975'	
8/3/24	17:00	17:30	0.50	POOH LD TO 2800' 63 JTS IN THE HOLE	
8/3/24	17:30	18:00	0.50	MIRU CEMENTERS. HOLD JSA MEETING. CMT COMPANY: (AXIS).	
8/3/24	18:00	18:30	0.50	PUMP 285 SX, 15.8 PPG, 1.20 CF/SX CLASS G CEMENT, (AGM BLEND) BALANCE PLUG: (YES), TOC 2369 FT, BOC 2800 FT SQUEEZE: (NO), EQUIPMENT: (NONE) DEPTH: ##### FT, BOTTOM (OH): 2800 FT, TOP (NA): ##### FT, TOC IN CSG: ##### FT	
8/3/24	18:30	19:00	0.50	TOH, L/D 25 JTS. TO 1677' CIRC. TO CLEAR PIPE	
8/3/24	19:00	21:00	2	WAIT ON CEMENT	
8/3/24	21:00	22:00	1	TIH TAG CEMENT @ 2369' L/D 8 JTS. TO 2009'	
8/3/24	22:00	22:01	0.02	MIRU CEMENTERS. HOLD JSA MEETING. CMT COMPANY: (AXIS).	
8/3/24	22:01	22:30	0.48	PUMP 285 SX, 15.8 PPG, 1.20 CF/SX CLASS G CEMENT, (AGM BLEND) BALANCE PLUG: (YES), TOC 1500 FT, BOC 2000 FT SQUEEZE: (NO), EQUIPMENT: (NONE) DEPTH: ##### FT, BOTTOM (OH): 2000 FT, TOP (NA): ##### FT, TOC IN CSG: ##### FT	
8/3/24	22:30	23:30	1	TOH TO 887' CIRC. TO CLEAR PIPE	
8/3/24	23:30	0:00	0.50	TOH, L/D DP, P/U 8 5/8" CASING SCRAPER, TIH TO 600' TOH, L/D SCRAPER	
8/4/24	0:00	2:00	2	WAIT ON CEMENT	
8/4/24	2:00	3:00	1	TIH TAG CMT. @ 1512'	
8/4/24	3:00	3:30	0.50	TOH TO 1300'	
8/4/24	3:30	4:00	0.50	MIRU CEMENTERS. HOLD JSA MEETING. CMT COMPANY: (AXIS).	
8/4/24	4:00	4:30	0.50	PUMP 320 SX, 15.8 PPG, 1.20 CF/SX CLASS G CEMENT, (AGM BLEND) BALANCE PLUG: (YES), TOC 300 FT, BOC 1300 FT SQUEEZE: (NO), EQUIPMENT: (NONE) DEPTH: ##### FT, BOTTOM (OH): 1300 FT, TOP (NA): ##### FT, TOC IN CSG: 300 FT	
8/4/24	4:30	5:00	0.50	TOH TO 300' CIRC. TO CLEAR PIPE, L/D PIPE	
8/4/24	5:00	8:30	3.50	WAIT ON CEMENT	
8/4/24	8:30	9:00	0.50	HELD TAIL GATE S/M RU WIRELINE	
8/4/24	9:00	9:30	0.50	RIH TAG TOC AT 550' PULL UP TO 315' SET CIBP POOH	

Well:	CPC 4-42-4			Spud Date:	
Project:	COLORADO-WELD-NAD83-UTM13			Site:	CPC #4-42-4
Event:	ABANDONMENT			Rig Name:	ENSIGN 122
Start Date:	8/1/24			End Date:	8/14/24
Datum:	GL @ 5037			Well UWI:	0512308861
Report Date	Time From	Time To	Duration (hr)	Operation	
8/4/24	9:30	10:00	0.50	RIG DOWN WIRELINE	
8/4/24	10:00	10:30	0.50	RIH WITH 7 JTS TO 315' SET AT 315 BECAUSE OF DP TALLY	
8/4/24	10:30	10:45	0.25	PRESSURE TEST DOWN: (SURFACE CASING). TEST INTERVAL BOTTOM: (CIBP) AT 315 FT TEST INTERVAL TOP: (SURFACE) AT 0 FT PRESSURE TEST TO: 500 PSI FOR 10 MINUTES. TEST RESULTS: (PASS)	
8/4/24	10:45	11:30	0.75	MIRU CEMENTERS. HOLD JSA MEETING. CMT COMPANY: (AXIS).	
8/4/24	11:30	12:00	0.50	PUMP 114 SX, 15.8 PPG, 1.21 CF/SX CLASS G CEMENT, (AGM BLEND) BALANCE PLUG: (YES), TOC 0 FT, BOC 300 FT SQUEEZE: (NO), EQUIPMENT: (NONE) DEPTH: ##### FT, BOTTOM (CASING): 300 FT, TOP (NA): ##### FT, TOC IN CSG: 0 FT	
8/4/24	12:00	12:30	0.50	POOH LD 7 JTS TOP OFF WELL WITH CEMENT FROM DSIP OF 4.5 DP	
8/4/24	12:30	13:30	1	HELD S/M ND BOP	
8/4/24	13:30	18:00	4.50	RD DOWN RIG : CLEAN TANKS, AND SHAKER TANKS : LD DERRICK, BREAK DOWN HYDRO HOSES : BREAK DOWN BACK YARD, CLEAN OUT PUMPS	
8/4/24				AFTER 4 HR WOC TAGGED SHOE PLUG @ 550'	
8/4/24				ALL VENTING & VAPORS WERE CONTROLLED THROUGHOUT RE-ENTRY OPERATIONS	
8/4/24				ALL CEMENT PLUGS WERE A MINIMUM 100' IN LENGTH	
8/4/24				NO PRESSURE OR FLUID MIGRATION NOTED PRIOR TO PUMPING SHOE PLUG @ 1300'	
8/14/24	8:00	9:00	1	(VISUAL) CHECK FOR 15 MINUTES. ISOLATION CONFIRMED (YES)OTHER METHOD:	
8/14/24	8:00	9:00	1	DUG UP SURFACE CASING	
8/14/24	9:00	10:00	1	CUT CASING 6' BELOW GL, CEMENT AT SURFACE	
8/14/24	10:00	11:00	1	CAPPED CASING WITH A METAL PLATE CONTAINING WELL INFO	
8/14/24	11:00	12:00	1	BACKFILLED	
8/14/24	12:00	12:00	0	PLACED MARKER BALL	