NAVE

RESOURCES, L

A

Daily Drilling Report

Well:  Travis #1-10 Pre-Spud Report #: 1 Date:
Location: SENE 10-11S-45W AFE: 991 Daily $: 0
Rig: Duke Drilling Rig #9 KB: 4,381 Cum $: 0
Supv: Bruce Thomas/Tanner Nelson GL: 4,368 AFE $: 0
Next Pl_anned Spud Well Wellbore Pipe Tally Material
Operation: Diagram Transfer
From To Hrs:Min Detail Operations Report
3/21/23 Halde Sand and Gravel building lease entrance off CR40.
Waiting on 811 clearance and 48 hour COGCC form 42 clearance to
begin location build.
12:00 PM | 7:00 PM 7:00 3/22/23 Quandary on location to install air quality monitors. Halde began
limited well pad construction.
6:00 AM [ 6:00 PM 12:00 3/23/23 Continuing well pad and lease road construction. COGCC Field visit
7:00 AM [ 5:00 PM 10:00 |3/24/23 Well pad construction and road construction. COGCC construction
corrective action requirements made through document # 708200068
12:00 PM | 7:00 PM 7:00 3/25/23 Continuing well pad construction and road construction.
7:00 AM [ 6:00 PM 11:00 3/26/23 Finished leveling location. Update form 2A and relocated signage as
per COGCC requirements.
12:00 PM | 6:00 PM 6:00 3/27/23 Finishing lease road topsoil removal and grading.
3/28/23 Shut down
3/29/23 Finished location, applying dust control measures by watering pad.
Installed wattles for erosion control.
4/3/23 COGCC construction inspection, add'l soil removal on road req'd.
4/3/23 Additio add'l soil removal on lease road as per COGCC.
4/6/23 Quandary air monitoring inspection and repair.
4/7/23 Set and cemented conductor. Anticipated MIRU date of 4/16/23
Daily reports suspended unless further activity.
4/8/23 Duke Rig pusher to inspect location and routing today.
4/14/23 MIRU and Spud notifications submitted to COGCC. Timing of MIRU
for Tuesday, April 18 and spudding April 19th (forms attached)
Daily reports suspended unless further activity.
Total 5:00
Cost Estimate Daily$ Cum$ | AFES$ Comments
|9241 Mobilization 0

|9356 Roads & Location

|9214 Damages

|9204 Bonds, Permits, Surveys

|9217 Drilling - Daywork

|921 0 Consulting Services

|9229 Geologic Services

|9208 Cementing & Services

|9243 Mud & Chemicals

|921 3 Contract Labor

lo290 water

l9230 Hauling

|9205 Bits

lo228 Fuel

|9257 Rental

|9253 Plugging & Abandonment

|9240 Miscellaneous & Contingencies

l9220 Drill Stem Testing

|9238 Logging - Open Hole

|9212 Coring / Sample Analysis

|9402 Casing - Surface

|9402 Casing - Surface

|9491 Wellhead Equipment

|9234 Insurance

|9273 Water Disposal

FZGS Supervision
T

otal

OO0 00 0000000000000 00O0O00o0Ooo

CONFIDENTIAL




NAVE Daily Drilling Report

RESOURCES, LLC

Well:  Travis #1-10 Report #: 2 Date: 18-Apr-23
Location: SENE 10-11S-45W AFE: 991 Daily $: 0
Rig: Duke Drilling Rig #9 KB: 4,381 Cum $: 0
Supv: Bruce Thomas/Tanner Nelson GL: 4368 AFE $: 0
Next Planned . . Material

. Drill and set surface Pipe Tally|= . -
Operation: Transfer

From To Hrs:Min Detail Operations Report

7:00 AM | 7:00 PM 12:00 MIRU Duke Drilling rig #9

MIRU Halde. Watered down location to keep dust down. Topped off

of conductor pipe with 10 sx cement. RDMO Halde

Pre-spud meeting with Mark, Bruce and Tanner.

Set sub-structure, draw works, water tank and raised derrick.

SDFN Duke Drilling rig #9

DTL Continued to RU. Duke Drilling rig #9

5:00 AM [ 7:00 AM 2:00 Set generator, shaker deck & pipe racks.

Rigging up equipment.

Total 14:00
Cost Estimate Daily$ Cum$ | AFES$ Comments
l9241 Mmobilization 0 0
|9356 Roads & Location 0 0
|o214 Damages 0 0
|9204 Bonds, Permits, Surveys 0 0
|9217 Drilling - Daywork 0 0
l9210 consulting Services 0 0
|9229 Geologic Services 0 0
|9208 Cementing & Services 0 0
|9243 Mud & Chemicals 0 0
l9213 contract Labor 0 0
lo290 water 0 0
l9230 Hauling 0 0
lo205 Bits 0 0
lo228 Fuel 0 0
lo257 Rental 0 0
|9253 Plugging & Abandonment 0 0
|9240 Miscellaneous & Contingencies 0 0
|9220 Drill Stem Testing 0 0
|9238 Logging - Open Hole 0 0
|9212 Coring / Sample Analysis 0 0
le402 casing - Surface 0 0
l9402 casing - Surface 0 0
|491 wellhead Equipment 0 0
|9234 Insurance 0 0
|o273 water Disposal 0 0
9263 Supervision 0 0
%otal 0 0 0

CONFIDENTIAL



NAVE

RESOURCES, LLC

Daily Drilling Report

Well:  Travis #1-10 Report #: 3 Date: 19-Apr-23
Location: SENE 10-11S-45W AFE: 991 Daily $: 0
Rig: Duke Drilling Rig #9 KB: 4,381 Cum $: 0
Supv: Bruce Thomas/Tanner Nelson GL: 4,368 AFE $: 0
Next Planned . . . Material
Operation: Drill and set surface pipe Pipe Tally Transfer
From To Hrs:Min Detail Operations Report
7:00 AM [ 1:00 PM 6:00 Rigging up equipment.
MIRU Halde. Delivered 4 frac tanks & 1000 BBL water.
MIRU Skyline. Dug small trench & catch hole for mouse & rat hole. RDMO
MIRU JR Oilfield Services. Welded on flow tee on conductor pipe. RDMO
1:00 PM | 5:00 PM 4:00 MIRU OP Trucking, Delivered 640' 8 5/8" 24# surface pipe
5:00 PM [ 7:00 PM 2:00 Drilled rat hole and mouse hole
7:00 PM [ 9:00 PM 2:00 Spudded well. Drilled to 127'. Ongoing dust storm occurring.
9:00 PM | 10:00 PM 1:00 Shut down to make repairs to rig shaker. Sending too many wet cuttings
to closed loop system causing it to plug off.
10:00 PM | 11:58 PM 1:58 Rigging down closed loop system to bring in replacement shaker from
Clearwater.
12:01 AM | 7:00 AM 6:59 Waiting on replacement shaker and tank cleaning.
Total 23:57
Cost Estimate Daily$ Cum$ | AFES$ Comments
l9241 Mmobilization 0 0
|9356 Roads & Location 0 0
|o214 Damages 0 0
|9204 Bonds, Permits, Surveys 0 0
|9217 Drilling - Daywork 0 0
l9210 consulting Services 0 0
|9229 Geologic Services 0 0
|9208 Cementing & Services 0 0
|9243 Mud & Chemicals 0 0
l9213 contract Labor 0 0
lo290 water 0 0
l9230 Hauling 0 0
lo205 Bits 0 0
lo228 Fuel 0 0
lo257 Rental 0 0
|9253 Plugging & Abandonment 0 0
|9240 Miscellaneous & Contingencies 0 0
|9220 Drill Stem Testing 0 0
|9238 Logging - Open Hole 0 0
|9212 Coring / Sample Analysis 0 0
le402 casing - Surface 0 0
l9402 casing - Surface 0 0
|491 wellhead Equipment 0 0
|9234 Insurance 0 0
|o273 water Disposal 0 0
9263 Supervision 0 0
%otal 0 0 0

CONFIDENTIAL




NAVE

RESOURCES, LLC

Daily Drilling Report

Well:  Travis #1-10 Report #: 4 Date: 20-Apr-23
Location: SENE 10-11S-45W AFE: 991 Daily $: 0
Rig: Duke Drilling Rig #9 KB: 4,381 Cum $: 0
Supv: Bruce Thomas/Tanner Nelson GL: 4368 AFE $: 0
Next Pl_anned Running and cementing surface, WOC then drilling ahead Pipe Tally Material
Operation: Transfer
From To Hrs:Min Detail Operations Report
7:00 AM [ 9:30 AM 2:30 Waiting on shaker deck from Clear Water.
MIRU Rainbow Trucking to move equipment.
MIRU Halde. Hauling water to frac tanks.
9:30 AM | 11:30 AM 2:00 MIRU JR Services welder. Made modifications to flow line & mount for pump
11:30 AM | 5:00 PM 5:30 MIRU Triple H Trash Service. Delivered trash bin & covered with tarp.
5:00 PM [ 5:30 PM 0:30 Clear Water delivered shaker deck. Rainbow Trucking unloaded & spotted in
5:30 PM [ 6:30 PM 1:00 Crew hooked up new shaker deck.
6:30 PM | 10:00 PM 3:30 Back to drilling. Drilling ahead 127' to 460'. Survey @ 513' was 1 degree.
10:00 PM | 11:59 PM 1:59 Drilled into some clay gumbo. Plugged off flow line. Stopped to clean lines.
12:00 AM | 6:00 AM 6:00 Drilled to 660', TOOH with bit. Bit had column on clay stuck on top.
6:00 AM [ 7:00 AM 1:00 Preparing to run surface casing.
Total 23:59
Cost Estimate Daily$ Cum$ | AFES$ Comments
l9241 Mmobilization 0 0
|9356 Roads & Location 0 0
|o214 Damages 0 0
|9204 Bonds, Permits, Surveys 0 0
|9217 Drilling - Daywork 0 0
l9210 consulting Services 0 0
|9229 Geologic Services 0 0
|9208 Cementing & Services 0 0
|9243 Mud & Chemicals 0 0
l9213 contract Labor 0 0
lo290 water 0 0
l9230 Hauling 0 0
lo205 Bits 0 0
lo228 Fuel 0 0
lo257 Rental 0 0
|9253 Plugging & Abandonment 0 0
|9240 Miscellaneous & Contingencies 0 0
|9220 Drill Stem Testing 0 0
|9238 Logging - Open Hole 0 0
|9212 Coring / Sample Analysis 0 0
le402 casing - Surface 0 0
l9402 casing - Surface 0 0
|491 wellhead Equipment 0 0
|9234 Insurance 0 0
|o273 water Disposal 0 0
9263 Supervision 0 0
%otal 0 0 0

CONFIDENTIAL




NAVE

RESOURCES, LLC

Daily Drilling Report

Well:  Travis #1-10 Report #: 5 Date: 21-Apr-23
Location: SENE 10-11S-45W AFE: 991 Daily $: 0
Rig: Duke Drilling Rig #9 KB: 4,381 Cum $: 0
Supv: Bruce Thomas/Tanner Nelson GL: 4,368 AFE $: 0
Next Planned Material
Operation: Transfer
From To Hrs:Min Detail Operations Report
7:00 AM [ 8:15 AM 1:15 TIH 17 JTS 8 5/8" surface csg to 663' (kb). Centralizers on JT #1,5,9,13,16
8:15 AM [ 9:00 AM 0:45 Circulate hole
9:00 AM | 11:00 AM 2:00 MIRU and cement surface, cement did circulate. PSI plug to 1500, held.
11:00 AM | 7:00 PM 8:00 WOC
7:00 PM | 11:30 PM 4:30 NU BOP,
11:30 PM | 11:59 PM 0:29 Tested BOP, testing failed.
12:00 AM | 7:00 AM 7:00 Working on BOP, found broken accumulator, waiting on accumulator.
Total 23:59
Cost Estimate Daily$ Cum$ | AFES$ Comments
|9241 Mobilization 0 0
lo356 Roads & Location 0 0
|9214 Damages 0 0
|9204 Bonds, Permits, Surveys 0 0
|9217 Drilling - Daywork 0 0
lo210 consulting Services 0 0
l9229 Geologic Services 0 0
lo208 cementing & Services 0 0
|9243 Mud & Chemicals 0 0
l9213 contract Labor 0 0
lo290 water 0 0
l9230 Hauling 0 0
|9205 Bits 0 0
lo228 Fuel 0 0
|9257 Rental 0 0
|9253 Plugging & Abandonment 0 0
l9240 Mmiscellaneous & Contingencies 0 0
l9220 Drill Stem Testing 0 0
|9238 Logging - Open Hole 0 0
|9212 Coring / Sample Analysis 0 0
l9402 casing - Surface 0 0
lo402 casing - Surface 0 0
|9491 Wellhead Equipment 0 0
|9234 Insurance 0 0
|9273 water Disposal 0 0
9263 Supervision 0 0
%otal 0 0 0

CONFIDENTIAL




NAVE Daily Drilling Report

RESOURCES, LLC

Well:  Travis #1-10 Report #: 6 Date: 22-Apr-23
Location: SENE 10-11S-45W AFE: 991 Daily $: 0
Rig: Duke Drilling Rig #9 KB: 4,381 Cum $: 0
Supv: Bruce Thomas/Tanner Nelson GL: 4,368 AFE $: 0
Next Planned - - . Material
. Building LCM to heal loss then Drilling ahead Pipe Tally|= . -
Operation: g 9 Transfer
From To Hrs:Min Detail Operations Report

7:00 AM [ 11:59 AM 4:59 Waiting on BOP

11:59 AM | 1:00 PM 1:01 Test BOP

1:00 PM | 2:00 PM 1:00 Survey at 610' @ 4 (verified by Bruce, Tanner and pusher)

2:00 PM [ 4:00 PM 2:00 Drilled through shoe, now in open hole (86 rpm, WOB 1.5klb, ROP 60 FPH

4:00 PM | 9:15PM 5:15 Drill 660'-921'

9:15 PM [ 9:45 PM 0:30 Survey at 910' @ 3 1/2 (verified by Bruce, Tanner and pusher)

9:45 PM | 11:59 PM 2:14 Drilling 921' - 1280’

12:00 AM [ 3:30 AM 3:30 Drilling 921' - 1280’

3:30 AM | 4:45 AM 1:15 Condition mud for circulation loss. 300 bbl mud loss

4:45 AM | 5:45 AM 1:00 Wiper trip, bit to surface pipe

5:45 AM | 7:00 AM 1:15 Mix mud and raise LCM to 12#, drilling 1280' to 1330'

**Must report 300 bbl mud loss to COGCC on form 42 within 24 hours.**

(3:00 am, 1280', 300 bbl loss) are the needed report numbers.

Total 23:59
Cost Estimate Daily$ Cum$ | AFES$ Comments
l9241 Mmobilization 0 0
|9356 Roads & Location 0 0
|o214 Damages 0 0
|9204 Bonds, Permits, Surveys 0 0
|9217 Drilling - Daywork 0 0
l9210 consulting Services 0 0
|9229 Geologic Services 0 0
|9208 Cementing & Services 0 0
|9243 Mud & Chemicals 0 0
l9213 contract Labor 0 0
lo290 water 0 0
l9230 Hauling 0 0
lo205 Bits 0 0
lo228 Fuel 0 0
lo257 Rental 0 0
|9253 Plugging & Abandonment 0 0
|9240 Miscellaneous & Contingencies 0 0
|9220 Drill Stem Testing 0 0
|9238 Logging - Open Hole 0 0
|9212 Coring / Sample Analysis 0 0
le402 casing - Surface 0 0
l9402 casing - Surface 0 0
|491 wellhead Equipment 0 0
|9234 Insurance 0 0
|o273 water Disposal 0 0
9263 Supervision 0 0
%otal 0 0 0

CONFIDENTIAL




NAVE

RESOURCES, LLC

Daily Drilling Report

Well:  Travis #1-10 Report #: 7 Date: 23-Apr-23
Location: SENE 10-11S-45W AFE: 991 Daily $: 0
Rig: Duke Drilling Rig #9 KB: 4,381 Cum $: 0
Supv: Bruce Thomas/Tanner Nelson GL: 4,368 AFE $: 0
Next Planned . . Material
Operation: Cure cement patch and drill out Pipe Tally Transfer
From To Hrs:Min Detail Operations Report
7:00 AM [ 9:30 AM 2:30 Started drilling, continuing to see mud loss. Mixing mud to increase LCM
9:30 AM | 10:00 AM 0:30 Mixing mud, adding hulls, 24# LCM
10:00 AM | 10:45 AM 0:45 Drilling at 1349',
10:45 AM | 11:00 AM 0:15 Drilling to 1362' continuing to lose circulation. 640 bbl loss over next 15 min.
11:00 AM | 11:59 AM 0:59 Mixing mud to 24#, wiper trip to shoe
12:00 PM | 1:00 PM 1:00 Waiting on orders. Decision made to pump cement squeeze over formation
1:00 PM | 7:00 PM 6:00 WOC, survey @ 1362' - 3/4, TOOH
7:00 PM [ 8:20 PM 1:20 MIRU cementers, DP open-ended at 1251', pumped 400sx class A with 2%
CC, 1# tactical blitz and 1/3# felt LCM. RDMO cementers. TOOH
8:20 PM | 11:59 PM 3:39 Letting cement cure
12:00 AM | 1:30 AM 1:30 Letting cement cure. Run wire plumb and tag cement at 673' from surface
1:30 AM | 7:00 AM 5:30 Letting cement cure
**Must report 640 bbl mud loss to COGCC on form 42 within 24 hours.**
(11:00 am, 1362', 640 bbl loss)
Total 23:58
Cost Estimate Daily$ Cum$ | AFES$ Comments
l9241 Mmobilization 0 0
|9356 Roads & Location 0 0
|o214 Damages 0 0
|9204 Bonds, Permits, Surveys 0 0
|9217 Drilling - Daywork 0 0
l9210 consulting Services 0 0
|9229 Geologic Services 0 0
|9208 Cementing & Services 0 0
|9243 Mud & Chemicals 0 0
l9213 contract Labor 0 0
lo290 water 0 0
l9230 Hauling 0 0
lo205 Bits 0 0
lo228 Fuel 0 0
lo257 Rental 0 0
|9253 Plugging & Abandonment 0 0
|9240 Miscellaneous & Contingencies 0 0
|9220 Drill Stem Testing 0 0
|9238 Logging - Open Hole 0 0
|9212 Coring / Sample Analysis 0 0
le402 casing - Surface 0 0
l9402 casing - Surface 0 0
|491 wellhead Equipment 0 0
|9234 Insurance 0 0
|o273 water Disposal 0 0
9263 Supervision 0 0
%otal 0 0 0

CONFIDENTIAL




NAVE

RESOURCES, LLC

Daily Drilling Report

Well:

Travis #1-10

Location: SENE 10-11S-45W

Rig:

Duke Drilling Rig #9

Supv:

Next Planned
Operation:

From To

Hrs:Min

Bruce Thomas/Tanner Nelson

Report #: 8

AFE: 991

KB: 4,381

GL: 4,368

Started losing circulation again, planning next steps.

Date:

24-Apr-23

Daily $:

0

Cum $:

0

AFE $:

Pipe Tally

Detail Operations Report

0

Material
Transfer

7:00 AM

9:00 AM 2:00

WOC

9:00 AM

1:00 PM 4:00

TIH with bit to 700', ream at 700' to 900' & TOH to surface.

1:00 PM

9:45 PM 8:45

WOC

9:45 PM

10:00 PM 0:15

TIH with bit

10:00 PM

11:59 PM 1:59

Ream stands

12:00 AM

3:30 AM 3:30

Ream stands

3:30 AM

7:00 AM 3:30

Tagged solid cement at 1268'. Drilled cement from 1268’ to 1362'.

Survey @ 1362' - 3/4

23:59
Cost Estimate

Total

Daily$ | Cum$

AFE $

Comments

lo241

Mobilization

o

o

|o3se

Roads & Location

lo214

Damages

|9204

Bonds, Permits, Surveys

lo217

Drilling - Daywork

lo210

Consulting Services

lo229

Geologic Services

|o208

Cementing & Services

lo243

Mud & Chemicals

lo213

Contract Labor

lo290

Water

l9230

Hauling

lo205

Bits

|o228

Fuel

|o2s7

Rental

|o253

Plugging & Abandonment

lo240

Miscellaneous & Contingencies

lo220

Drill Stem Testing

lo238

Logging - Open Hole

lo212

Coring / Sample Analysis

|o402

Casing - Surface

|oa02

Casing - Surface

Jo491

Wellhead Equipment

|o234

Insurance

lo273

Water Disposal

Supervision

9263
Total

OO OO0 0000000000000 00O0OO0o0o0o0o

OO0 OO0 0000000000000 0O0O o000 O0O

CONFIDENTIAL




NAVE

RESOURCES, LLC

Daily Drilling Report

Well:  Travis #1-10 Report #: 9 Date: 25-Apr-23
Location: SENE 10-11S-45W AFE: 991 Daily $: 0
Rig: Duke Drilling Rig #9 KB: 4,381 Cum $: 0
Supv: Bruce Thomas/Tanner Nelson GL: 4,368 AFE $: 0
Next Planned . . Material
Operation: Drilling ahead Pipe Tally Transfer

From To Hrs:Min Detail Operations Report

7:00 AM [ 8:30 AM 1:30 Drilling 1362' to 1387'. Appx 90 bbl mud loss @ 1387'.

8:30 AM [ 11:59 AM 3:29 TOOH to surface shoe, mix mud

12:00 PM | 1:00 PM 1:00 TIH, break circulation

1:00 PM | 7:30 PM 6:30 Drilling 1387' to 1456'

7:30 PM [ 8:00 PM 0:30 Work on flowline

8:00 PM [ 11:00 PM 3:00 Mix mud and raise LCM to 28#

11:00 PM | 11:59 PM 0:59 Drilling 1456' to 1540'. Appx 55 bbl mud loss @ 1487'.

12:00 AM | 7:00 AM 7:00 Drilling 1540' to 1810’

Total 23:58
Cost Estimate Daily$ Cum$ | AFES$ Comments

l9241 Mmobilization 0 0
|9356 Roads & Location 0 0
|o214 Damages 0 0
|9204 Bonds, Permits, Surveys 0 0
|9217 Drilling - Daywork 0 0
l9210 consulting Services 0 0
|9229 Geologic Services 0 0
|9208 Cementing & Services 0 0
|9243 Mud & Chemicals 0 0
l9213 contract Labor 0 0
lo290 water 0 0
l9230 Hauling 0 0
lo205 Bits 0 0
lo228 Fuel 0 0
lo257 Rental 0 0
|9253 Plugging & Abandonment 0 0
|9240 Miscellaneous & Contingencies 0 0
|9220 Drill Stem Testing 0 0
|9238 Logging - Open Hole 0 0
|9212 Coring / Sample Analysis 0 0
le402 casing - Surface 0 0
l9402 casing - Surface 0 0
|491 wellhead Equipment 0 0
|9234 Insurance 0 0
|o273 water Disposal 0 0

9263 Supervision 0 0
%otal 0 0 0

CONFIDENTIAL




NAVE

RESOURCES, LLC

Daily Workover Report

Well:

Travis #1-10

L

ocation: SENE 10-11S-45W

Rig:

Duke Drilling Rig #9

S

Next Planned
Operation:

upv:

From To Hrs:Min

Bruce Thomas/Tanner Nelson

Report #: 10

AFE: 991

KB: 4,381

GL: 4,368

Clean mud tanks then drilling ahead

Date: 26-Apr-23

Daily $: 0

Cum $: 0

AFE $: 0

Material
Transfer

Detail Operations Report

7:00 AM

10:30 AM 3:30

Drilling 1810' to 1865', survey @ 1865' - 1/4 degree

10:30 AM

2:30 PM 4:00

Drilling 1865' to 2300

2:30 PM

11:59 PM 9:29

Drilling to 2300', survey @ 2368' - 1/2 degree

12:00 AM

7:00 AM 7:00

Drilling to 2300’ to 2622

23:59
Cost Estimate

Total

Daily$  Cum $

AFE $

Comments

|9241 Mobilization

o

o

|9356 Roads & Location

|9214 Damages

|9204 Bonds, Permits, Surveys

|9217 Drilling - Daywork

|921 0 Consulting Services

|9229 Geologic Services

|9208 Cementing & Services

|9243 Mud & Chemicals

|921 3 Contract Labor

lo290 water

l9230 Hauling

|9205 Bits

lo228 Fuel

|9257 Rental

|9253 Plugging & Abandonment

|9240 Miscellaneous & Contingencies

l9220 Drill Stem Testing

|9238 Logging - Open Hole

|9212 Coring / Sample Analysis

|9402 Casing - Surface

|9402 Casing - Surface

|9491 Wellhead Equipment

|9234 Insurance

|9273 Water Disposal

otal

FZGS Supervision
T

OO0 00 0000000000000 00O0O00o0Ooo

OO0 0000000000000 00000O0O000O0O

CONFIDENTIAL




NAVE

Daily Workover Report
RESOURCES,LLC
Well:  Travis #1-10 Report #: 11 Date: 27-Apr-23
Location: SENE 10-11S-45W AFE: 991 Daily $: 0
Rig: Duke Drilling Rig #9 KB: 4,381 Cum $: 0
Supv: Bruce Thomas/Tanner Nelson GL: 4,368 AFE $: 0
Next Planned . . Material
. Drilling ahead Pipe Tally|= . -
Operation: g Transfer
From To Hrs:Min Detail Operations Report

7:00 AM [ 2:00 PM 7:00 Drilling 2622' and POOH, reduce mud weight & clean pits.

2:00 PM [ 3:00 PM 1:00 TIH wibit to 2622' and begin drilling

3:00 PM | 8:30 PM 5:30 Drilling 2622' to 2906'

8:30 PM [ 9:30 PM 1:00 Survey @ 2906' - 0 degrees

9:30 PM | 11:59 PM 2:29 Drilling to 3110’

12:00 AM | 7:00 AM 7:00 Drilling to 3250'

Total 23:59
Cost Estimate Daily$ Cum$ | AFES$ Comments
l9241 Mmobilization 0 0
|9356 Roads & Location 0 0
|o214 Damages 0 0
|9204 Bonds, Permits, Surveys 0 0
|9217 Drilling - Daywork 0 0
l9210 consulting Services 0 0
|9229 Geologic Services 0 0
|9208 Cementing & Services 0 0
|9243 Mud & Chemicals 0 0
l9213 contract Labor 0 0
lo290 water 0 0
l9230 Hauling 0 0
lo205 Bits 0 0
lo228 Fuel 0 0
lo257 Rental 0 0
|9253 Plugging & Abandonment 0 0
|9240 Miscellaneous & Contingencies 0 0
|9220 Drill Stem Testing 0 0
|9238 Logging - Open Hole 0 0
|9212 Coring / Sample Analysis 0 0
le402 casing - Surface 0 0
l9402 casing - Surface 0 0
|491 wellhead Equipment 0 0
|9234 Insurance 0 0
|o273 water Disposal 0 0
9263 Supervision 0 0
%otal 0 0 0

CONFIDENTIAL




NAVE

Daily Workover Report

RESOURCES,LLC

Well:  Travis #1-10 Report #: 12 Date: 28-Apr-23
Location: SENE 10-11S-45W AFE: 991 Daily $: 0
Rig: Duke Drilling Rig #9 KB: 4,381 Cum $: 0
Supv: Bruce Thomas/Tanner Nelson GL: 4,368 AFE $: 0
Next Planned . . Material
Operation: Mud up and drill ahead Pipe Tally Transfer

From To Hrs:Min Detail Operations Report

7:00 AM [ 11:45 AM 4:45 Drilling 3250' to 3275' and repair generator

11:45 AM | 2:30 PM 2:45 Drilling 3275' to 3345' and change liner on mud pump

2:30 PM | 5:15 PM 2:45 Drilling 3345' to 3377', repair mud pump and survey at 3377' - 1 degree

5:15 PM | 11:59 PM 6:44 Drilling 3377' to 3800’

12:00 AM | 2:45 AM 2:45 Circulate hole

2:45 AM [ 7:00 AM 4:15 TOOH to surface shoe, clean mud pits to prep for displacement

Total 23:59
Cost Estimate Daily$ Cum$ | AFES$ Comments

l9241 Mmobilization 0 0
|9356 Roads & Location 0 0
|o214 Damages 0 0
|9204 Bonds, Permits, Surveys 0 0
|9217 Drilling - Daywork 0 0
l9210 consulting Services 0 0
|9229 Geologic Services 0 0
|9208 Cementing & Services 0 0
|9243 Mud & Chemicals 0 0
l9213 contract Labor 0 0
lo290 water 0 0
l9230 Hauling 0 0
lo205 Bits 0 0
lo228 Fuel 0 0
lo257 Rental 0 0
|9253 Plugging & Abandonment 0 0
|9240 Miscellaneous & Contingencies 0 0
|9220 Drill Stem Testing 0 0
|9238 Logging - Open Hole 0 0
|9212 Coring / Sample Analysis 0 0
le402 casing - Surface 0 0
l9402 casing - Surface 0 0
|491 wellhead Equipment 0 0
|9234 Insurance 0 0
|o273 water Disposal 0 0

9263 Supervision 0 0
%otal 0 0 0

CONFIDENTIAL




NAVE

Daily Workover Report

RESOURCES,LLC

Well:  Travis #1-10 Report #: 13 Date: 29-Apr-23
Location: SENE 10-11S-45W AFE: 991 Daily $: 0
Rig: Duke Drilling Rig #9 KB: 4,381 Cum $: 0
Supv: Bruce Thomas/Tanner Nelson GL: 4,368 AFE $: 0
Next Planned . . Material
Operation: Drilling ahead Pipe Tally Transfer

From To Hrs:Min Detail Operations Report

7:00 AM [ 1:00 PM 6:00 Clean pits and build mud

1:00 PM | 2:15PM 1:15 Strap in hole with bit

2:15PM [ 3:00 PM 0:45 Ream 3700' to 3800’

3:00 PM [ 4:00 PM 1:00 Displace mud

4:00 PM | 5:00 PM 1:00 Drill 3800' to 3883’

5:00 PM [ 5:45PM 0:45 Survey at 3883' 1 1/4 degree

5:45PM [ 11:59 PM 6:14 Drill 3883' to 4350’

12:00 AM | 1:30 AM 1:30 Drill 4350' to 4387'. Survey at 1 3/4 degree

1:30 AM | 7:00 AM 5:30 Drill 4387' to 4620’

Total 23:59
Cost Estimate Daily$ Cum$ | AFES$ Comments

l9241 Mmobilization 0 0
|9356 Roads & Location 0 0
|o214 Damages 0 0
|9204 Bonds, Permits, Surveys 0 0
|9217 Drilling - Daywork 0 0
l9210 consulting Services 0 0
|9229 Geologic Services 0 0
|9208 Cementing & Services 0 0
|9243 Mud & Chemicals 0 0
l9213 contract Labor 0 0
lo290 water 0 0
l9230 Hauling 0 0
lo205 Bits 0 0
lo228 Fuel 0 0
lo257 Rental 0 0
|9253 Plugging & Abandonment 0 0
|9240 Miscellaneous & Contingencies 0 0
|9220 Drill Stem Testing 0 0
|9238 Logging - Open Hole 0 0
|9212 Coring / Sample Analysis 0 0
le402 casing - Surface 0 0
l9402 casing - Surface 0 0
|491 wellhead Equipment 0 0
|9234 Insurance 0 0
|o273 water Disposal 0 0

9263 Supervision 0 0
%otal 0 0 0

CONFIDENTIAL




NAVE

Daily Workover Report

RESOURCES,LLC

Well:  Travis #1-10 Report #: 14 Date: 30-Apr-23
Location: SENE 10-11S-45W AFE: 991 Daily $: 0
Rig: Duke Drilling Rig #9 KB: 4,381 Cum $: 0
Supv: Bruce Thomas/Tanner Nelson GL: 4,368 AFE $: 0
Next Planned Pine Tally|Material
Operation: —oe SN Transfer

From To Hrs:Min Detail Operations Report

7:00 AM [ 3:00 PM 8:00 Drill 4620' to 4892’

3:00 PM [ 3:45PM 0:45 Survey @ 4892' - 1 1/2 degree

3:45PM | 6:15 PM 2:30 Drill 4892' to 4976'

6:15 PM [ 6:45 PM 0:30 Circulate for samples

6:45 PM | 11:59 PM 5:14 Drill 4976' to 5160’

12:00 AM | 7:00 AM 7:00 Drill 5160' to 5330’

**4980' to 5000' lost 115 bbls mud between 7:00-7:30 pm on 4/30/23**
Total 23:59
Cost Estimate Daily$ Cum$ | AFES$ Comments

l9241 Mmobilization 0 0
|9356 Roads & Location 0 0
|o214 Damages 0 0
|9204 Bonds, Permits, Surveys 0 0
|9217 Drilling - Daywork 0 0
l9210 consulting Services 0 0
|9229 Geologic Services 0 0
|9208 Cementing & Services 0 0
|9243 Mud & Chemicals 0 0
l9213 contract Labor 0 0
lo290 water 0 0
l9230 Hauling 0 0
lo205 Bits 0 0
lo228 Fuel 0 0
lo257 Rental 0 0
|9253 Plugging & Abandonment 0 0
|9240 Miscellaneous & Contingencies 0 0
|9220 Drill Stem Testing 0 0
|9238 Logging - Open Hole 0 0
|9212 Coring / Sample Analysis 0 0
le402 casing - Surface 0 0
l9402 casing - Surface 0 0
|491 wellhead Equipment 0 0
|9234 Insurance 0 0
|o273 water Disposal 0 0

9263 Supervision 0 0
%otal 0 0 0

CONFIDENTIAL




NAVE

Daily Workover Report

RESOURCES,LLC

Well:  Travis #1-10 Report #: 15 Date: 1-May-23
Location: SENE 10-11S-45W AFE: 991 Daily $: 0
Rig: Duke Drilling Rig #9 KB: 4,381 Cum $: 0
Supv: Bruce Thomas/Tanner Nelson GL: 4,368 AFE $: 0
Next Planned . Material
Operation: DST#1 Pipe Tally Transfer

From To Hrs:Min Detail Operations Report

7:00 AM [ 9:00 AM 2:00 Drill 5330' to 5390’

9:00 AM | 10:00 AM 1:00 Survey @ 5390' - 1 1/2 degree

10:00 AM | 2:30 PM 4:30 Drill 5390' to 5482’

2:30 PM [ 3:45PM 1:15 Circulate for samples

3:45PM [ 4:00 PM 0:15 Drill 5482' to 5488'

4:00 PM | 5:15PM 1:15 Circulate for samples

5:15 PM [ 8:00 PM 2:45 Wiper trip to shoe

8:00 PM | 11:00 PM 3:00 Waiting on orders

11:00 PM | 11:59 PM 0:59 Finish TOOH

12:00 AM | 1:00 AM 1:00 Waiting on orders

1:00 AM | 4:45 AM 3:45 Trip in hole with bit, break circulation and ream hole

4:45 AM | 5:45 AM 1:00 Circulate hole on bottom

5:45 AM [ 7:00 AM 1:15 TOOH to rig up for DST #1

Total 23:59
Cost Estimate Daily$ Cum$ | AFES$ Comments

l9241 Mmobilization 0 0
|9356 Roads & Location 0 0
|o214 Damages 0 0
|9204 Bonds, Permits, Surveys 0 0
|9217 Drilling - Daywork 0 0
l9210 consulting Services 0 0
|9229 Geologic Services 0 0
|9208 Cementing & Services 0 0
|9243 Mud & Chemicals 0 0
l9213 contract Labor 0 0
lo290 water 0 0
l9230 Hauling 0 0
lo205 Bits 0 0
lo228 Fuel 0 0
lo257 Rental 0 0
|9253 Plugging & Abandonment 0 0
|9240 Miscellaneous & Contingencies 0 0
|9220 Drill Stem Testing 0 0
|9238 Logging - Open Hole 0 0
|9212 Coring / Sample Analysis 0 0
le402 casing - Surface 0 0
l9402 casing - Surface 0 0
|491 wellhead Equipment 0 0
|9234 Insurance 0 0
|o273 water Disposal 0 0

9263 Supervision 0 0
%otal 0 0 0

CONFIDENTIAL




NAVE

Daily Workover Report

RESOURCES,LLC

Well:  Travis #1-10 Report #: 16 Date: 2-May-23
Location: SENE 10-11S-45W AFE: 991 Daily $: 0
Rig: Duke Drilling Rig #9 KB: 4,381 Cum $: 0
Supv: Bruce Thomas/Tanner Nelson GL: 4,368 AFE $: 0
Next Planned . . Material
Operation: Drilling ahead Pipe Tally Transfer

From To Hrs:Min Detail Operations Report

7:00 AM [ 8:45 AM 1:45 TOH for DST #1 (Spergen)

8:45 AM [ 9:30 AM 0:45 Pick up DST tools

9:30 AM [ 11:15 AM 1:45 TIH with DST

11:15 AM | 4:45 PM 5:30 Testing

4:45PM | 7:15PM 2:30 TOH with DST tools

7:15PM [ 7:45 PM 0:30 Lay down DST tools

7:45 PM | 11:00 PM 3:15 TIH wibit, break circulation @ 4000'

11:00 PM | 11:30 PM 0:30 Circulate on bottom

11:30 PM | 11:59 PM 0:29 Drilling from 5488' to 5529'

12:00 AM | 2:45 AM 2:45 Lost circulation @ 5529', raised LCM to 20#. 20 bbl loss

2:45 AM | 3:45 AM 1:00 Circulated for samples

3:45 AM [ 5:30 AM 1:45 Drilling from 5529' to 5600'

5:30 AM [ 6:45 AM 1:15 Circulated for samples

6:45 AM [ 7:00 AM 0:15 Drilling from 5600' to 5610'

DST #1 in Spergen from 5450' to 5488’
Total 23:59
Cost Estimate Daily$ Cum$ | AFES$ Comments

l9241 Mmobilization 0 0
|9356 Roads & Location 0 0
|o214 Damages 0 0
|9204 Bonds, Permits, Surveys 0 0
|9217 Drilling - Daywork 0 0
l9210 consulting Services 0 0
|9229 Geologic Services 0 0
|9208 Cementing & Services 0 0
|9243 Mud & Chemicals 0 0
l9213 contract Labor 0 0
lo290 water 0 0
l9230 Hauling 0 0
lo205 Bits 0 0
lo228 Fuel 0 0
lo257 Rental 0 0
|9253 Plugging & Abandonment 0 0
|9240 Miscellaneous & Contingencies 0 0
|9220 Drill Stem Testing 0 0
|9238 Logging - Open Hole 0 0
|9212 Coring / Sample Analysis 0 0
le402 casing - Surface 0 0
l9402 casing - Surface 0 0
|491 wellhead Equipment 0 0
|9234 Insurance 0 0
|o273 water Disposal 0 0

9263 Supervision 0 0
%otal 0 0 0

CONFIDENTIAL




NAVE

Daily Workover Report

RESOURCES,LLC

Well:  Travis #1-10 Report #: 17 Date: 3-May-23
Location: SENE 10-11S-45W AFE: 991 Daily $: 0
Rig: Duke Drilling Rig #9 KB: 4,381 Cum $: 0
Supv: Bruce Thomas/Tanner Nelson GL: 4,368 AFE $: 0
Next Planned . . Material
Operation: Drilling ahead Pipe Tally Transfer

From To Hrs:Min Detail Operations Report

7:00 AM [ 8:15 AM 1:15 Drill from 5610' to 5797'

8:15 AM [ 9:15 AM 1:00 Circulate from bottom

9:15 AM | 11:59 PM 14:44 Survey @ 5797' - 1 1/4 degree. TOH with degraded PDC bit

12:00 AM | 4:30 AM 4:30 TIH with7 7/8" GR517G (SN 7124) button bit and break circulation

4:30 AM | 7:00 AM 2:30 Drill from 5797' to 5830’

Total 23:59
Cost Estimate Daily$ Cum$ | AFES$ Comments

l9241 Mmobilization 0 0
|9356 Roads & Location 0 0
|o214 Damages 0 0
|9204 Bonds, Permits, Surveys 0 0
|9217 Drilling - Daywork 0 0
l9210 consulting Services 0 0
|9229 Geologic Services 0 0
|9208 Cementing & Services 0 0
|9243 Mud & Chemicals 0 0
l9213 contract Labor 0 0
lo290 water 0 0
l9230 Hauling 0 0
lo205 Bits 0 0
lo228 Fuel 0 0
lo257 Rental 0 0
|9253 Plugging & Abandonment 0 0
|9240 Miscellaneous & Contingencies 0 0
|9220 Drill Stem Testing 0 0
|9238 Logging - Open Hole 0 0
|9212 Coring / Sample Analysis 0 0
le402 casing - Surface 0 0
l9402 casing - Surface 0 0
|491 wellhead Equipment 0 0
|9234 Insurance 0 0
|o273 water Disposal 0 0

9263 Supervision 0 0
%otal 0 0 0

CONFIDENTIAL




NAVE

Daily Workover Report

RESOURCES,LLC

Well:  Travis #1-10 Report #: 18 Date: 4-May-23
Location: SENE 10-11S-45W AFE: 991 Daily $: 0
Rig: Duke Drilling Rig #9 KB: 4,381 Cum $: 0
Supv: Bruce Thomas/Tanner Nelson GL: 4,368 AFE $: 0
Next Planned Log well Pine Tally|Material
Operation: 9 —oe SN Transfer

From To Hrs:Min Detail Operations Report

7:00 AM [ 9:45 PM 14:45 Drill 5830' to 6069’

9:45 PM | 11:00 PM 1:15 Circulate to clean hole

11:00 PM | 11:59 PM 0:59 Wiper trip to surface

12:00 AM | 3:30 AM 3:30 Wiper trip and break circulation at 2000', 4000' and on bottom.

3:30 AM [ 6:00 AM 2:30 Circulate on bottom

6:00 AM [ 7:00 AM 1:00 Drop survey and TOOH for logging.

Rig TD @ 6069' at 7:45 pm CST on 5.4.23
Total 23:59
Cost Estimate Daily$ Cum$ | AFES$ Comments

l9241 Mmobilization 0 0
|9356 Roads & Location 0 0
|o214 Damages 0 0
|9204 Bonds, Permits, Surveys 0 0
|9217 Drilling - Daywork 0 0
l9210 consulting Services 0 0
|9229 Geologic Services 0 0
|9208 Cementing & Services 0 0
|9243 Mud & Chemicals 0 0
l9213 contract Labor 0 0
lo290 water 0 0
l9230 Hauling 0 0
lo205 Bits 0 0
lo228 Fuel 0 0
lo257 Rental 0 0
|9253 Plugging & Abandonment 0 0
|9240 Miscellaneous & Contingencies 0 0
|9220 Drill Stem Testing 0 0
|9238 Logging - Open Hole 0 0
|9212 Coring / Sample Analysis 0 0
le402 casing - Surface 0 0
l9402 casing - Surface 0 0
|491 wellhead Equipment 0 0
|9234 Insurance 0 0
|o273 water Disposal 0 0

9263 Supervision 0 0
%otal 0 0 0

CONFIDENTIAL




NAVE

Daily Workover Report

RESOURCES,LLC

Well:  Travis #1-10 Report #: 19 Date: 5-May-23
Location: SENE 10-11S-45W AFE: 991 Daily $: 0
Rig: Duke Drilling Rig #9 KB: 4,381 Cum $: 0
Supv: Bruce Thomas/Tanner Nelson GL: 4,368 AFE $: 0
Next Planned i . Material
Operation: Waiting on orders Pipe Tally Transfer

From To Hrs:Min Detail Operations Report

7:00 AM [ 8:45 AM 1:45 TOOH for logs. Survey at 6069' - 1 1/2 degree

8:45 AM [ 6:00 PM 9:15 Rig up logging truck and run logs

6:00 PM [ 6:30 PM 0:30 TIH with drill collars

6:30 PM | 11:59 PM 5:29 Waiting on orders

12:00 AM | 3:30 AM 3:30 TIH with drill pipe and break circulation at 3000’

3:30 AM [ 7:00 AM 3:30 Circulate on bottom and wait on orders

RTD @ 6069' at 8:45 am on 5.4.23
LTD @ 6068' at 12 pm on 5.5.23
Total 23:59
Cost Estimate Daily$ Cum$ | AFES$ Comments

l9241 Mmobilization 0 0
|9356 Roads & Location 0 0
|o214 Damages 0 0
|9204 Bonds, Permits, Surveys 0 0
|9217 Drilling - Daywork 0 0
l9210 consulting Services 0 0
|9229 Geologic Services 0 0
|9208 Cementing & Services 0 0
|9243 Mud & Chemicals 0 0
l9213 contract Labor 0 0
lo290 water 0 0
l9230 Hauling 0 0
lo205 Bits 0 0
lo228 Fuel 0 0
lo257 Rental 0 0
|9253 Plugging & Abandonment 0 0
|9240 Miscellaneous & Contingencies 0 0
|9220 Drill Stem Testing 0 0
|9238 Logging - Open Hole 0 0
|9212 Coring / Sample Analysis 0 0
le402 casing - Surface 0 0
l9402 casing - Surface 0 0
|491 wellhead Equipment 0 0
|9234 Insurance 0 0
|o273 water Disposal 0 0

9263 Supervision 0 0
%otal 0 0 0

CONFIDENTIAL




NAVE Daily Workover Report

RESOURCES, LLC

Well:  Travis #1-10 Report #: 20 Date: 6-May-23
Location: SENE 10-11S-45W AFE: 991 Daily $: 0
Rig: Duke Drilling Rig #9 KB: 4,381 Cum $: 0
Supv: Bruce Thomas/Tanner Nelson GL: 4,368 AFE $: 0
Next Planned . Material

R RDMO Pipe Tally|—
Operation: Transfer

From To Hrs:Min Detail Operations Report

7:00 AM [ 11:30 AM 4:30 CIRCULATE WAIT F/ ORDERS @ 5939

11:30 AM | 12:00 PM 0:30 TRIP LAY DOWN 14 JOINTS TO 5500

12:00 PM | 3:00 PM 3:00 CIRCULATE @ 5500 WAIT F/ CEMENT

3:00 PM [ 5:30 PM 2:30 WAITING FOR CEMENTERS

5:30 PM [ 11:59 PM 6:29 SPOTTED PLUGS AS FOLLOWS:

5488' 40 sx @ Spergen

5288' 40 sx @ Morrow

4412' 40 sx @ Shawnee

2760' 50 sx @ Cheyenne Base

2574' 50 sx @ Cheyenne Top

2285' 50 sx @ Dakota

1300' 50 sx @ Niobrara

710" 50 sx @ shoe

Surface Pipe - 20 sx to top off. 20 sx mouse and rat holes.

12:00 AM | 3:00 AM 3:00 Nipple down BOP and clean pits

3:00 AM [ 7:00 AM 4:00 Rig down.

Plug down @ 12:00 pm on 5/6/23

Rig release @ 2:00 am on 5/7/23

Total 23:59
Cost Estimate Daily$ Cum$ | AFES$ Comments
l9241 Mmobilization 0 0
|9356 Roads & Location 0 0
|o214 Damages 0 0
|9204 Bonds, Permits, Surveys 0 0
|9217 Drilling - Daywork 0 0
l9210 consulting Services 0 0
|9229 Geologic Services 0 0
|9208 Cementing & Services 0 0
|9243 Mud & Chemicals 0 0
l9213 contract Labor 0 0
lo290 water 0 0
l9230 Hauling 0 0
lo205 Bits 0 0
lo228 Fuel 0 0
lo257 Rental 0 0
|9253 Plugging & Abandonment 0 0
|9240 Miscellaneous & Contingencies 0 0
|9220 Drill Stem Testing 0 0
|9238 Logging - Open Hole 0 0
|9212 Coring / Sample Analysis 0 0
le402 casing - Surface 0 0
l9402 casing - Surface 0 0
|491 wellhead Equipment 0 0
|9234 Insurance 0 0
|o273 water Disposal 0 0
9263 Supervision 0 0
%otal 0 0 0

CONFIDENTIAL




Date: April 21, 2023
Lease and Well#: Travis #1-10 Run
Surface Casing O.D. 8.625 Weight: 24 KB Correction: 14.00 Total Joints: 17
Surface Casing I.D. 8.097 Sub assembly 0.00 Grade: J-55 Pipe Capacity / bbls: ~ 40.88
In Depth In Depth In Depth In Depth
1 37.85 51.85 | 51 655.92 | 101 655.92 | 151 655.92
2 37.52 89.37 | 52 655.92 | 102 655.92 | 152 655.92
3 37.82 12719 | 53 655.92 | 103 655.92 | 153 655.92
4 37.85 165.04 | 54 655.92 | 104 655.92 | 154 655.92
5 37.82 202.86 | 55 655.92 | 105 655.92 | 155 655.92
6 37.82 240.68 | 56 655.92 | 106 655.92 | 156 655.92
7 37.84 278.52 | 57 655.92 | 107 655.92 | 157 655.92
8 37.85 316.37 | 58 655.92 | 108 655.92 | 158 655.92
9 37.80 354.17 | 59 655.92 | 109 655.92 | 159 655.92
10 37.30 39147 | 60 655.92 | 110 655.92 | 160 655.92
1 37.85 429.32 | 61 655.92 | 111 655.92 | 161 655.92
12 37.78 467.10 | 62 655.92 | 112 655.92 | 162 655.92
13 37.82 504.92 | 63 655.92 | 113 655.92 | 163 655.92
14 37.80 542,72 | 64 655.92 | 114 655.92 | 164 655.92
15 37.55 580.27 | 65 655.92 | 115 655.92 | 165 655.92
16 37.80 618.07 | 66 655.92 | 116 655.92 | 166 655.92
17 37.85 655.92 | 67 655.92 | 117 655.92 | 167 655.92
18 655.92 | 68 655.92 | 118 655.92 | 168 655.92
19 655.92 | 69 655.92 | 119 655.92 | 169 655.92
20 655.92 | 70 655.92 | 120 655.92 | 170 655.92
21 655.92 | 71 655.92 | 121 655.92 | 171 655.92
22 655.92 | 72 655.92 | 122 655.92 | 172 655.92
23 655.92 | 73 655.92 | 123 655.92 | 173 655.92
24 655.92 | 74 655.92 | 124 655.92 | 174 655.92
25 655.92 | 75 655.92 | 125 655.92 | 175 655.92
26 655.92 | 76 655.92 | 126 655.92 | 176 655.92
27 655.92 | 77 655.92 | 127 655.92 | 177 655.92
28 655.92 | 78 655.92 | 128 655.92 | 178 655.92
29 655.92 | 79 655.92 | 129 655.92 | 179 655.92
30 655.92 | 80 655.92 | 130 655.92 | 180 655.92
31 655.92 | 81 655.92 | 131 655.92 | 181 655.92
32 655.92 | 82 655.92 | 132 655.92 | 182 655.92
33 655.92 | 83 655.92 | 133 655.92 | 183 655.92
34 655.92 | 84 655.92 | 134 655.92 | 184 655.92
35 655.92 | 85 655.92 | 135 655.92 | 185 655.92
36 655.92 | 86 655.92 | 136 655.92 | 186 655.92
37 655.92 | 87 655.92 | 137 655.92 | 187 655.92
38 655.92 | 88 655.92 | 138 655.92 | 188 655.92
39 655.92 | 89 655.92 | 139 655.92 | 189 655.92
40 655.92 | 90 655.92 | 140 655.92 | 190 655.92
41 655.92 | 91 655.92 | 141 655.92 | 191 655.92
42 655.92 | 92 655.92 | 142 655.92 | 192 655.92
43 655.92 | 93 655.92 | 143 655.92 | 193 655.92
44 655.92 | 94 655.92 | 144 655.92 | 194 655.92
45 655.92 | 95 655.92 | 145 655.92 | 195 655.92
46 655.92 | 96 655.92 | 146 655.92 | 196 655.92
47 655.92 | 97 655.92 | 147 655.92 | 197 655.92
48 655.92 | 98 655.92 | 148 655.92 | 198 655.92
49 655.92 | 99 655.92 | 149 655.92 | 199 655.92
50 655.92 | 100 655.92 | 150 655.92 | 200 655.92
641.92 0.00 0.00 0.00
Down hole Tool Assembly Tubing sub total length 0.00 Tubing Weight 15,406
Total Joints 17 Average Joint 37.76
Total Footage Page 1 641.92
Total Footage Page 2 0.00 Total Pipe & Subs 641.92
Total Footage Page 3 0.00
0.00 Total Footage Page 4 0.00 Total Pipe, Subs (KB) 695.92
Total Tools 0.00 Total Footage 641.92 Total Tools KB & Tbg. 655.92




Date:

Lease and Well#: Travis #1-10 Run
Production Casing O.D. 51/2 Weight: 15.5 KB Correction: 13.00 Total Joints: 0
Production Casing I.D.  4.494 Sub assembly 0.00 Grade: J-55 Pipe Capacity / bbls: 0.00
In Depth In Depth In Depth In Depth
1 13.00 | 51 13.00 | 101 13.00 | 151 13.00
2 13.00 | 52 13.00 | 102 13.00 | 152 13.00
3 13.00 | 53 13.00 | 103 13.00 | 153 13.00
4 13.00 | 54 13.00 | 104 13.00 | 154 13.00
5 13.00 | 55 13.00 | 105 13.00 | 155 13.00
6 13.00 | 56 13.00 | 106 13.00 | 156 13.00
7 13.00 | 57 13.00 | 107 13.00 | 157 13.00
8 13.00 | 58 13.00 | 108 13.00 | 158 13.00
9 13.00 | 59 13.00 | 109 13.00 | 159 13.00
10 13.00 | 60 13.00 | 110 13.00 | 160 13.00
1 13.00 | 61 13.00 | 111 13.00 | 161 13.00
12 13.00 | 62 13.00 | 112 13.00 | 162 13.00
13 13.00 | 63 13.00 | 113 13.00 | 163 13.00
14 13.00 | 64 13.00 | 114 13.00 | 164 13.00
15 13.00 | 65 13.00 | 115 13.00 | 165 13.00
16 13.00 | 66 13.00 | 116 13.00 | 166 13.00
17 13.00 | 67 13.00 | 117 13.00 | 167 13.00
18 13.00 | 68 13.00 | 118 13.00 | 168 13.00
19 13.00 | 69 13.00 | 119 13.00 | 169 13.00
20 13.00| 70 13.00 | 120 13.00 | 170 13.00
21 13.00 | 71 13.00 | 121 13.00 | 171 13.00
22 13.00 | 72 13.00 | 122 13.00 | 172 13.00
23 13.00 | 73 13.00 | 123 13.00 | 173 13.00
24 13.00 | 74 13.00 | 124 13.00 | 174 13.00
25 13.00 | 75 13.00 | 125 13.00 | 175 13.00
26 13.00 | 76 13.00 | 126 13.00 | 176 13.00
27 13.00 | 77 13.00 | 127 13.00 | 177 13.00
28 13.00 | 78 13.00 | 128 13.00 | 178 13.00
29 13.00 | 79 13.00 | 129 13.00 | 179 13.00
30 13.00 | 80 13.00 | 130 13.00 | 180 13.00
31 13.00 | 81 13.00 | 131 13.00 | 181 13.00
32 13.00 | 82 13.00 | 132 13.00 | 182 13.00
33 13.00 | 83 13.00 | 133 13.00 | 183 13.00
34 13.00 | 84 13.00 | 134 13.00 | 184 13.00
35 13.00 | 85 13.00 | 135 13.00 | 185 13.00
36 13.00 | 86 13.00 | 136 13.00 | 186 13.00
37 13.00 | 87 13.00 | 137 13.00 | 187 13.00
38 13.00 | 88 13.00 | 138 13.00 | 188 13.00
39 13.00 | 89 13.00 | 139 13.00 | 189 13.00
40 13.00 | 90 13.00 | 140 13.00 | 190 13.00
41 13.00 | 91 13.00 | 141 13.00 | 191 13.00
42 13.00 | 92 13.00 | 142 13.00 | 192 13.00
43 13.00 | 93 13.00 | 143 13.00 | 193 13.00
44 13.00 | 94 13.00 | 144 13.00 | 194 13.00
45 13.00 | 95 13.00 | 145 13.00 | 195 13.00
46 13.00 | 96 13.00 | 146 13.00 | 196 13.00
47 13.00 | 97 13.00 | 147 13.00 | 197 13.00
48 13.00 | 98 13.00 | 148 13.00 | 198 13.00
49 13.00 | 99 13.00 | 149 13.00 | 199 13.00
50 13.00 | 100 13.00 | 150 13.00 | 200 13.00
0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
Down hole Tool Assembl Tubing sub total length 0.00 Tubing Weight 0
0.00 Total Joints 0 Average Joint #DIV/0!
0.00 Total Footage Page 1 0.00
0.00 Total Footage Page 2 0.00 Total Pipe & Subs 0.00
0.00 Total Footage Page 3 0.00
0.00 Total Footage Page 4 0.00 Total Pipe, Subs (KB) 13.00
Total Tools 0.00 Total Footage 0.00 Total Tools KB & Tbg. 13.00




