

# Oxy Operations Summary

Well:	PRIEST USX UU35-01 (FKA UPRR 43 PAN AM Z 1)			Spud Date:	12/14/1989 12:00:00 AM
Project:	COLORADO-BROOMFIELD-NAD83-UTM13			Site:	PRIEST USX UU35-01 (FKA UPRR 43 PAN AM Z 1)
Event:	ABANDONMENT			Rig Name:	SPN 711
Start Date:	11/4/21			End Date:	11/29/21
Datum:	RKB @ 5156			Well UWI:	
Report Date	Time From	Time To	Duration (hr)	Operation	
10/28/21	10:00	11:00	1	FORM 17 TEST NO FLUIDS. SC START 2 PSI AND SC END 0 PSI.	
11/1/21	8:00	13:00	5	LONE TREE SERVICES MOW LOCATION AND LEASE ROAD ENTRANCE, INSTALL PANELS FOR RIG OPS IN BROOMFIELD.	
11/3/21	8:30	14:00	5.50	RU EXCELLENCE LOGGING TP 800 CP 850 FL ( NOT DETECTED ) RIHW 1.91 GR TO 8385' ( CLEAR ) RIHW GYRO FROM 8350' TO 50' RIHW 2" JUC FISH PAD PLENGER @ 8385' FISH PFLOATER @ 8386' RIHW 1.5 BB TAG @ 8498' RDMO SLICKLINE	
11/4/21	14:00	15:30	1.50	RIG/MOB FROM WARNER W13-10 TO PRIEST USX UU35-1	
11/4/21	15:30	15:45	0.25	JSA, SAFETY MEETING	
11/4/21	15:45	18:00	2.25	SPOT IN EQUIPMENT, RU SPN 711, RIG, PUMP, TANKS, HARD LINES	
11/4/21	18:00	18:30	0.50	TRAVEL TO YARD	
11/4/21	18:30	18:30	0	This oil and gas location is within 0.25-miles of a Rule 1202.c CPW-mapped bald eagle nest area HPH. Plugging and abandonment (PA) should not occur from December 1 to July 31 or when nest is no longer occupied. If site conditions warrant that PA activities must be performed from December 1 to July 31 or when nest is occupied, Operator will consult with the regional CPW Energy Liaison to develop site specific measures to avoid, minimize, or mitigate impacts to wildlife. RU 11/4/21	
11/4/21	18:30	18:30	0	SIGNS POSTED 11/4/21	
11/4/21	18:30	18:30	0	FORM 42 SENT ON 11/1/21 FOR RU ON 11/4/21	
11/4/21	18:30	18:30	0	GYRO DONE 11/3/21	
11/4/21	18:30	18:30	0	FORM 17 DONE 10/28/21 ( 2PSI)	
11/5/21	6:00	7:00	1	TRAVEL TO LOCATION	
11/5/21	7:00	7:30	0.50	JSA, SAFETY MEETING	
11/5/21	7:30	8:00	0.50	CHECK SHUT IN WELL PRESSURES. SURFACE CASING: 2 (PSI). PRODUCTION CASING: 800 (PSI). TUBING: 850 (PSI). INTERMEDIATE CASING ## (PSI/NA).	

Well:	PRIEST USX UU35-01 (FKA UPRR 43 PAN AM Z 1)			Spud Date:	12/14/1989 12:00:00 AM
Project:	COLORADO-BROOMFIELD-NAD83-UTM13			Site:	PRIEST USX UU35-01 (FKA UPRR 43 PAN AM Z 1)
Event:	ABANDONMENT			Rig Name:	SPN 711
Start Date:	11/4/21			End Date:	11/29/21
Datum:	RKB @ 5156			Well UWI:	
Report Date	Time From	Time To	Duration (hr)	Operation	
11/5/21	8:00	9:30	1.50	PUMP 40BBLS OF FRESH W/BIO DOWN TBG, PUMP 110BBLS OF FRESH WATER W/ BIO DOWN CSG , PUMPED TOTAL 150BBLS ,NO GAS, KICK PUMP OFF WELL REMAINED STATIC  RMOR, STUMP TEST BOP, TEST BLIND RAMS TO 250PSI LOW - HELD 10MINS & 5000PSI HIGH - HELD 10MINS, TEST ALL 2 TIW VALVES	
11/5/21	9:30	11:15	1.75	NDWH, NUBOP, TORQUE WELLHEAD BOLTS TO SPEC & TEST PIPE RAMS TO 250PSI LOW - HELD 10MINS & 5000PSI HIGH - HELD 10MINS RD RMOR TORQUE & TEST	
11/5/21	11:15	11:45	0.50	LUNCH	
11/5/21	11:45	13:15	1.50	RUNFLOOR, UNLAND HANGER, TOO H 101 STANDS OF 2-3/8, EUE,, 8RD, 4.7#, J55	
11/5/21	13:15	13:45	0.50	SWIFN, WINTERIZE PUMP & LINES	
11/5/21	13:45	14:15	0.50	TRAVEL TO YARD	
11/8/21	6:00	7:00	1	TRAVEL TO LOCATION	
11/8/21	7:00	7:30	0.50	JSA, SAFETY MEETING	
11/8/21	7:30	7:45	0.25	CHECK SHUT IN WELL PRESSURES. SURFACE CASING: 2 (PSI). CASING: 0 (PSI). TUBING: 0 (PSI). INTERMEDIATE CASING ## (PSI/NA).	
11/8/21	7:45	9:30	1.75	KILL WELL, PUMP 100BBLS OF FRESH WATER W/BIO, TOO H 19 STANDS, LD 32 JTS OF 2-3/8, EUE, 8RD, 4.7#, J55	
11/8/21	9:30	10:30	1	WAITING ON WIRELINE	
11/8/21	10:30	11:30	1	JSA, SAFETY MEETING W/ CUTTER WL RUWL, NU WL FLANGE, TIGHTEN W/ PULL BARS. PU WL LUBE/BOP.	
11/8/21	11:30	12:30	1	PU & RIH W/ 5-1/2", 17# GAUGE RING TO 8310', POOH	
11/8/21	12:30	13:30	1	PU & RIH W/ 5-1/2", 17# CIBP, CORRELATE TO COLLARS, SET 5-1/2" CIBP @ 8300', POOH	
11/8/21	13:30	14:15	0.75	RIH & DUMP BAIL 4SX CMT ON CIBP @ 8300', POOH	
11/8/21	14:15	15:15	1	PU & RIH W/ 5-1/2", 17# CIBP, CORRELATE TO COLLARS, SET 5-1/2" CIBP @ 7870', POOH	
11/8/21	15:15	16:00	0.75	RIH & DUMP BAIL 4SX CMT ON CIBP @ 7870', POOH	
11/8/21	16:00	17:00	1	PU & RIH W/ 5-1/2", 17# CIBP, CORRELATE TO COLLARS, SET 5-1/2" CIBP @ 7439', POOH	
11/8/21	17:00	17:30	0.50	RD CUTTERS WL	
11/8/21	17:30	18:00	0.50	SLOWLY TOP FILL WELL TO CLEAR OUT ALL GAS, PRESSURE TEST CIBP TO 1000PSI, 15MINS, GOOD TEST	
11/8/21	18:00	18:30	0.50	WINTERIZE PUMP & LINES	

Well:	PRIEST USX UU35-01 (FKA UPRR 43 PAN AM Z 1)			Spud Date:	12/14/1989 12:00:00 AM
Project:	COLORADO-BROOMFIELD-NAD83-UTM13			Site:	PRIEST USX UU35-01 (FKA UPRR 43 PAN AM Z 1)
Event:	ABANDONMENT			Rig Name:	SPN 711
Start Date:	11/4/21			End Date:	11/29/21
Datum:	RKB @ 5156			Well UWI:	
Report Date	Time From	Time To	Duration (hr)	Operation	
11/8/21	18:30	19:30	1	TRAVEL TO YARD	
11/9/21	6:00	7:00	1	TRAVEL TO LOCATION	
11/9/21	7:00	7:15	0.25	JSA, SAFETY MEETING	
11/9/21	7:15	7:30	0.25	CHECK SHUT IN WELL PRESSURES. SURFACE CASING: 2 (PSI). CASING: 0 (PSI). TUBING: 0 (PSI). INTERMEDIATE CASING ## (PSI/NA).	
11/9/21	7:30	8:15	0.75	TIH 46 STANDS OF 2-3/8, EUE, 8RD, 4.7#, J55, EOT@3000'	
11/9/21	8:15	8:45	0.50	CIRCULATE WELL CLEAN FOR CBL	
11/9/21	8:45	9:30	0.75	LD 92 JTS OF 2-3/8, EUE, 8RD, 4.7#, J55	
11/9/21	9:30	10:00	0.50	JSA, SAFETY MEETING W/ CUTTER WL RUWL, NU WL FLANGE, TIGHTEN W/ PULL BARS. PU WL LUBE/BOP.	
11/9/21	10:00	12:30	2.50	CBL FROM 7414' TO SURFACE W/ 1000PSI ON WELL, SEND OFF	
11/9/21	12:30	13:00	0.50	RIH & DUMP BAIL 4SX CMT ON CIBP @ 7439', POOH	
11/9/21	13:00	13:30	0.50	PU & RIH W/ TWO 4' 3-1/8" PERF GUN W/ 4 SPF, 120D PHASING & 4.72" PENETRATION ,.59"EH, SHOOT 4' OF SQUEEZE HOLES @ 5320-5324' & 4520-4524', POOH	
11/9/21	13:30	14:15	0.75	RD CUTTERS WL	
11/9/21	14:15	15:30	1.25	PU 5-1/2" PACKER TIH W/ 148JTS OF 2-3/8", EUE, 8RD, 4.7#, EUE	
11/9/21	15:30	18:30	3	PACKER SET@ 4580' CIRCULATE WELL PUMPING DOWN TBG UP CSG RATE 1.5BPM @ 700PSI, RETURNS OIL & GAS RATE 2BPM @ 1000PSI, RETURNS MUD & GAS ADD MUD THINNER & GEL POLYMER SWEEPS RATE 3BPM @ 1200PSI, LITE MUD NO GAS RATE 4.2BPM @ 1300-1500PSI, NO HEAVY MUD RELEASE PACKER LD 4JTS BLEED DOWN SC, BUILD UP TO 600PSI	
11/9/21	18:30	19:00	0.50	SWIFN, WINTERIZE PUMP & LINES	
11/9/21	19:00	20:00	1	TRAVEL TO YARD	
11/10/21	6:00	7:00	1	TRAVEL TO LOCATION	
11/10/21	7:00	7:15	0.25	JSA, SAFETY MEETING	

Well:	PRIEST USX UU35-01 (FKA UPRR 43 PAN AM Z 1)			Spud Date:	12/14/1989 12:00:00 AM
Project:	COLORADO-BROOMFIELD-NAD83-UTM13			Site:	PRIEST USX UU35-01 (FKA UPRR 43 PAN AM Z 1)
Event:	ABANDONMENT			Rig Name:	SPN 711
Start Date:	11/4/21			End Date:	11/29/21
Datum:	RKB @ 5156			Well UWI:	
Report Date	Time From	Time To	Duration (hr)	Operation	
11/10/21	7:15	7:30	0.25	CHECK SHUT IN WELL PRESSURES. SURFACE CASING: 300 (PSI). CASING: 0 (PSI). TUBING: 0 (PSI). INTERMEDIATE CASING ## (PSI/NA).	
11/10/21	7:30	7:45	0.25	TIH 6JTS OF 2-3/8, EUE, 8RD, 4.7#, J55, SET PACKER AT 4580'.	
11/10/21	7:45	10:00	2.25	CIRCULATE WELL CLEAN. PUMPED 407BBLs. RETURNS MUDDY WATER WITH LITTLE GAS IN FIRST 110BBLs. SWITCH OVER AND PUMP 100BBLs CLEAN FRESH BIO WATER.. SPOT IN 50BBLs 160DEG FRESH BIO WATER. PUMP 50BBLs W/0.5GAL PER BBL SURFACTANT. DISPLACE W/ 8BBLs CLEAN FRESH.	
11/10/21	10:00	11:00	1	LET WELL EQUALIZE. UNSET PACKER. TOH WITH 148JTS. LD PACKER.	
11/10/21	11:00	11:45	0.75	PU 5.5" 17# CICR. TIH WITH 148 JTS 2-3/8" 4.7# J-55 TUBING 4020' LEFT HANGING. NO CEMENTERS.	
11/10/21	11:45	13:30	1.75	WAIT ON SLB. SCHEDULED FOR 11:00AM. CALLED AND THEY SAID WE WAS NOT ON SCHEDULE. EMAIL HAS IT ON SCHEDULE.	
11/10/21	13:30	14:00	0.50	WINTERIZE PUMP AND LINES. SECURE WELL ON LOCKED PIPE RAMS.	
11/10/21	14:00	15:00	1	TRAVEL TO YARD.	
11/11/21	6:00	7:00	1	TRAVEL TO LOCATION	
11/11/21	7:00	7:15	0.25	JSA, SAFETY MEETING	
11/11/21	7:15	7:30	0.25	CHECK SHUT IN WELL PRESSURES. SURFACE CASING: 50 (PSI). CASING: 0 (PSI). TUBING: 0 (PSI). INTERMEDIATE CASING ## (PSI/NA).	
11/11/21	7:30	7:45	0.25	TIH 6JTS OF 2-3/8, EUE, 8RD, 4.7#, J55, SET CICR AT 4580'.	
11/11/21	7:45	8:30	0.75	MIRU CEMENTERS. HOLD JSA MEETING. CMT COMPANY: (SLB).	
11/11/21	8:30	9:30	1	PUMP 230 SX, 14 PPG, 1.39 CF/SX CLASS G CEMENT, (SUSX BLEND) BALANCE PLUG: (NO), TOC ##### FT, BOC ##### FT SQUEEZE: (YES), EQUIPMENT: (CICR) DEPTH: 4580 FT, BOTTOM (PERF): 5320 FT, TOP (PERF): 4520 FT, TOC IN CSG: 4410 FT	
11/11/21	9:30	10:30	1	UNSTING FROM CICR. LD 9JTS 2-3/8" TUBING. EOT 4405'. REVERSE CIR 32BBLs FRESH BIO WATER. BREAK OFF KELLY.	
11/11/21	10:30	11:00	0.50	LD 73 JTS 2-3/8" 4.7# J-55 TUBING DOWN ON TRAILER. STAND BACK 29 STANDS, 58JTS 1795'. BREAK OFF STINGER. FILL CASING WITH 7.7BBLs FRESH BIO WATER.	

Well:	PRIEST USX UU35-01 (FKA UPRR 43 PAN AM Z 1)			Spud Date:	12/14/1989 12:00:00 AM
Project:	COLORADO-BROOMFIELD-NAD83-UTM13			Site:	PRIEST USX UU35-01 (FKA UPRR 43 PAN AM Z 1)
Event:	ABANDONMENT			Rig Name:	SPN 711
Start Date:	11/4/21			End Date:	11/29/21
Datum:	RKB @ 5156			Well UWI:	
Report Date	Time From	Time To	Duration (hr)	Operation	
11/11/21	11:00	11:30	0.50	STATIC CONDITIONS: NO FLOW. NO GAS MIGRATION. NO HYDROCARBONS.	
11/11/21	11:30	12:00	0.50	HELD SAFETY MEETING WITH CREWS. DISCUSS EMERGENCY CONTACTS, NEREST HOSPITAL, DRIVER, MUSER AREA. DISCUSS USE OF SPOTTERS, WIND DIRECTION. DISCUSS USE OF HAMMERS, VALVE ALIGNMENT, HAND PLACEMENT, GOOD COMMUNICATION, STOP AND THINK.	
11/11/21	12:00	12:30	0.50	NU 7-1/16" X 5K LUBE AND FLANGE. LOAD 3-1/8" X 4' PERF GUN. TIH WITH E-LINE TO 3800'. CORRELATE TO CASING CALLARS 3828'. 2.5' OFFSET. CCL AT 3797.5. PERF 4SPF 16HOLES 20 GRAM, .59" EH, 4.72" PEN 3800'-3804'. TOH WITH E-LINE. RO CUTTERS WIRELINE.	
11/11/21	12:30	14:30	2	BREAK CIRCULATION. PUMP AND 2BPM RETURNS HEAVY MUD WITH LITTLE GAS. CONTINUE CIR 85BBLS AWAY RETURNS STARTING TO CLEAN UP. BRING RATE UP TO 3.8BPM AT 800PSI. PUMPED A TOTAL OF 408BBLS FRESH BIO WATER 3X VOLUME. PUMP SERFACTANT .5GAL WITH 160DEG WATER. DISPLACE SERFACTANT IN OPEN HOLE. 12.6BBLS. LET SET.	
11/11/21	14:30	15:00	0.50	MIRU CEMENTERS. HOLD JSA MEETING. CMT COMPANY: (SLB).	
11/11/21	15:00	16:30	1.50	PUMP 250 SX, 14 PPG, 1.39 CF/SX CLASS G CEMENT, (SUSX BLEND) BALANCE PLUG: (NO), TOC ##### FT, BOC ##### FT SQUEEZE: (YES), EQUIPMENT: (NONE) DEPTH: 3804 FT, BOTTOM (PERF): 3804 FT, TOP (NONE): FT, TOC IN CSG: 2800 FT	
11/11/21	16:30	17:30	1	PULL DIRTY WATER FROM WORK TANKS AND CLEAN WITH SQUEEGE.	
11/11/21	17:30	18:00	0.50	WINTERIZE PUMP AND LINES.	
11/11/21	18:00	19:00	1	TRAVEL TO YARD.	
11/12/21	6:00	7:00	1	TRAVEL TO LOCATION	
11/12/21	7:00	7:15	0.25	JSA, SAFETY MEETING. DISCUSS EMERGENCY CONTACTS, NEREST HOSPITAL, MUSTER AREA. DISCUSS DAILY OPERATIONS, PINCH POINTS, HAND PLACEMENT WELL CONTROL, VOLUMES, USE OF SPOTTERS, GOOD COMMUNICATION, OVERHEAD LOADS, HIGH PRESSURE, VALVE ALIGNMENT, TANK VOLUMES, STOP AND THINK.	
11/12/21	7:15	7:45	0.50	CHECK SHUT IN WELL PRESSURES. SURFACE CASING: 0 (PSI). CASING: 0 (PSI).	
11/12/21	7:45	8:00	0.25	HELD SAFETY MEETING WITH CREWS. DISCUSS EMERGENCY CONTACTS, NEREST HOSPITAL, DRIVER, MUSER AREA. DISCUSS USE OF SPOTTERS, WIND DIRECTION. DISCUSS USE OF HAMMERS, VALVE ALIGNMENT, HAND PLACEMENT, GOOD COMMUNICATION, STOP AND THINK.	

Well:	PRIEST USX UU35-01 (FKA UPRR 43 PAN AM Z 1)			Spud Date:	12/14/1989 12:00:00 AM
Project:	COLORADO-BROOMFIELD-NAD83-UTM13			Site:	PRIEST USX UU35-01 (FKA UPRR 43 PAN AM Z 1)
Event:	ABANDONMENT			Rig Name:	SPN 711
Start Date:	11/4/21			End Date:	11/29/21
Datum:	RKB @ 5156			Well UWI:	
Report Date	Time From	Time To	Duration (hr)	Operation	
11/12/21	8:00	9:00	1	NU 7-1/16" X 5K LUBE AND FLANGE. LOAD 3-1/8" X 4' PERF GUN. TIH WITH E-LINE TO 3800'. CORRELATE TO CASING CALLARS XXXX'. 2.5' OFFSET. CCL AT 2497.5. PERF 4SPF 16HOLES 20 GRAM, .59" EH, 4.72" PEN 2500'-2504'. TOH WITH E-LINE. RO CUTTERS WIRELINE.	
11/12/21	9:00	11:00	2	BREAK CIRCULATION. PUMP AND 4BPM WITH FULL RETURNS. CLEAN RETURNS. PUMP 3X VOLUME 267BBLs. PUMP SERFACTANT .5GAL/BBL WITH 160DEG WATER. DISPLACE SERFACTANT IN OPEN HOLE. 12.6BBLs. LET SET.	
11/12/21	11:00	13:30	2.50	LET SERFACTANT SET N OPEN HOLE. CIR OUT SERFACTANT W/ 35BBLs.	
11/12/21	13:30	14:00	0.50	MIRU CEMENTERS. HOLD JSA MEETING. CEMENTERS (SLB).	
11/12/21	14:00	14:30	0.50	PUMP 290 SX, 15.8 PPG, 1.21 CF/SX CLASS G CEMENT, (AGM BLEND) BALANCE PLUG: (NO), TOC 1500 FT, BOC 2504 FT SQUEEZE: (YES), EQUIPMENT: (NONE) DEPTH: 2504 FT, BOTTOM (PERF): 2504 FT, TOP (PERF): 2500 FT, TOC IN CSG: 1500 FT	
11/12/21	14:30	16:30	2	267PSI CLOSE IN PRESSURE. LET CEMENT SET. BILLED OFF PRESSURE. FLOWED BACK 1/4BBLs. SIW FOR NIGHT.	
11/12/21	16:30	17:00	0.50	WINTERIZE PUMP AND LINES.	
11/12/21	17:00	18:00	1	TRAVEL TO YARD.	
11/13/21	6:00	7:00	1	TRAVEL TO LOCATION	
11/13/21	7:00	7:30	0.50	JSA, SAFETY MEETING. DISCUSS EMERGENCY CONTACTS, NEREST HOSPITAL, MUSTER AREA. DISCUSS DAILY OPERATIONS, PINCH POINTS, HAND PLACEMENT WELL CONTROL, VOLUMES, USE OF SPOTTERS, GOOD COMMUNICATION, OVERHEAD LOADS, HIGH PRESSURE, VALVE ALIGNMENT, TANK VOLUMES, STOP AND THINK.	
11/13/21	7:30	8:00	0.50	CHECK SHUT IN WELL PRESSURES. SURFACE CASING: 0 (PSI). CASING: 0 (PSI).	
11/13/21	8:00	8:15	0.25	PU 5.5"MECHANICAL CUTTER. TIH WITH 37JTS 2-3/8" TUBING. TAG 4' UP AT 1140' ON JT 38. TOH TO 36JTS. 1114'.	
11/13/21	8:15	8:30	0.25	RU XK-90 POWER SWIVEL AND DOUBLE DEAD LINES.	
11/13/21	8:30	8:45	0.25	PULL UP 9'. CUT 5.5" 17# P110 CASING AT 1105'.	
11/13/21	8:45	9:30	0.75	UNABLE TO CIR. PRESSURE UP TO 1500PSI. PUMP DOWN SC AT 1000PSI. UNABLE TO GET CI.	
11/13/21	9:30	9:45	0.25	RO XK-90 POWER SWIVEL.	
11/13/21	9:45	10:15	0.50	TOH WITH 18 STDS. INSPECT CUTTER BLADES. BLADES LOOK TO CUT ALL THE WAY. CHANGED OUT CUTTER BLADES.	

Well:	PRIEST USX UU35-01 (FKA UPRR 43 PAN AM Z 1)			Spud Date:	12/14/1989 12:00:00 AM
Project:	COLORADO-BROOMFIELD-NAD83-UTM13			Site:	PRIEST USX UU35-01 (FKA UPRR 43 PAN AM Z 1)
Event:	ABANDONMENT			Rig Name:	SPN 711
Start Date:	11/4/21			End Date:	11/29/21
Datum:	RKB @ 5156			Well UWI:	
Report Date	Time From	Time To	Duration (hr)	Operation	
11/13/21	10:15	11:00	0.75	TIH WITH MECHANICAL CUTTER AND 18STDS TBG. STACK OUT AT 1105 THAN FELL OFF. INDICATE THAT THERE IS A CUT ON THE CASING. CONSULT WITH FOREMAN. TRIED TO GET E-LINE TO RUN CBL. UNABLE TO DO SO UNTILL MNDAY MORNING.	
11/13/21	11:00	12:00	1	TOH WITH 18STDS. LD CUTTER. CLOSE IN WELL ON LOCKED BLIND RAMS. BREAK AMACO WELLHEAD BOLTS WITH TORQUE TOOLS AND TORQUE BACK UP.	
11/13/21	12:00	12:30	0.50	WINTERIZE PUMP AND LINES. TARP EQUIP.	
11/13/21	12:30	13:30	1	TRAVEL TO YARD.	
11/15/21	6:00	7:00	1	TRAVEL TO LOCATION	
11/15/21	7:00	7:15	0.25	JSA, SAFETY MEETING. DISCUSS EMERGENCY CONTACTS, NEREST HOSPITAL, MUSTER AREA. DISCUSS DAILY OPERATIONS, PINCH POINTS, HAND PLACEMENT WELL CONTROL, VOLUMES, USE OF SPOTTERS, GOOD COMMUNICATION, OVERHEAD LOADS, HIGH PRESSURE, VALVE ALIGNMENT, TANK VOLUMES, STOP AND THINK.	
11/15/21	7:15	7:30	0.25	CHECK SHUT IN WELL PRESSURES. SURFACE CASING: 0 (PSI). CASING: 0 (PSI).	
11/15/21	7:30	8:00	0.50	JSA, SAFETY MEETING W/ CUTTER WL RUWL, NU WL FLANGE, TIGHTEN W/ PULL BARS. PU WL LUBE/BOP.	
11/15/21	8:00	9:00	1	CBL FROM 1140' TO SURFACE RDWL	
11/15/21	9:00	9:30	0.50	PU & TIH W/ MECHANICAL CUTTER, T0@ 1105'	
11/15/21	9:30	10:15	0.75	RU SWIVEL, CUT 5-1/2", 17# CSG @ 1105' RD SWIVEL, TOO H W/ 34JTS OF 2-3/8, EUE, 8RD, 4.7#, J55, LD CUTTER	
11/15/21	10:15	10:30	0.25	CIRCULATE WELL DOWN CSG UP SC, 80BBLS OF FRESH WATER W/BIO	
11/15/21	10:30	11:00	0.50	CHANGE EQUIPMENT OVER TO 5-1/2"	
11/15/21	11:00	12:15	1.25	RD FLOOR, NDBOP, SPEAR 5-1/2", 17# CSG	
11/15/21	12:15	12:45	0.50	NUBOP, RU FLOOR	
11/15/21	12:45	14:00	1.25	LD 1105'- 26JTS OF 5-1/2", 17# CSG	
11/15/21	14:00	14:30	0.50	CHANGE EQUIPMENT TO 2-3/8"	
11/15/21	14:30	15:00	0.50	TIH W/ DIVERTER TOOL ON 36JTS OF 2-3/8, EUE, 8RD, 4.7#, J55, EOT@1105'	
11/15/21	15:00	16:00	1	CIRCULATE WELL, PUMPING DOWN TBG UP SC, CIRCULATE 220BBLS OF FRESH WATER W/BIO, WORKING RATES UP TO 4.2BPM@ 400PSI	
11/15/21	16:00	16:30	0.50	SPOT IN WATER TRUCK, PUMP HEATED SURFACTANT IN OH & SC SWI	

Well:	PRIEST USX UU35-01 (FKA UPRR 43 PAN AM Z 1)			Spud Date:	12/14/1989 12:00:00 AM
Project:	COLORADO-BROOMFIELD-NAD83-UTM13			Site:	PRIEST USX UU35-01 (FKA UPRR 43 PAN AM Z 1)
Event:	ABANDONMENT			Rig Name:	SPN 711
Start Date:	11/4/21			End Date:	11/29/21
Datum:	RKB @ 5156			Well UWI:	
Report Date	Time From	Time To	Duration (hr)	Operation	
11/15/21	16:30	17:00	0.50	WINTERIZE PUMP & LINES	
11/15/21	17:00	18:00	1	TRAVEL TO YARD	
11/15/21	18:00	18:00	0	COA: NO EVIDENCE OF PRESSURE OR FLUID MIGRATION , BEFORE SC SHOE PLUG	
11/16/21	6:00	7:00	1	TRAVEL TO LOCATION	
11/16/21	7:00	7:15	0.25	JSA, SAFETY MEETING	
11/16/21	7:15	7:30	0.25	CHECK SHUT IN WELL PRESSURES. SURFACE CASING: 0 (PSI). CASING: 0 (PSI).	
11/16/21	7:30	8:30	1	MIRU CEMENTERS. HOLD JSA MEETING. CEMENTERS (SLB).	
11/16/21	8:30	9:00	0.50	PUMP 200 SX, 15.8 PPG, 1.21 CF/SX CLASS G CEMENT, (AGM BLEND) BALANCE PLUG: (YES), TOC 600 FT, BOC 1105 FT SQUEEZE: (NO), EQUIPMENT: (N/A) DEPTH: 0 FT, BOTTOM (PERF): 0 FT, TOP (PERF): 0 FT, TOC IN CSG: FT	
11/16/21	9:00	9:45	0.75	LD 25JTS, REVERSE CIR TBG CLEAN, TOO H 5 STANDS OF 2-3/8, EUE, 8RD, 4.7#, J55	
11/16/21	9:45	10:15	0.50	RD FLOOR, NDBOP	
11/16/21	10:15	11:00	0.75	NU 9" BOP, TORQUE BOP, RU FLOOR	
11/16/21	11:00	13:00	2	COA: CEMENT WAS NOT CIRCULATED TO SURFACE, THEN WOC 4 HOURS. TAG TOC, TOC MUST BE 770' OR SHALLOWER.( TOC@550')	
11/16/21	13:00	13:30	0.50	TIH W/ 8-5/8" SCRAPER TAG TOC@ 550', LD JTS	
11/16/21	13:30	14:00	0.50	PRESSURE TEST SC 500PSI FOR 15MINS, GOOD TEST JSA, SAFETY MEETING W/ CUTTERS WL RUWL	
11/16/21	14:00	14:45	0.75	PU & RIH W/ 8-5/8" CIBP SET @ 260', POOH, RDWL	
11/16/21	14:45	15:15	0.50	ND 9" BOP	
11/16/21	15:15	16:00	0.75	NUBOP, RU FLOOR	
11/16/21	16:00	16:30	0.50	TIH W/ DIVERTER TOOL & SN ON 7JTS, EOT@260', SWIFN	
11/16/21	16:30	17:00	0.50	WINTERIZE PUMP & LINES	
11/16/21	17:00	18:00	1	TRAVEL TO YARD	
11/17/21	6:00	7:00	1	TRAVEL TO LOCATION	
11/17/21	7:00	7:15	0.25	JSA, SAFETY MEETING	

Well:	PRIEST USX UU35-01 (FKA UPRR 43 PAN AM Z 1)			Spud Date:	12/14/1989 12:00:00 AM
Project:	COLORADO-BROOMFIELD-NAD83-UTM13			Site:	PRIEST USX UU35-01 (FKA UPRR 43 PAN AM Z 1)
Event:	ABANDONMENT			Rig Name:	SPN 711
Start Date:	11/4/21			End Date:	11/29/21
Datum:	RKB @ 5156			Well UWI:	
Report Date	Time From	Time To	Duration (hr)	Operation	
11/17/21	7:15	7:30	0.25	CHECK SHUT IN WELL PRESSURES. SURFACE CASING: 0 (PSI). CASING: 0 (PSI).	
11/17/21	7:30	7:45	0.25	PUMP 20BBLs OF HEATED SURFACTANT	
11/17/21	7:45	8:45	1	SOAK HF 1HR	
11/17/21	8:45	9:30	0.75	BLOW WELL DRY BEFORE PUMPING CMT	
11/17/21	9:30	10:30	1	MIRU CEMENTERS. HOLD JSA MEETING. CEMENTERS (SLB).	
11/17/21	10:30	11:00	0.50	PUMP 80 SX, 15.8 PPG, 1.21 CF/SX CLASS G CEMENT, (AGM BLEND) BALANCE PLUG: (YES), TOC 10 FT, BOC 260 FT SQUEEZE: (NO), EQUIPMENT: (N/A) DEPTH: 0 FT, BOTTOM (PERF): 0 FT, TOP (PERF): 0 FT, TOC IN CSG: FT	
11/17/21	11:00	11:45	0.75	LD JTS, TOP OFF WELL, RD FLOOR, NDBOP, PUT CAP ON WELL	
11/17/21	11:45	13:00	1.25	RD SPN 711, RIG, PUMP, TANKS, HARD LINE, CLEAN UP LOCATION	
11/17/21	13:00	13:00	0	Leave at least 100' of cement in the wellbore for each plug. (YES)	
11/17/21	13:00	13:00	0	WELL GAS WAS BULLHEADED& CIRCULATED DEAD. ALL MEASURES WERE IMPLEMENTED TO CONTROL VENTING	
11/29/21	8:00	9:00	1	DUG UP SURFACE CASING	
11/29/21	9:00	10:00	1	CUT CASING 6' BELOW GL, CEMENT AT SURFACE	
11/29/21	10:00	11:00	1	CAPPED CASING WITH A METAL PLATE CONTAINING WELL INFO	
11/29/21	11:00	12:00	1	BACKFILLED	
11/29/21	12:00	12:00	0	PLACED MARKER BALL	