0:00

Schneider Summit Services

3.00 PO Box 983038
Park City, UT 84098
Schneider Summit Services
DAILY OPERATIONS REPORT
Date (1st Hour): 10/06/21 | Operator Summit Oil & Gas Well Name: Frank W Turner 1 API #: 05-123-05419
Field: Wildcat Consultant: Mike Griffin / Jeremy Raney |AFE #: ?
County: Weld Phone: 307-421-9309 / 303-775-3647|Csg Depth / TD: 204' / 6584'
Operation: Re-Abandon Rig Contractor: Hurricane #39 Size / Grade: 10-3/4" 1 ?
Location: SWSE 1-7N-59W Weight / Thread: 32.75# /7
Lat/Long: 40.599246 / -103.924257 | Perforations: 6486' to 6497"
BREAKDOWN OF OPERATIONS TUBING, BHA, Rods
From To Hrs Description Quantity oD ID Description Length Top
16:30 23:30 7.00 |moverig spot in rig up nipple up well head bops build pump lines spot in pipe
racks and handler
23:30 0:46 116 ![c;zd 10 3.5 od drill collars pick up make up 6.5 od drill bit trip in all 10 D.C no
0:46 3:15 2:99 tooh out laying d.c load dc load pipe racks with tubing tally tihwith 4-3/4 bit bit
sub float sub xo
3:15 6:00 2:45 |wash and ream to 628 saw oil dry cement and rubber come back in returns
6:00

End of Tubing:
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3.00

Schneider Summit Services

Schneider Summit Services
PO Box 983038
Park City, UT 84098

DAILY OPERATIONS REPORT

Date (1st Hour): 10/07/21 | Operator Summit Oil & Gas Well Name: Frank W Turner 1 API #: 05-123-05419
Field: Wildcat Consultant: Mike Griffin / Jeremy Raney |AFE #: ?
County: Weld Phone: 307-421-9309 / 303-775-3647|Csg Depth / TD: 204' / 6584'
Operation: Re-Abandon Rig Contractor: Hurricane #39 Size / Grade: 10-3/4" 1 ?
Location: SWSE 1-7N-59W Weight / Thread: 32.75#17
Lat/Long: 40.599246 / -103.924257 | Perforations: 6486' to 6497'
BREAKDOWN OF OPERATIONS TUBING, BHA, Rods
From To Hrs Description Quantity oD ID Description Length Top
6:00 7:30 1:30 Cont.lnue to Rotate & wash down, stop & cir hole every 10 jts for 15 mins,
continue down hole
7:30 9:30 2:00 Rotate & Wash down w/ 27 jts, tag @ 831", drill 2 mins/ft, mud 8.8 ppg, vis 30,
) ) ) return sand, shale, heavy mud, drill out @ 880"
. . . Continue to Rotate & wash down, stop & cir hole every 10 jts for 15 mins,
9:30 2221 12:57 continue down hole, drill thru heavy mud & muddy sand bridges
22:27 22:37 0:10  [drilled on something hard 4855 took about 10 min going back to washing down
29:37 115 2:38 wprk joint 155 down last 15 foot very stickey2 BPM returns show lil sand and
dirty water MW 9 pound
115 6:00 4:45 got down to jt 172 in hole having to work pipe down sand is coming back bpm
1.5 mw 8.9 pound
6:00

End of Tubing:




0:00
3.00

Schneider Summit Services

Schneider Summit Services
PO Box 983038
Park City, UT 84098

DAILY OPERATIONS REPORT

Date (1st Hour): 10/08/21 | Operator Summit Oil & Gas Well Name: Frank W Turner 1 API #: 05-123-05419
Field: Wildcat Consultant: Mike Griffin / Jeremy Raney |AFE #: ?
County: Weld Phone: 307-421-9309 / 303-775-3647|Csg Depth / TD: 204' / 6584’
Operation: Re-Abandon Rig Contractor: Hurricane #39 Size / Grade: 10-3/4"/ ?
Location: SWSE 1-7N-59W Weight / Thread: 32.75#17
Lat/Long: 40.599246 / -103.924257 |Perforations: 6486' to 6497"
BREAKDOWN OF OPERATIONS TUBING, BHA, Rods
From To Hrs Description Quantity oD ID Description Length Top
6:00 7:30 1:30 Rotate & Qir to 5777" 1§4 jts, TD, hit small bridges while circulating down, mud
9.0 ppg, vis 34, return lite sand & shale.
7:30 8:30 1:00 [Cir hole
8:30 11:00 2:30 R/U Summit slickline, run Gyro F/ 5777' - Surf, record every 100', r/d slickline
11:00 13:00 2:00 [Cir hole WOC
R/U Swabbco Cementers, Pump 10 bbls water ahead, Mix & pump 90 sx (18
13:00 14:00 1:00 |bbls) Class G neat @ 15.8 ppg, displace w/ 3 bbls water & 29 bbls 9.0 ppg mud,
Good Cir, R/D cementers
1400 17:00 3:00 TOOH w/ 2-7/8 tbg L/D 130 jts, std back 27 stds, remove 4-3/4 button bit, bit
sub, float sub.
17:00 17:30 0:30 |TIH w/ 2-7/8 Notch Collar, S/N, run 27 std, land tbg @ 1698, r/u cementers
. . . Pump 5 bbls water ahead, mix & pump 90 sx (18 bbls) Class G w/ 2% Cacl, 1/4
17:30 18:00 0:30 #/sx Cello-Flake, 15.8 ppg, displace w/ 28 bbl water
18:00 21:00 3:00 |TOOH w/ 2-7/8 tbg, std back, N/D BOP, N/U Washington Head, WOC
21:00 29:93 193 trip in hole tag cement @ 1311 with trip out laying down left 15 jts in hole @
474 foot
22:23 018 155 rig up cementers flush tubing with 5 bbls pump 90 sx of class G with 3% cacl
1/44#sx cello-flake
0:18 3:45 3:27  |trip out wait on cement
. . . trip in tagged 438 with 15 jts ru cementers pump 226 sx class G with 2% cacl
3:45 6:00 2:15 ) .
never got cement to surface trip out wait on cement
6:00

End of Tubing:
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Schneider Summit Services

Schneider Summit Services

PO Box 983038

Park City, UT 84098

DAILY OPERATIONS REPORT

Date (1st Hour): 10/09/21 | Operator Summit Oil & Gas Well Name: Frank W Turner 1 API #: 05-123-05419
Field: Wildcat Consultant: Mike Griffin AFE #: ?
County: Weld Phone: 307-421-9309 Csg Depth / TD: 204' / 6584’
Operation: Re-Abandon Rig Contractor: Hurricane #39 Size / Grade: 10-3/4" /1 ?
Location: SWSE 1-7N-59W Weight / Thread: 32.75#/ ?
Lat/Long: 40.599246 / -103.924257 |Perforations: 6486' to 6497'
BREAKDOWN OF OPERATIONS TUBING, BHA, Rods
From To Hrs Description Quantity oD ID Description Length Top
6:00 8:30 2:30 [wOC
8:30 9:00 0:30 [TIH w/ 5 jts tag cement @ 157"
9:00 10:00 1:00 R/U Cementers, pump 5 bbls ahead, mix & pump 90 sx (18 bbls) Class G neat,
’ ’ displace w/ 1 bbl water, Cir 10 bbls cement to pit, R/D cementers
10:00 10:30 0:30 [L/D5jts 2-7/8
10:30 12:30 2:00 |R/D & release Hurricane #39 and services
12:30

End of Tubing:
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Schneider Summit Services

Schneider Summit Services
PO Box 983038
Park City, UT 84098

DAILY OPERATIONS REPORT

Date (1st Hour): 10/15/21 | Operator Summit Oil & Gas Well Name: Frank W Turner 1 API #: 05-123-05419
Field: Wildcat Consultant: Mike Griffin AFE #: ?
County: Weld Phone: 307-421-9309 Csg Depth / TD: 204' | 6584'
Operation: Re-Abandon Rig Contractor: Hurricane #39 Size / Grade: 10-3/4" 1 ?
Location: SWSE 1-7N-59W Weight / Thread: 32.75#17
Lat/Long: 40.599246 / -103.924257 |Perforations: 6486' to 6497'
BREAKDOWN OF OPERATIONS TUBING, BHA, Rods
From To Hrs Description Quantity oD ID Description Length Top
Cement was at surf, no need for top off, dig out csg 6' cut csgd 4' below GL,
10:30 12:00 1:30 |weld on cap w/ well info, Well name & number, Lat/Long, APl number, fill hole
back in and pack down dirt
12:00

End of Tubing:




