

US ROCKIES REGION
Operation Summary Report

Well: NEALE UPRR 32-15 #1		Spud date: 8/26/1986	
Project: COLORADO-WELD-NAD83-UTM13		Site: NEALE UPRR 32-15 #1	
Event: ABANDONMENT		Start date: 12/11/2020	End date: 3/31/2021
Active datum: RKB @4,890.99usft (above Mean Sea Level)		UWI: 0/3/N/66/W/15/0/NESW/6/0/0/0/0/0/0/0	

Date	Time Start-End	Duration (hr)	Phase	Code	Sub Code	P/U	MD from (usft)	Operation
11/25/2020	8:30 - 14:00	5.50	ABANDP	35	A	P		MI EXCELLENCE LOGGING CHECK PRESSURE 150/450 FLUID LEVEL 980'. RIH 2" JDC FISH BARSTOCK PL @7013' OOH. RIH 2" JDC FISH PAD PL @7014' OOH. RIH 2" JDC FISH STANDING VALVE @7015' BOTTOM OF SV LOOKS BEAT UP FROM POSSIBLE TOOL. RIH 2"JDC SHEARED 2 TIMES @7016'. SHEARED ~12' ABOVE XN @7028'. TOLD TO RIG DOWN TO DETERMINE NEXT STEPS
12/1/2020	8:00 - 11:00	3.00	ABANDP	35	G	P		MI EXCELLENCE LOGGING CHECK PRESSURE 340/450 FLUID LEVEL 4800'. RIH 1.91" GAUGE RING TO 7016' OOH. RIH 2" JDC W_COLLAR STOP SET @6995' OOH. RIH HYDRAULIC PERF W_1.5" BLIND BOX PERF HOLES @6994' OOH. RIH 2" JUC FISH COLLAR STOP @6995' OOH. RDMO SLICKLINE
12/4/2020	8:00 - 10:00	2.00	LOCPRP	53	B	P		LONE TREE SERVICES INSTALL A STING FENCE FOR RIG OPS.
12/11/2020	-							
12/14/2020	5:30 - 6:00	0.50	ABANDP	30	G	P		CT TO LOCATION
	6:00 - 6:30	0.50	ABANDP	48	B	P		CREW CHANGED CLOTHES & HELD JSA SAFETY MEETING
	6:30 - 7:30	1.00	ABANDP	30	A	P		ROAD RIG TO LOCATION
	7:30 - 8:00	0.50	ABANDP	33	G	P		CHECK PRESSURE CP:460, TBG 460, SCP:6 PSI.
	8:00 - 11:00	3.00	ABANDP	30	A	P		SPOT IN ENSIGN 316,LD ALL PUMP LINES,PSI TEST ALL LINES, SDFN DUE TO NO FORM 17. WAIT ON FORM 42.
	11:00 - 11:30	0.50	ABANDP	30	I	P		WINTERIZE PUMP & LINES
	11:30 - 12:00	0.50	ABANDP	30	K	P		SECURE WELL & RIG TANKS CLEAN LOCATION SDFN
	12:00 - 12:30	0.50	ABANDP	30	G	P		CT TO YARD
12/15/2020	6:00 - 7:00	1.00	ABANDP	53	B	P		FORM 17 TEST AND SAMPLE
12/17/2020	5:30 - 6:00	0.50	ABANDP	30	G	P		CT TO LOCATION
	6:00 - 6:30	0.50	ABANDP	48	B	P		CREW CHANGED CLOTHES & HELD JSA SAFETY MEETING
	6:30 - 7:00	0.50	ABANDP	52	I	P		STARTED EQUIPMENT & WARM UP, CHECK PRESSURE CP:460, TBG 460, SCP:10 PSI KEPT IT OPEN DURING DAILY OPS
	7:00 - 10:00	3.00	ABANDP	33	F	P		SPOT IN FLARE UNIT,RU FLARE UNIT,PSI TEST ALL LINES,FLARE WELL DOWN,STARTING PSI 460 PSI CSG, 460 PSI,TBG,FLARED CSG DOWN TO 20 PSI TBG DROPPED TO 130 PSI

US ROCKIES REGION
Operation Summary Report

Well: NEALE UPRR 32-15 #1		Spud date: 8/26/1986	
Project: COLORADO-WELD-NAD83-UTM13		Site: NEALE UPRR 32-15 #1	Rig name no.: ENSIGN WELL SERVICES/316
Event: ABANDONMENT		Start date: 12/11/2020	End date: 3/31/2021
Active datum: RKB @4,890.99usft (above Mean Sea Level)		UWI: 0/3/N/66/W/15/0/NESW/6/0/0/0/0/0/0/0	

Date	Time Start-End	Duration (hr)	Phase	Code	Sub Code	P/U	MD from (usft)	Operation
	7:00 - 10:00		ABANDP	30	F	P		FUNCTION TEST BOP'S.MIRU HOLE SEEKERS 50' FROM WELL.TEST #1TIW VALVE LOWSIDE TO 250psi FOR 5min BLEED OFF PRESSURE TEST 5000# FOR 15MIN GOOD TEST. TEST #2 TIW VALVE LOWSIDE TO 250psi FOR 5min BLEED OFF PRESSURE. TEST TO 5000# FOR 15MIN GOOD TEST NU ON SAFETY JNT. LOAD BOP'S ONTO STUMP LOAD WITH FLUID SHUT BLIND RAMS,PSI TEST LOWSIDE TO 250psi FOR 5min BLEED OFF PRESSURE. TEST TO 5000# FOR 15MIN GOOD TEST.
	10:00 - 11:00	1.00	ABANDP	31	E	P		LOADED CSG W 65 BBL OF H2O', TBG PSI CLIMBED TO 150',PUMPED 30 BBL DOWN TBG,OPENED TO TANKES,NO FLOW ON EATHER SIDE
	11:00 - 13:00	2.00	ABANDP	30	F	P		ND WH.ND BOP'S OFF STUMP NU BOP'S ONTO WH.NU SUB & TIW.TORQUE BOLTS LOAD BOP'S WITH FLUID SHUT PIPE RAMS, PSI TEST LOW SIDE TO 250psi FOR 5min GOOD TEST.PSI TEST HIGH SIDE TO 5000psi FOR 15min GOOD TEST RDMO HOLE SEEKERS.
	13:00 - 14:00	1.00	ABANDP	31	H	P		UNSET PKR, CIRCULATED 150 BBL OF FRESH WATER ,WELL BROUGHT BACK SMALL AMOUNT OF GAS & OIL
	14:00 - 16:30	2.50	ABANDP	31	I	P		SB 50 JTS OF 2 3/8,LD 158 JTS & 4.5" PKR, LD REMAINING 15 JTS,TOTAL OF 223 JTS IN HOLE,PUMPED A TOTAL OF 15 BBL OF WATER TO KEEP HOLE FULL
	16:30 - 17:00	0.50	ABANDP	30	I	P		WINTERIZE PUMP & LINES
	17:00 - 17:30	0.50	ABANDP	30	K	P		SECURE WELL & RIG TANKS CLEAN LOCATION SDFN
	17:30 - 18:00	0.50	ABANDP	30	G	P		CT TO YARD
12/18/2020	7:00 - 8:00	1.00	ABANDP	30	G	P		CT TO LOCATION
	8:00 - 8:30	0.50	ABANDP	48	B	P		CREW CHANGED CLOTHES & HELD JSA SAFETY MEETING
	8:30 - 9:00	0.50	ABANDP	52	I	P		STARTED EQUIPMENT & WARM UP, CHECK PRESSURE CP:10 PSI, SCP:50,SCS BLED OFF QUICK NO FLUIDS BROUGHT BACK KEPT IT OPEN DURING DAILY OPS
	9:00 - 9:30	0.50	ABANDP	34	1	P		TORQUE WL FLANG,MIRU WL W FULL LUBE
	9:30 - 11:30	2.00	ABANDP	34	I	P		TIH W GAUGE RING TO 7035',PU 4.5" 15.1# CIBP & SET @ 7025'
	11:30 - 12:30	1.00	ABANDP	52	D	P		TOP FILL HOLE W 70 BBL OF WATER,PSI TEST CSG TO 500 PSI FOR 15 MIN GOOD TEST
	12:30 - 14:30	2.00	ABANDP	34	N	P		TIH W CCL,CBL,LOG WELL FROM 7025' TO SURFACE W 500 PSI
	14:30 - 15:30	1.00	ABANDP	34	D	P		DUMP BAIL 2SX OF CMT ON PLUG @ 7025',TIH W 4' SPF PERF GUN & SHOOT HOLES @ 1510 -1514',RDMO WL
	15:30 - 17:00	1.50	ABANDP	31	H	P		ATTEMPT TO CIRCULATE DOWN CSG UP SCSG,WELL CIRCULATING @ 2 BBL MIN 700 PSI,BROUGHT BACK HEAVY MUD LIGHT GAS,CLEANED UP OF HEAVY MUD AFTER 100 BBL PUMPED,CIRCULATING @ 500 PSI 3 BBL MIN,CIRCULATED 200 BBL OF WATER,

US ROCKIES REGION
Operation Summary Report

Well: NEALE UPRR 32-15 #1

Spud date: 8/26/1986

Project: COLORADO-WELD-NAD83-UTM13

Site: NEALE UPRR 32-15 #1

Rig name no.: ENSIGN WELL SERVICES/316

Event: ABANDONMENT

Start date: 12/11/2020

End date: 3/31/2021

Active datum: RKB @4,890.99usft (above Mean Sea Level)

UWI: 0/3/N/66/W/15/0/NESW/6/0/0/0/0/0/0

Date	Time Start-End	Duration (hr)	Phase	Code	Sub Code	P/U	MD from (usft)	Operation
	17:00 - 17:30	0.50	ABANDP	30	K	P		SECURE WELL & RIG TANKS CLEAN LOCATION SDFN
	17:30 - 18:00	0.50	ABANDP	30	I	P		WINTERIZE PUMP & LINES
	18:00 - 18:30	0.50	ABANDP	30	G	P		CT TO YARD
12/21/2020	5:30 - 6:00	0.50	ABANDP	30	G	P		CT TO LOCATION
	6:00 - 6:30	0.50	ABANDP	48	B	P		CREW CHANGED CLOTHES & HELD JSA SAFETY MEETING
	6:30 - 7:00	0.50	ABANDP	52	I	P		STARTED EQUIPMENT & WARM UP, CHECK PRESSURE CP:0, SCP:10 PSI KEPT IT OPEN DURING DAILY OPS
	7:00 - 8:30	1.50	ABANDP	31	H	P		CIRC WELL @ 500 PSI 3 BBL MIN, MIRU WL W FULL LUBE TORQUE WL FLANG
	8:30 - 9:30	1.00	ABANDP	34	M	P		TIH CUT CSG @ 1520' RDMO WL
	9:30 - 13:00	3.50	ABANDP	30	J	P		RD RIG FLOOR,ND BOP,HAD HARD TIME BREAKING SURFACE CAP,UNLAND 4.5" CSG PULLED 45K CSG CAME FREE,FUNCTION TEST BOP W 4.5" RAMS,NU BOP RU RIG FLOOR,SPOT IN PIPE WRANGLE
	13:00 - 15:00	2.00	ABANDP	31	I	P		LD 57 JTS OF 4.5",CHANGED OVER TO 2 3/8,TIH W 48 JTS OF 2 3/8 TO 1520'
	15:00 - 16:30	1.50	ABANDP	51	D	P		SLB PRESSURE TEST LINES TO 2500 PSI CALL 800 MAX PSI, PUMP UPPER PIERRE PLUG W, 10 BBLs OF CHEM WASH,10 BBL FRESH WATER, 121 SKS AGM BLEND 1% Calc & 12% Gyp 15.8 ppg, 1.23 cf/sk=26.5 BBLs OF SLURRY DISPLACE 5 BBLs OF FRESH WATER RD SLB LET THEM WASH OUT EQUIPMENT
	16:30 - 17:30	1.00	ABANDP	31	H	P		LD 10 JTS TO 1200',REVERSE CIRCULATE 140 BBL FRESH H2O,SB 38 JTS OF 2 3/8
	17:30 - 18:00	0.50	ABANDP	30	K	P		SECURE WELL & RIG TANKS CLEAN LOCATION
	18:00 - 18:30	0.50	ABANDP	30	I	P		WINTERIZE PUMP & LINES SDFN
	18:30 - 19:00	0.50	ABANDP	30	G	P		CT TO YARD
12/22/2020	5:30 - 6:00	0.50	ABANDP	30	G	P		CT TO LOCATION
	6:00 - 6:30	0.50	ABANDP	48	B	P		CREW CHANGED CLOTHES & HELD JSA SAFETY MEETING
	6:30 - 7:00	0.50	ABANDP	52	I	P		STARTED EQUIPMENT & WARM UP, CHECK PRESSURE CP:0, SCP:10 PSI KEPT IT OPEN DURING DAILY OPS
	7:00 - 8:15	1.25	ABANDP	31	I	P		TIH W 20 JTS OF 2 3/8 TBG TAG@ 632' , SHUT WELL IN
	8:15 - 9:15	1.00	ABANDP	55	G	P		MONITOR WELL BUILT 12 PSI,CALLED IN TO OXY,CLEAN OUT MUD TANK W WATER TRUCK
	9:15 - 11:00	1.75	ABANDP	31	I	P		PU 3 7/8 BIT TIH W 20 JTS OF 2 3/8 TAGGED @ 632',RU POWERSWIVEL
	11:00 - 13:00	2.00	ABANDP	44	A	P		PUMPING DOWN TBG UP CSG @ 500 PSI 3 BBL MIN,TURNED SWIVEL @ AND IDLE CIRCULATING HEAVY MUD OUT CIRCULATED JT 20,21,22, DOWN FELL THREW AT 722.95,RD POWER SWIVEL
	13:00 - 14:00	1.00	ABANDP	31	I	P		TIH W 16 JTS TAGGED TOC @1200' W 38 JTS OF 2 3/8',TOH W TBG
	14:00 - 14:30	0.50	ABANDP	31	I	P		TIH W 38 JTS OF 2 3/8 TO TOP OF CMT @ 1200'
	14:30 - 16:30	2.00	ABANDP	31	H	P		CIRCULATE WELL @ 300 PSI 3 BBL MIN BROUGHT BACK HEAVY MUD NO GAS,LD 38 JTS TO DROP FLUID LEVEL

US ROCKIES REGION
Operation Summary Report

Well: NEALE UPRR 32-15 #1		Spud date: 8/26/1986	
Project: COLORADO-WELD-NAD83-UTM13		Site: NEALE UPRR 32-15 #1	Rig name no.: ENSIGN WELL SERVICES/316
Event: ABANDONMENT		Start date: 12/11/2020	End date: 3/31/2021
Active datum: RKB @4,890.99usft (above Mean Sea Level)		UWI: 0/3/N/66/W/15/0/NESW/6/0/0/0/0/0/0/0	

Date	Time Start-End	Duration (hr)	Phase	Code	Sub Code	P/U	MD from (usft)	Operation
	16:30 - 17:00	0.50	ABANDP	30	K	P		SECURE WELL & RIG TANKS CLEAN LOCATION
	17:00 - 17:30	0.50	ABANDP	30	I	P		WINTERIZE PUMP & LINES SDFN
	17:30 - 18:00	0.50	ABANDP	30	G	P		CT TO YARD
12/23/2020	5:30 - 6:00	0.50	ABANDP	30	G	P		CT TO LOCATION
	6:00 - 6:30	0.50	ABANDP	48	B	P		CREW CHANGED CLOTHES & HELD JSA SAFETY MEETING
	6:30 - 8:00	1.50	ABANDP	52	I	P		STARTED EQUIPMENT & WARM UP, UNTHAW WELL HEAD, CHECK PRESSURE CP:0, SCP:50 PSI KEPT IT OPEN DURING DAILY OPS
	8:00 - 9:00	1.00	ABANDP	31	I	P		PU 38 JTS OF 2 3/8 TAG TOC @ 1200', RU PUMP LINES
	9:00 - 13:30	4.50	ABANDP	31	H	P		WAIT ON CMT CREW, LATE TO FIRST JOB DUE TO BAD ROAD CONDITIONS, CMT CREW SPOTTED IN ISSUES W PUMP TRUCK, CIRC WELL @ 500 PSI 3 BBL MIN, CIRC LIGHT MUD NO GAS
	13:30 - 15:00	1.50	ABANDP	51	D	P		SLB PRESSURE TEST LINES TO 2500 PSI CALL 800 MAX PSI, PUMP UPPER PIERRE PLUG W, 5BBL FRESH WATER, 165 SKS AGM BLEND 1% Calc & 12% Gyp 15.8 ppg, 1.23 cf/sk= 36 BBLS OF SLURRY DISPLACE 3 BBLS OF FRESH WATER RD SLB LET THEM WASH OUT EQUIPMENT
	15:00 - 16:00	1.00	ABANDP	31	I	P		LD 10 JTS OF 2 3/8 TO 850', REVERSE CIRCULATE 100 BBL OF FRESH WATER 2X HOLE VOLUME
	16:00 - 16:30	0.50	ABANDP	31	I	P		LD 28 JTS OF 2 3/8
	16:30 - 17:00	0.50	ABANDP	30	K	P		SECURE WELL & RIG TANKS CLEAN LOCATION
	17:00 - 17:30	0.50	ABANDP	30	I	P		WINTERIZE PUMP & LINES SDFN
	17:30 - 18:00	0.50	ABANDP	30	G	P		CT TO YARD
12/28/2020	5:30 - 6:00	0.50	ABANDP	30	G	P		CT TO LOCATION
	6:00 - 6:30	0.50	ABANDP	48	B	P		CREW CHANGED CLOTHES & HELD JSA SAFETY MEETING
	6:30 - 7:30	1.00	ABANDP	52	I	P		STARTED EQUIPMENT & WARM UP, CHECK PRESSURE CP:0, SCP:200 PSI KEPT IT OPEN DURING DAILY OPS
	7:30 - 8:30	1.00	ABANDP	31	I	P		PU 29 JTS OF 2 3/8 TAG TOC @ 916', RU PUMP LINES
	8:30 - 9:30	1.00	ABANDP	55	G	P		SHUT WELL IN FOR 1 HR BUILT UP 5 PSI
	9:30 - 10:30	1.00	ABANDP	46	A	P		WAIT ON ORDERS FROM OXY
	10:30 - 12:00	1.50	ABANDP	51	D	P		MIRU SLB PRESSURE TEST LINES TO 2500 PSI CALL 800 MAX PSI, PUMP UPPER PIERRE PLUG W, 5BBL FRESH WATER, 150 SKS AGM BLEND 2% Calc & 12% Gyp 15.8 ppg, 1.23 cf/sk= 32.8 BBLS OF SLURRY DISPLACE 2 BBLS OF FRESH WATER RD SLB LET THEM WASH OUT EQUIPMENT
	12:00 - 13:30	1.50	ABANDP	31	I	P		LD 8 JTS OF 2 3/8 TO 650' REVERSE CIRCULATE 80 BBL OF FRESH WATER 2X HOLE VOLUME, TOH W REMIANING 29 JTS
	13:30 - 14:00	0.50	ABANDP	30	K	P		SECURE WELL & RIG TANKS CLEAN LOCATION
	14:00 - 14:30	0.50	ABANDP	30	I	P		WINTERIZE PUMP & LINES SDFN
	14:30 - 15:00	0.50	ABANDP	30	G	P		CT TO YARD
12/29/2020	5:30 - 6:00	0.50	ABANDP	30	G	P		CT TO LOCATION
	6:00 - 6:30	0.50	ABANDP	48	B	P		CREW CHANGED CLOTHES & HELD JSA SAFETY MEETING

US ROCKIES REGION
Operation Summary Report

Well: NEALE UPRR 32-15 #1

Spud date: 8/26/1986

Project: COLORADO-WELD-NAD83-UTM13

Site: NEALE UPRR 32-15 #1

Rig name no.: ENSIGN WELL SERVICES/316

Event: ABANDONMENT

Start date: 12/11/2020

End date: 3/31/2021

Active datum: RKB @4,890.99usft (above Mean Sea Level)

UWI: 0/3/N/66/W/15/0/NESW/6/0/0/0/0/0/0

Date	Time Start-End	Duration (hr)	Phase	Code	Sub Code	P/U	MD from (usft)	Operation
	6:30 - 8:00	1.50	ABANDP	52	I	P		STARTED EQUIPMENT & WARM UP,UNTHAW WELL HEAD CHECK PRESSURE CP:0, SCP:0 PSI KEPT IT OPEN DURING DAILY OPS
	8:00 - 8:30	0.50	ABANDP	31	I	P		PU 23 JTS OF 2 3/8 TAG TOC @ 725', RU PUMP LINES
	8:30 - 9:30	1.00	ABANDP	55	G	P		SHUT WELL IN FOR 1 HR BUILT 0 PSI
	9:30 - 11:00	1.50	ABANDP	51	D	P		MIRU SLB PRESSURE TEST LINES TO 2500 PSI CALL 800 MAX PSI, PUMP STUB PLUG W,5BBL FRESH WATER, 100 SKS AGM BLEND 2% Calc & 12% Gyp 15.8 ppg, 1.23 cf/sk= 21.9 BBLs OF SLURRY DISPLACE 2 BBLs OF FRESH WATER RD SLB LET THEM WASH OUT EQUIPMENT
	11:00 - 12:00	1.00	ABANDP	31	I	P		LD 13 JTS TO 300',RU PUMP REVERSE CIRCULATE CLEAN W 80 BBL 3X HOLE VOLUME,TOH W REMAINING 10 JTS
	12:00 - 12:30	0.50	ABANDP	30	K	P		SECURE WELL & RIG TANKS CLEAN LOCATION
	12:30 - 13:30	1.00	ABANDP	30	I	P		WINTERIZE PUMP & LINES,CLEAN OUT MUD TANK W WATER TRUCK
	13:30 - 14:00	0.50	ABANDP	30	G	P		CT TO YARD
12/30/2020	5:30 - 6:00	0.50	ABANDP	30	G	P		CT TO LOCATION
	6:00 - 6:30	0.50	ABANDP	48	B	P		CREW CHANGED CLOTHES & HELD JSA SAFETY MEETING
	6:30 - 8:00	1.50	ABANDP	52	I	P		STARTED EQUIPMENT & WARM UP,UNTHAW WELL HEAD CHECK PRESSURE CP:0, SCP:0 PSI KEPT IT OPEN DURING DAILY OPS
	8:00 - 8:30	0.50	ABANDP	31	I	P		PU 21 JTS OF 2 3/8 TAG TOC @ 650', RU PUMP LINES
	8:30 - 12:00	3.50	ABANDP	55	G	P		WAIT ON CMT DUE TO TAGGING TOC TO DEEP
	12:00 - 13:30	1.50	ABANDP	51	D	P		MIRU HALLIBURTON CMT CREW, PRESSURE TEST LINES TO 2500 PSI CALL 800 MAX PSI, PUMP STUB PLUG W,5BBL OF H2O10 BBL MUD FLUSH,5 BBL H2O, 126 SKS AGM BLEND 1% Calc & 12% Gyp 15.8 ppg, 1.22 cf/sk= 27.4 BBLs OF SLURRY DISPLACE .8 BBLs OF FRESH WATER RD HALLIBURTON LET THEM WASH OUT EQUIPMENT
	13:30 - 15:00	1.50	ABANDP	31	I	P		LD 14 JTS TO 200',REVERSE CIRC 60 BBL 3X HOLE VOLUME,LD 7 REMAINING JTS
	15:00 - 15:30	0.50	ABANDP	30	K	P		SECURE WELL & RIG TANKS CLEAN LOCATION
	15:30 - 16:00	0.50	ABANDP	30	I	P		WINTERIZE PUMP & LINES,
	16:00 - 16:30	0.50	ABANDP	30	G	P		CT TO YARD
12/31/2020	5:30 - 6:00	0.50	ABANDP	30	G	P		CT TO LOCATION
	6:00 - 6:30	0.50	ABANDP	48	B	P		CREW CHANGED CLOTHES & HELD JSA SAFETY MEETING
	6:30 - 8:00	1.50	ABANDP	52	I	P		STARTED EQUIPMENT & WARM UP,UNTHAW WELL HEAD CHECK PRESSURE CP:0, SCP:0 PSI KEPT IT OPEN DURING DAILY OPS
	8:00 - 8:30	0.50	ABANDP	31	I	P		PU 19 JTS OF 2 3/8 TAG TOC @ 600', RU PUMP LINES
	8:30 - 13:00	4.50	ABANDP	46	E	P		TAGGED TOC TO DEEP,WAIT ON CMT CREW TO PUMP MORE CMT

US ROCKIES REGION
Operation Summary Report

Well: NEALE UPRR 32-15 #1		Spud date: 8/26/1986	
Project: COLORADO-WELD-NAD83-UTM13		Site: NEALE UPRR 32-15 #1	Rig name no.: ENSIGN WELL SERVICES/316
Event: ABANDONMENT		Start date: 12/11/2020	End date: 3/31/2021
Active datum: RKB @4,890.99usft (above Mean Sea Level)		UWI: 0/3/N/66/W/15/0/NESW/6/0/0/0/0/0/0/0	

Date	Time Start-End	Duration (hr)	Phase	Code	Sub Code	P/U	MD from (usft)	Operation
	13:00 - 14:30	1.50	ABANDP					MIRU SLB PRESSURE TEST LINES TO 2500 PSI CALL 800 MAX PSI, PUMP STUB PLUG W,15BBL CW, 86 SKS CLASS G,W LCM 14ppg, 1.55 cf/sk= 23.8 BBLs OF SLURRY DISPLACE 1 BBLs OF FRESH WATER RD SLB LET THEM WASH OUT EQUIPMENT
	14:30 - 16:00	1.50	ABANDP	31	I	P		LD 10 JTS TO 300',REVERSE CIRCULATE 50 BBL 3 X HOLE VOLUME,LD 9 REMAINING JTS
	16:00 - 16:30	0.50	ABANDP	30	K	P		SECURE WELL & RIG TANKS CLEAN LOCATION
	16:30 - 17:00	0.50	ABANDP	30	I	P		WINTERIZE PUMP & LINES,
	17:00 - 17:30	0.50	ABANDP	30	G	P		CT TO YARD
1/4/2021	5:30 - 6:00	0.50	ABANDP	30	G	P		CT TO LOCATION
	6:00 - 6:30	0.50	ABANDP	48	B	P		CREW CHANGED CLOTHES & HELD JSA SAFETY MEETING
	6:30 - 7:00	0.50	ABANDP	52	I	P		STARTED EQUIPMENT & WARM UP,CHECK PRESSURE CP:0, SCP:0 PSI KEPT IT OPEN DURING DAILY OPS
	7:00 - 8:00	1.00	ABANDP	31	I	P		PU 11 JTS OF 2 3/8 TAG TOC @ 334',LD 11 JTS, RU PUMP LINES,TEST TO 500 PSI FOR 15 MIN GOOD TEST
	8:00 - 9:30	1.50	ABANDP	30	J	P		RD RIG FLOOR,ND BOP,REMOVE 5K SURFACE HEAD,PU ALL PUMP LINES
	9:30 - 10:30	1.00	ABANDP	30	C	P		RD MO ENSIGN 316',PU AROUND LOCATION
	10:30 - 11:30	1.00	ABANDP	30	G	P		ROAD RIG TO NEW LOCATION
3/30/2021	8:00 - 9:00	1.00	ABANDZ	53	B	P		DUG UP SURFACE CASING
	9:00 - 10:00	1.00	ABANDZ	53	C	P		CUT CASING 6' BELOW GL, 8 5/8 CEMENT AT 60 FEET, FILLED CASING STUB WITH 38 BAGS OF 5000 PSI CEMENT.
	10:00 - 11:00	1.00	ABANDZ	53	A	P		CAPPED CASING WITH A METAL PLATE CONTAINING WELL INFO
	11:00 - 12:00	1.00	ABANDZ	53	B	P		BACKFILLED
	12:00 - 12:00	0.00	ABANDZ	53	F	P		PLACED MARKER BALL
3/31/2021	11:00 - 11:00	0.00	ABANDP	50				P&A'd OFFLINE. NB-CD.