

US ROCKIES REGION
Operation Summary Report

Well: HSR-BARR 1-16A		Spud date: 8/3/1992	
Project: COLORADO-WELD-NAD83-UTM13		Site: HSR-BARR 1-16A	
Event: CONST- CAP WELL WORK		Rig name no.: PIONEER 30/30	
Active datum: RKB @4,777.99usft (above Mean Sea Level)		UWI: 0/3/N/67/W/16/0/NENE/6/0/0/0/0/0/0/0	
Start date: 9/23/2019		End date:	

Date	Time Start-End	Duration (hr)	Phase	Code	Sub Code	P/U	MD from (usft)	Operation
9/18/2019	6:00 - 12:00	6.00	LOCPRP	53	B	P		LONE TREE REMOVED CATTLE PANELS 10/1/19
	12:00 - 14:00	2.00	LOCPRP	53	B	P		LONE TREE SERVICE MOWED AND INSTALLED STRING FENCED LOCATION FOR UP COMING RIG OPS.
9/20/2019	-							
9/23/2019	14:30 - 15:30	1.00	WO/REP	30	G	P		ROAD RIG TO LOCATION.
	15:30 - 16:30	1.00	WO/REP	30	A	P		SPOT PIONEER 30 IN ON LOCATION.
	16:30 - 17:30	1.00	WO/REP	30	G	P		CREW TRAVEL TO YARD.
9/24/2019	5:30 - 6:30	1.00	WO/REP	30	G	P		CREW TRAVEL TO LOCATION.
	6:30 - 10:00	3.50	WO/REP	46	F	P		WAIT ON WSS TO GET TO LOCATION MONTHLY SFETY MEETING.
	10:00 - 10:30	0.50	WO/REP	48	B	P		TBG/678#,CSG/0#,SCSG/31#. START RIG,JSA SEE SAFETY TAB. TALKED ABOUT FLUID MANAGEMENT & ARRIVING TO LOCATION BLEEDING OFF WELL HEAD PRESURE.
	10:30 - 10:35	0.08	WO/REP	52	I	P		SCSG/31# BLEW DOWN LEFT OPEN FOR DAY DID NOT PRODUCE ANYTHING SHUT IN AT END OF DAY.
	10:35 - 12:30	1.92	WO/REP	30	A	P		RU PIONEER 30 FACING SOUTH 100' SPACING WEATHER SUNNY GROUND DRY LITTLE MUDDY OFF WEST SIDE OF LOCATION. PANELS UP AROUND RIG.
	12:30 - 13:00	0.50	WO/REP	52	G	P		LOAD LINES W/ WATER/BIO PSI TEST TO 2000psi FOR 15min GOOD TEST.
	13:00 - 14:30	1.50	WO/REP	30	E	P		TBG/678#,CSG/0#(PACKER IN HOLE),SCSG/31#.BLOW WELL DOWN TO GAS RIG GAS BUSTER TO 20#.RU PUMP & PUMP 39bbl's DOWN TBG WENT ON VAC. PACKER IN HOLE CANT PUMP ON CSG.
	14:30 - 17:30	3.00	WO/REP	52	G	P		MIRU HOLE SEEKERS TESTING TEST 1st 2 3/8" TIW VALVE LOWSIDE TO 250psi FOR 5min. TEST HIGH SIDE TO 5000psi FOR 15min GOOD TEST. TEST 2nd TIW VALVEOWSIDE TO 250psi FOR 5min. TEST HIGH SIDE TO 5000psi FOR 15min GOOD TEST. LOAD BOP'S ON STUMP TIGHTEN BOLTS,LOAD BOP'S SHUT BLIND RAMS TEST LOW SIDE TO 250psi FOR 5min GOOD TEST. TEST HIGH SIDE TO 5000psi FOR 15min GOOD TEST ND WH NU NEW R46 RING GASKET & BOP'S ONTO WH STAB 2 3/8" SUB WITH TIW VALVE TORQUE WH BOLTS LOAD BOPS W/ FLUID,SHUT PIPE RAMS TEST BOP'S & RING GASKET TO LOW SIDE TO 250psi FOR 5min GOOD TEST. TEST HIGH SIDE TO 5000psi FOR 15min GOOD TEST.RDMO HOLE SEEKERS TESTING. SWI, LOCK BOP'S,NIGHT CAP ALL VALVES.SDFN.
	17:30 - 18:30	1.00	WO/REP	30	G	P		CREW TRAVEL TO YARD.
	9/25/2019	5:30 - 6:30	1.00	WO/REP	30	G	P	
6:30 - 7:00		0.50	WO/REP	48	B	P		TBG/0#,CSG/0#,SCSG/19#.START RIG.JSA SEE SAFETY TAB.
	7:00 - 7:05	0.08	WO/REP	52	I	P		SCSG/19# LEFT OPEN FOR DAY DID NOT PRODUCE ANYTHING SHUT IN AT END OF DAY.

US ROCKIES REGION
Operation Summary Report

Well: HSR-BARR 1-16A

Spud date: 8/3/1992

Project: COLORADO-WELD-NAD83-UTM13

Site: HSR-BARR 1-16A

Rig name no.: PIONEER 30/30

Event: CONST- CAP WELL WORK

Start date: 9/23/2019

End date:

Active datum: RKB @4,777.99usft (above Mean Sea Level)

UWI: 0/3/N/67/W/16/0/NENE/6/0/0/0/0/0/0/0

Date	Time Start-End	Duration (hr)	Phase	Code	Sub Code	P/U	MD from (usft)	Operation
	7:05 - 8:30	1.42	WO/REP	31	O	P		RIG DOWN FLOOR & GET TONGS READY.PUMP 8bbL's DOWN TBG PRESSURED UP. RELEASE PACKER.WAIT 10min NO MOVEMENT OF FLUID
	8:00 - 10:30	2.50	WO/REP	31	I	P		TOOH TALLYING SB 212jnt's IN DERRICK LD 1jnt & PACKER.TOOH 1 STAND/min TRICKLE 4bbL's WATER DOWN BACKSIDE WHILE TOOH NO GAS PRESENT WELL DEAD.
	10:30 - 12:30	2.00	WO/REP	31	I	P		PU 3 7/8" BIT & 4.5" SCRAPER TIH IN HOLE OUT OF DERRICK TO 7135' W/ 225jnt's 2.375" TBG WORK TBG.TRICKLE 24.5 WATER IN 1st GEAR DOWN BACKSIDE NO GAS WELL DEAD.BOP DRILL 1min SECURE WELL KILL RIG & PUMP MEET AT DOGHOUSE.
	12:30 - 14:30	2.00	WO/REP	31	I	P		TOOH SB 208jnt's 2.375" TBG IN DERRICK LD 17jnt's ON TRAILER.TRICKLE 14bbL's DOWN BACK SIDE WHILE TOOH.SWI LOCK BOP'S NIGHT CAP ALL VALVES.SDFN.
	14:30 - 15:30	1.00	WO/REP	30	G	P		CREW TRAVEL TO YARD.
9/26/2019	5:30 - 6:30	1.00	WO/REP	30	G	P		CREW TRAVEL TO LOCATION.
	6:30 - 7:00	0.50	WO/REP	48	B	P		CSG/0#,SCSG19#.START RIG.JSA SEE SAFETY TAB.
	7:00 - 7:05	0.08	WO/REP	52	I	P		SCSG/19# BLEW DOWN QUICK LEFT OPEN FOR DAY DID NOT PRODUCE ANYTHING SHUT IN AT END OF DAY.
	7:05 - 8:30	1.42	WO/REP	34	I	P		MIRU C&J WL, RU PACK OFF, RU 4-1/2" CIBP SETTING TOOL, RIH & SET CIBP @7125',PUH STACK BACK DOWN VERIFY CIBP SET. POOH.
	8:30 - 9:00	0.50	WO/REP	34	D	P		RU PACK OFF & DUMP BAILER RIH DUMP BAIL 2sx CEMENT ON CIBP @7125',POOH.
	9:00 - 9:30	0.50	WO/REP	34	I	P		RU PACK OFF, RU 4-1/2" CIBP SETTING TOOL, RIH & SET CIBP @ 6725',PUH STACK BACK DOWN VERIFY CIBP SET. POOH.
	9:30 - 10:00	0.50	WO/REP	34	D	P		RU PACK OFF & DUMP BAILER RIH DUMP BAIL 2sx CEMENT ON CIBP @ 6725',POOH.
	10:30 - 12:00	1.50	WO/REP	31	I	P		PU XN NIPPLE TIH OUT OF DERRICK LAND TBG @6609'kb W/ 208jnt's 2.375" J-55 4.7# TBG..
	12:00 - 13:00	1.00	WO/REP	31	H	P		RU PUMP ESTABLISH REVERSE CIRCULATION.CIRCULATE GAS OUT OF WELL 2bbL's/min.SD PUMP.
	13:00 - 14:00	1.00	WO/REP	52	G	P		RU CRYSTAL GAUGE PRE MIT TEST CSG TO 350psi FOR 15MIN GOOD TEST, CALL CARSON GOOD TO GO .SWI LOCK BOP'S.NIGHT CAP ALL VALVES.SDFN.
	14:00 - 15:00	1.00	WO/REP	30	G	P		CREW TRAVEL TO YARD.
9/27/2019	5:30 - 6:30	1.00	WO/REP	30	G	P		CREW TRAVEL TO LOCATION.
	6:30 - 7:00	0.50	WO/REP	48	B	P		TBG/330#,CSG/346#,SCSG/15#.START RIG.JSA SEE SAFETY TAB.
	7:00 - 7:05	0.08	WO/REP	52	I	P		SCSG/15# BLEW DOWN QUICK LEFT OPEN FOR DAY DID NOT PRODUCE ANYTHING.SHUT IN AT END OF DAY.

US ROCKIES REGION
Operation Summary Report

Well: HSR-BARR 1-16A		Spud date: 8/3/1992	
Project: COLORADO-WELD-NAD83-UTM13		Site: HSR-BARR 1-16A	Rig name no.: PIONEER 30/30
Event: CONST- CAP WELL WORK		Start date: 9/23/2019	End date:
Active datum: RKB @4,777.99usft (above Mean Sea Level)		UWI: 0/3/N/67/W/16/0/NENE/6/0/0/0/0/0/0/0	

Date	Time Start-End	Duration (hr)	Phase	Code	Sub Code	P/U	MD from (usft)	Operation
	7:05 - 9:00	1.92	WO/REP	54	C	P		TBG/330#,CSG/346#,SCSG/15#.BLEW DOWN QUICK.CHANGE OUT 5k CSG VALVES MIRU HOLE SEEKERS MIT TEST WELL ON 1000psi CHART GOOD TEST APPROVED BY JOSH & HALEY.RD TESTER.CRAIG LIPPITT ON LOCATION FOR TEST
	9:00 - 12:30	3.50	WO/REP	35	D	P		MIRU WELLS WHISPER RIH W/ 2 3/8" TBG STACK OUT PUSHING SOMETHING 3500' TO 4600'.CALL JAY RUN JUNK BASKET TO 6600' POOH NOTHING IN BASKET.CALL JAY RUN BROACH TO 6500.POOH RDMO WELLS WHISPER.
	12:30 - 15:30	3.00	WO/REP	30	J	P		PUT NEW O-RINGS ON LANDING DONUT W/ GREASE,LAND TBG IN TBG HANGER.ND BOP'S NU DOUBLE MASTER VALVE COMPANION FLANGES. CHANGE OUT PACKING ON LOCK DOWN PIN& PINS. PIN THREADS WERE MEST UP HAD TO GET TAP FORM NATE NAILL & RE-TAP HOLES.
	15:30 - 17:30	2.00	WO/REP	52	G	P		MIRU HOLE SEEKERS TESTERS PU BAR. RU UP SUB ON-TOP OF MASTER VALVE PSI TEST WH THROUGH MASTER VALVES PSI TEST HIGH SIDE TO 5000psi FOR 15MIN GOOD TEST.RDMO HOLE SEEKERS.PLUG ALL VALVES SWI HANG SIGN ALL DOUBLE VALVED.CANT TEST TO 250psi TESTER'S TOOL WILL NOT WORK THAT LOW
	17:30 - 18:30	1.00	WO/REP	30	C	P		RDMO PIONEER 30.SDFN.
	18:30 - 19:30	1.00	WO/REP	30	G	P		CREW TRAVEL TO YARD.