

US ROCKIES REGION
Operation Summary Report

Well: SASAKI 1-18A

Spud date: 3/14/2003

Project: COLORADO-WELD-NAD83-UTM13

Site: SASAKI 17-18 PAD

Rig name no.: BASIC 1524/1524

Event: ABANDONMENT

Start date: 9/8/2017

End date: 10/6/2017

Active datum: RKB @4,931.99usft (above Mean Sea Level)

UWI: 0/1/N/66/W/18/0/NESW/6/0/N/1334/E/0/1830/0/0

Date	Time Start-End	Duration (hr)	Phase	Code	Sub Code	P/U	MD from (usft)	Operation
11/16/2016	11:00 - 12:00	1.00	ABANDP	53	B	P		FORM 17 TEST
8/25/2017	7:00 - 8:00	1.00	ABANDP	53	B	P		FORM 17 TEST
8/31/2017	-							
9/8/2017	10:00 - 13:00	3.00	ABANDP	30	A	P		MOVE RIG AND EQUIPMENT TO LOCATION, RIG UP RIG AND EQUIPMENT
	13:00 - 14:00	1.00	ABANDP	30	E	P		SICP - 750 PSI SITP - 750 PSI OPEN BRADENHEAD, HAD LITE WATER FLOW BUT NO PRESSURE BLOW DOWN SICP/SITP, KILL WITH 25 BBLS OF BIO WATER DOWN TBNG, 25 BBLS DOWN CSNG
	14:00 - 15:00	1.00	ABANDP	30	F	P		NIPPLE DOWN WELLHEAD, NIPPLE UP AND FUNCTION TEST 7"5K BOP DRESSED WITH 2 3/8" PIPE RAMS
	15:00 - 17:30	2.50	ABANDP	31	I	P		TOOH TALLYING 2 3/8" TBNG, 118 STANDS, LAY DOWN 21 JTS 257 JTS TOTAL 1.78" PROFILE NIPPLE W/ MULE SHOE
	17:30 - 18:00	0.50	ABANDP	30	G	P		SHUT IN WELL, SDFWE, CREW TRAVEL
9/11/2017	6:00 - 7:00	1.00	ABANDP	30	G	P		CREW TRAVEL TO LOCATION, HOLD PJSM. DISCUSS HAZARDS ASSOCIATED WITH DAYS EVENTS
	7:00 - 7:30	0.50	ABANDP	30	E	P		450 PSI SICP 0 PSI ON BRADENHEAD LEFT OPEN FOR DAY BLOW DOWN 450 PSI SICP, KILL WELL WITH 10 BBLS
	7:30 - 11:00	3.50	ABANDP	34	I	P		MIRU RELIANCE WIRELINE RIH TO 8090' WITH 3.75" GUAGE RING SET 4 1/2" CIBP @8085' DUMP 2 SKS CEMENT ON CIBP SET CIBP @7410' RDMO WIRELINE
	11:00 - 12:00	1.00	ABANDP	31	I	P		TIH WITH 118 STANDS OF 2 3/8" TBNG TO CIBP @7410' LAY DOWN TAG JT, EOT @7408'
	12:00 - 13:00	1.00	ABANDP	52	G	P		LOAD HOLE WITH 77 BBLS OF FRESH WATER TREATED WITH BIOCID, CIRC TO CONDITION WELL, PRESSURE TEST 4 1/2" CASING TO 1000 PSI HELD TEST FOR 15 MINUTES. TEST WAS GOOD
	13:00 - 13:30	0.50	ABANDP	51	D	P		MIRU SCHLUMBERGER, HOLD PJSM. DISCUSS HIGH PRESSURE LINES AND CEMENT HAZARDS, EMERGENCY CONTACTS. PUMP 5 BBL FRESH WATER SPACER, PRESS TEST PUMPS & LINES TO 2000 PSI, MIX AND PUMP 10.9 BBLS (40SKS) OF 15.8# 1.53 YIELD CEMENT, DISPLACE WITH 25 BBLS OF FRESH WATER
	13:30 - 16:30	3.00	ABANDP	31	I	P		TOC @6707' RDMO CEMENTERS TOOH, STAND BACK 25 STANDS (1581') OF 2 3/8" TBNG, LAY DOWN REMAINING 185 JTS. (207 TOTAL ON FLOAT)
	16:30 - 17:00	0.50	ABANDP	30	G	P		SHUT IN WELL, SDFN CREW TRAVEL
9/12/2017	6:00 - 7:00	1.00	ABANDP	30	G	P		CREW TRAVEL TO LOCATION, HOLD PJSM. DISCUSSED THREE POINTS OF CONTACT ON STAIRS TO AVOID SLIPS TRIPPS AND FALLS

US ROCKIES REGION
Operation Summary Report

Well: SASAKI 1-18A

Spud date: 3/14/2003

Project: COLORADO-WELD-NAD83-UTM13

Site: SASAKI 17-18 PAD

Rig name no.: BASIC 1524/1524

Event: ABANDONMENT

Start date: 9/8/2017

End date: 10/6/2017

Active datum: RKB @4,931.99usft (above Mean Sea Level)

UWI: 0/1/N/66/W/18/0/NESW/6/0/N/1334/E/0/1830/0/0

Date	Time Start-End	Duration (hr)	Phase	Code	Sub Code	P/U	MD from (usft)	Operation
	7:00 - 8:30	1.50	ABANDP	34	I	P		MIRU RELIANCE WIRELINE RIH AND SET 4 1/2" CIBP @4505' DUMP 2 SKS CEMENT ON CIBP
	8:30 - 9:00	0.50	ABANDP	34	L	P		JET CUT 4 1/2" CASING @1465'. BREAK CIRCULATION TO CONFIRM CUT. RDMO WIRELINE
	9:00 - 10:00	1.00	ABANDP	31	H	P		CIRCULATE WITH BIO WATER TO CONDITION WELL
	10:00 - 11:00	1.00	ABANDP	30	F	P		NIPPLE DOWN BOP AND WELLHEAD, PICK UP ON 4 1/2" CASING WITH CASING SPEAR
								STRIP BOP OVER CSNG, NIPPLE UP AND FUNCTION TEST 7" 5K BOP DRESSED WITH 4 1/2" PIPE RAMS
	11:00 - 11:30	0.50	ABANDP	31	I	P		LAY DOWN 35 JTS (1465') OF 4 1/2" 11.6# L-80 CASING
	11:30 - 12:00	0.50	ABANDP	31	I	P		REMOVE 4 1/2" RAMS, INSTALL 2 3/8" RAMS, FUNCTION TEST BOP RIG UP FOR 2 3/8" TBNG
	12:00 - 12:30	0.50	ABANDP	31	I	P		TIH WITH 2 3/8" MULE SHOE ON 2 3/8" TBNG TO 1581' 116' INSIDE 4 1/2" CUT OFF
	12:30 - 13:00	0.50	ABANDP	31	H	P		CIRCULATE WITH BIO WATER TO CONDITION WELL. NO SIGNS OF GAS
	13:00 - 14:30	1.50	ABANDP	51	D	P		MIRU SCHLUMBERGER, HOLD PJSM DISCUSS JOB HAZARDS AND EMERGENCY CONTACTS. PUMP 15 BBL SMS, PUMP 5 BBL FRESH WATER SPACER, PRESS TEST PUMPS & LINES TO 2000 PSI MIX AND PUMP 76.6 BBLs (288 SKS) OF 15.8# 1.5 YIELD CEMENT DISPLACE WITH 2.8 BBLs OF FRESH WATER. RDMO CEMENTERS
	14:30 - 15:30	1.00	ABANDP	31	I	P		STANDS BACK 12 STANDS OF 2 3/8" TBNG LAY DOWN 23 JTS. REVERSE CIRCULATE FROM 90' TO CLEAN TBNG. LAY DOWN 3 REMAINING JTS 233 TOTAL ON FLOAT
	15:30 - 16:00	0.50	ABANDP	30	G	P		SHUT IN WELL SDFN, CREW TRAVEL
9/13/2017	6:00 - 7:00	1.00	ABANDP	30	G	P		CREW TRAVEL TO LOCATION, HOLD PJSM DISCUSS OVERHEAD HAZARDS AND PPE
	7:00 - 8:00	1.00	ABANDP	31	I	P		TIH WITH 2 3/8" TBNG TAG CEMENT @449' LAY DOWN 24 JTS OF 2 3/8" 257 TOTAL (8097.78)
	8:00 - 8:30	0.50	ABANDP	30	J	P		NIPPLE DOWN BOP AND WELLHEAD
	8:30 - 9:00	0.50	ABANDP	34	I	P		MIRU RELIANCE WIRELINE RIH AND SET 8 5/8" CIBP @80' RDMO WIRELINE
	9:00 - 10:00	1.00	ABANDP	30	C	P		RIG DOWN PREP TO MOVE TO SASAKI KAY S 1 WELLHEAD
10/6/2017	6:00 - 7:00	1.00	ABANDP	52		P		PRESSURE TESTED CIBP, SURFACE CASING TO 500 PSI
	7:00 - 8:00	1.00	ABANDP	53	B	P		DUG UP SURFACE CASING
	8:00 - 9:00	1.00	ABANDP	53	C	P		CUT CASING 6' BELOW GL, TAGGED @ 78'
	9:00 - 10:00	1.00	ABANDP	53	B	P		FILLED CASING STUB WITH 38 BAGS 5000 PSI CEMENT
	10:00 - 11:00	1.00	ABANDP	53	A	P		CAPPED CASING WITH A METAL PLATE CONTAINING WELL INFO
	11:00 - 12:00	1.00	ABANDP	53	B	P		BACKFILLED
	11:00 - 11:00	0.00	ABANDP	53	F	P		DROPPED MARKER BALL
	12:00 - 12:00	0.00	ABANDP					
	10:00 - 10:00	0.00	ABANDP	50		P		P&A'd OFFLINE. JSND.