

US ROCKIES REGION
Operation Summary Report

US ROCKIES REGION								
Operation Summary Report								
Well: SCOTTSDALE RANCH 2-11L				Spud date: 8/16/1993				
Project: COLORADO-WELD-NAD83-UTM13			Site: SCOTTDALE RANCH 02-11L			Rig name no.: BASIC 1652/1652		
Event: ABANDONMENT			Start date: 1/27/2017		End date: 2/17/2017			
Active datum: RKB @4,771.99usft (above Mean Sea Level)			UWI: NE/SW/0/3/N/67/W/2/0/0/6/PRIME/S/1,989.00/W/0/0/0/0					
Date	Time Start-End	Duration (hr)	Phase	Code	Sub Code	P/U	MD from (usft)	Operation
1/25/2017	15:00 - 17:00	2.00	ABANDP	53	B	P		FORM 17 TEST AND GAS SAMPLE
1/26/2017	-							
1/27/2017	6:00 - 7:00	1.00	ABANDP	30	G	P		CREW TRAVEL TO LOCATION, HELD A SAFETY MEETING.
	6:00 - 9:00	3.00	ABANDP	35	E	P		SUMMIT SLICKLINE AND VES PERFORM A GYRO RUN TO 7100' MAKING STOPS EVERY 100' ROAD RIG AND EQUIPMENT TO LOCATION
	7:00 - 8:00	1.00	ABANDP	30	A	P		R/U RIG PUMP AND LINES TO WELLHEAD
	8:00 - 9:30	1.50	ABANDP	30	A	P		TP-250, CP-250, SCP-0 PSI, BLOW DOWN WELL TO WORK TANK, CONTROL WELL W/20/20 BBLS OF FRESH/BIO WATER.
	9:30 - 10:30	1.00	ABANDP	30	E	P		N/D PROD/TREE, N/U BOP AND TBG EQUIPMENT.
	10:30 - 11:00	0.50	ABANDP	30	F	P		TALLY TOOH W/ 238JTS "SHORT STANDS"
	11:00 - 13:30	2.50	ABANDP	31	I	P		TIH W/CSG SCRAPER FROM DOWNHOLE TOOLS TO 7130' W/ 238JTS.
	13:30 - 15:30	2.00	ABANDP	31	I	P		TOOH, SWI, DRAIN EQUIPMENT, SDFWE.
	15:30 - 17:30	2.00	ABANDP	31	I	P		CREW TRAVEL.
	17:30 - 18:30	1.00	ABANDP	30	G	P		CREW TRAVEL TO LOCATION, HELD A SAFETY MEETING
1/30/2017	6:00 - 7:00	1.00	ABANDP	30	G	P		MIRU PIONEER WIRELINE, RIH AND SET CIBP @7110', POOH, RDMO
	7:00 - 8:30	1.50	ABANDP	34	I	P		MIRU ANYTIME TESTING AND HYDRO TEST IN HOLE 237 JTS TO 3000 PSI TO PUT EOT @ 7100', RDMO TESTER.
	8:30 - 11:00	2.50	ABANDP	31	I	P		R/U CIRCULATING EQUIPMENT AND ROLL GAS OUT THEN PRESSURE TEST CIBP TO 1000 PSI, R/D CIRCULATING EQUIPMENT.
	11:00 - 12:00	1.00	ABANDP	31	H	P		MIRU SCHLUMBERGER TO MIX AND PUMP 40 SKS "10.8 BBLS" OF CEMENT MIX @15.8# AND 1.53 YIELD AND DISPLACE IT WITH 24 BBLS OF FRESH WATER, RDMO CEMENT CREW.
	12:00 - 13:30	1.50	ABANDP	51	D	P		POOH AND STAND BACK 65 STANDS "130 JTS" AND L/D REST OF TBG ON TRAILER.
	13:30 - 15:30	2.00	ABANDP	31	I	P		MIRU PIONEER WIRELINE TO RIH AND SHOOT 2' X 3 SPF SQUEEZE HOLES @4300' AND A 4' X 3 SPF @ 3890', POOH, RDMO WIRELINE, SWI, SDFN.
	15:30 - 17:00	1.50	ABANDP	34	H	P		CREW TRAVEL
1/31/2017	6:00 - 7:00	1.00	ABANDP	30	G	P		CREW TRAVEL TO LOCATION, HELD A SAFETY MEETING.
	7:00 - 8:30	1.50	ABANDP	31	I	P		WARM UP EQUIPMENT, TIH WITH CICR AND SET IT @ 3920' W/130JTS AND 1-10' SUB.
	8:30 - 9:30	1.00	ABANDP	31	H	P		R/U CIRCULATING EQUIPMENT, ESTABLISH CIRCULATION AND ROLL GAS OUT AND HEAVY MUD, R/D CIRCULATING EQUIPMENT.
	9:30 - 11:30	2.00	ABANDP	51	D	P		MIRU SCHLUMBERGER TO MIX AND PUMP 5 BBLS OF FRESH, 10 BBLS OF SMS, 5 BBLS OF FRESH, 234 SKS @15.8# AND 1.51 YIELD "61.4 BBLS" CEMENT, DISPLACE IT WITH 12.2 BBLS OF FRESH, RDMO CEMENTERS.

US ROCKIES REGION
Operation Summary Report

Well: SCOTTSDALE RANCH 2-11L		Spud date: 8/16/1993	
Project: COLORADO-WELD-NAD83-UTM13		Site: SCOTTSDALE RANCH 02-11L	Rig name no.: BASIC 1652/1652
Event: ABANDONMENT		Start date: 1/27/2017	End date: 2/17/2017
Active datum: RKB @4,771.99usft (above Mean Sea Level)		UWI: NE/SW/0/3/N/67/W/2/0/0/6/PRIME/S/1,989.00/W/0/0/0/0	

Date	Time Start-End	Duration (hr)	Phase	Code	Sub Code	P/U	MD from (usft)	Operation
	11:30 - 12:30	1.00	ABANDP	31	I	P		POOH TO 3230' AND REVERCE OUT CIRCULATION, STAND BACK 16 STANDS, "32JTS" AND L/D REST OF TBG.
	12:30 - 13:30	1.00	ABANDP	34	M	P		MIRU PIONEER WIRELINE TO RIH AND JET CUT CSG @ 860', POOH, RDMO.
	13:30 - 14:30	1.00	ABANDP	31	H	P		R/U CIRCULATING EQUIPMENT AND ROLL GAS OUT AND HEAVY MUD, R/D CIRCULATING EQUIPMENT.
	14:30 - 15:15	0.75	ABANDP	31	1	P		N/D BOP AND TBG HEAD, UN LAND CSG W/ CSG SPEAR, N/U 4.5 EQUIPMENT.
	15:15 - 17:00	1.75	ABANDP	31	I	P		L/D 20 JTS OF 4.5 CSG ON TOP OF TBG TRAILER, C/O EQUIPMENT TO 2.375, TIH W/ 2.375 TBG TO 960' W/32 JTS, SWI, DRAIN EQUIPMENT, SDFN.
	17:00 - 18:00	1.00	ABANDP	30	G	P		CREW TRAVEL.
2/1/2017	6:00 - 7:00	1.00	ABANDP	30	G	P		CREW TRAVEL TO LOCATION, HELD A SAFETY MEETING.
	7:00 - 10:00	3.00	ABANDP	51	D	P		ESTABLISH CIRCULATION WHOLE CEMENT CREW GETS READY, MIRU SCHLUMBERGER CEMENT CREW TO MIX AND PUMP 15 BBLs OF SMS, 58 BBLs "217SKS" OF 15.8# AND 1.50 YIELD CEMENT STUB PLUG, POOH TO 100' AND REVERSE OUT CIRCULATION, FINISH POOH.
	10:00 - 13:00	3.00	ABANDP	46	B	P		WOC TO SET, CLEAN OUT MUD TANK W/RIG PUMP AND BACK TRUCK, WHILE WAITING.
	13:00 - 14:00	1.00	ABANDP	34	I	P		MIRU PIONEER WIRELINE TO RIH AND TAG CEMENT @ 180', POOH, RIH AND SET CIBP @ 80', POOH, RDMO WIRELINE
	14:00 - 15:30	1.50	ABANDP	30	C	P		R/D RIG PUMP AND LINES, PULL OFF WELL, DRAIN EQUIPMENT, HEAD, SDFN.
2/17/2017	8:00 - 9:00	1.00	ABANDP	53		P		PRESSURE TEST CIBP/CSG TO 500 PSI/15 MIN - GOOD TEST.
	9:00 - 10:00	1.00	ABANDP	53		P		DIG UP AROUND SURFACE CSG.
	10:00 - 11:00	1.00	ABANDP	53		P		CUT OFF CSG 6' BELOW GL. TAG INSIDE CSG AT 72'.
	11:00 - 12:00	1.00	ABANDP	53		P		FILL CSG W/ 40 SX 5000 PSI CMT.
	12:00 - 13:00	1.00	ABANDP	53	A	P		CAP WELL W/ METAL PLATE W/ WELL INFO.
	13:00 - 14:00	1.00	ABANDP	53		P		BACKFILL HOLE AND LEVEL SURFACE. CLEAN UP AREA & RDMO.
	12:30 - 12:30	0.00	ABANDP	50		P		P&A'd OFFLINE. CODL.