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STATE OF

COLORADO Lujan - DNR, Carlos <carlos.lujan@state.co.us>

Re: Complaint #200439545 filed 5/16/2016 Spraying Damage

1 message

George Pearson <geopear@uwillowwisp.net> Wed, Jun 1, 2016 at 11:51 AM
To: "Lujan - DNR, Carlos" <carlos.lujan@state.co.us>

Carlos,

Well surprise, surprise, they did have someone spraying and that would be the date range
because it was just before we left on vacation. Weed mitigation my ass it was pure and
simple kill everything that is growing.

Thanks,
George Pearson

From: Lujan - DNR, Carlos

Sent: Wednesday, June 1, 2016 11:26 AM

To: George Pearson

Subject: Re: Complaint #200439545 filed 5/16/2016 Spraying Damage

George,

| have contacted Mustang asking for the name, description and MSDS information regarding the herbicide used
in your property.

According to Deb Lemon (Mustang Resources), Mustang contracted Ebbisen Environmental & Field Services to conduct
weed mitigation work in the Rulison area between April 9-12, 2016.

I'll keep you posted,
Thanks,
Carlos

Carlos Lujan, Ph.D.
Environmental Protection Specialist
Northwest Region
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On Wed, Jun 1, 2016 at 9:52 AM, George Pearson <geopear@willowwisp.net> wrote:
Carlos,

| have not received any response from Mustang, other than Chuck Dobie, per a phone
conversation on May 18,2016, stating how do | know it was them that sprayed and caused
the damage. As | explained to you, | have irrigation water for a short period of time (
days,) and | need to get that water on the field while it is available. | value that water at
$1000.00 per day in lost production to my crops. It has been sixteen days now that | could
have irrigated, but since | do not know what they sprayed, | can not risk the damage to my
fields. | want you to know my situation, so that you can ask Mustang to respond. The way
I look at it... a simple phone call would have given them the information on what was
spayed, when it was sprayed, and that a licensed contractor was responsible. But yet
again they continue to punish me for turning them in for damages. So | feel loss of use of
my irrigation water should be considered along with the clean up of the damaged area.

Thanks,
George Pearson
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