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EnviroScan ­ DNR, OGCC <dnr_ogcc.enviroscan@state.co.us>

Fwd: CM Prod Demand for Payment
1 message

Fischer ­ DNR, Alex <alex.fischer@state.co.us> Tue, Jul 14, 2015 at 8:56 AM
To: OGCC EnviroScan ­ DNR <dnr_ogcc.enviroscan@state.co.us>
Cc: Kris Neidel ­ DNR <kris.neidel@state.co.us>

Please upload the attached with the following information: 
 
Unique identifier (REM/Spill/NOAV #, etc.): REM 7058, Pit Facility IDs: 112265,
112266, 112267, 112268, and 112269.
Document number (leave blank if one needs to be assigned):
Date received: June 26, 2015
Is data entry needed (Y/N): N
Notes: June 26, 2015 CM Prod Demand for Payment
 
Thanks! 

­­­­­­­­­­ Forwarded message ­­­­­­­­­­
From: Britta K. Beckstead <Britta.K.Beckstead@state.co.us>
Date: Fri, Jun 26, 2015 at 4:15 PM
Subject: RE: CM Prod Demand for Payment
To: Matt Lepore ­ DNR <matt.lepore@state.co.us>
Cc: Jake Matter <Jake.Matter@state.co.us>, Julie Murphy ­ DNR <julie.murphy@state.co.us>, Peter Gowen ­
DNR <peter.gowen@state.co.us>, Alex Fischer <alex.fischer@state.co.us>

See below. Only person in the office was an accountant, but he is listed as a designated agent/representative of
the operator in COGIS (See attached) – so likely qualifies under CRCP 4e(4). An official affidavit of service from
the company will be ready Monday or Tuesday.

 

From: Checkmate Inc. 
Sent: Friday, June 26, 2015 4:03 PM
To: 'Linda Miller'
Subject: RE: CM Prod Demand for Payment

 

06/26/15 at 3:53 PM – Serve CM Production LLC, by serving Adam Gallegos, Production Accountant.  He was
the only person in the office. 

 

From: Matt Lepore ­ DNR [mailto:matt.lepore@state.co.us] 
Sent: Friday, June 26, 2015 2:13 PM
To: Britta K. Beckstead
Cc: Jake Matter; Julie Murphy ­ DNR; Peter Gowen ­ DNR; Alex Fischer
Subject: CM Prod Demand for Payment
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Britta:

 

The letter Demand for Payment to CM Productions is attached.  Please have it
served on CM Productions / Teff at the Union St. address in Lakewood today if
possible.

 

I intend to email the letter to Teff and the CCs later this afternoon, so would
appreciate knowing the status of the hand delivery as soon as possible.

 

Thank you,

 

Matt

 

Matthew J. Lepore

Director

 

P 303.894.2100 x5122 | F 303.894.2109 | C 720.245.5639

1120 Lincoln Street, Suite 801, Denver, CO 80203

matt.lepore@state.co.us | www.colorado.gov/cogcc

 

­­ 

 
Alex Fischer, P.G.

Environmental Supervisor, Western Colorado

 

 

tel:720.245.5639
http://www.colorado.gov/cogcc
tel:303.894.2109
tel:303.894.2100%20x5122
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P 303.894.2100 x5138 | F 303.894.2109 

1120 Lincoln Street, Suite 801, Denver, CO 80203

 |alex.fischer@state.co.us  www.colorado.gov/cogcc

2 attachments

Form 1 with Address.pdf
250K

Form 1A.pdf
336K
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