From: Dinkel, Mike [mailto:Mike.Dinkel@anadarko.com]
Sent: Wednesday, December 01, 2010 11:18 AM

To: Prince, Nancy

Cc: Chesson, Robert; Schneider, Paul ; Hamilton, Gregory
Subject: RE: And another

Correct, the remediation work completed the work for both remediation numbers. Both incidents were
managed and remediated as one.

From: Prince, Nancy [mailto:Nancy.Prince@state.co.us]
Sent: Tuesday, November 23, 2010 12:57 PM

To: Dinkel, Mike

Cc: Chesson, Robert

Subject: And another

Did the remediation done for #4394 also complete the work that was needed for #4407 in Boulder
County for 16-411-8?

If so, I'll make sure that the closure letter is scanned to both projects, and that both are closed out.

If not, what else is required?
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